
NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

BID ON  PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

CONTRACT PERIOD: SEPTEMBER 1, 2025 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2030

BOARD APPROVED ON JULY 22, 2025

Page 1 of 23



TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

Catalog Name Catalog Number/Year Percentage Discount off of Catalog
Blue Imp-Play Strong 2025 4%

Psagot 2025 4%
PlayMart-Nature of Early Play 2025 4%

Ground for Play 2025 5%
Ultra Play 2025 5%
Playtopia 2025 5%

Sports Play 2025 5%
ID Sculpture 2025 5%

No Bid No Bid No Bid
Play and Play Structures Website 5% (1)

Ultra Play Website 5% (1)
Big Toys Website 5% (1)

Free Notes Harmony Park Website 5% (1)
Sportsplay Website 5% (1)

Elephant Play 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Dynamo 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Adventurous Chils 2025 Web/Digital 5%
AAA State of Play 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Cemrock 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Everlast Climbing 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Jensen Swings 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Action Play Systems 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Forte Products 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Store.blissproducts.com 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Compac Water Play 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Dynacushion 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Superior Play 2025 Web/Digital 5%
ID Sculpture 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Snug Play 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Bliss Products and Services, Inc. -  Lithia Springs, GA Net Play USA 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Apollo Sunguard Systems, Inc. - Sarasota, FL

ITEM 1: PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT

360 Recreation LLC- Orlando, FL

BIDDERS:

Advanced Recreational Concepts, LLC- Melbourne, FL
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

Catalog Name Number Discount

www.bsnsports.com www.bsnsports.com 10%

No Bid No Bid No Bid

PlaygroundEquipment.com 2025 5%

BCI-Burke 01/2025 10%

Industrial Shadeports Current (2023,2024 & 2025) 5%

Kompan US Price List 2025 9%
Superior Play 2025 4%

SRPFX Themed 2025 4%
Childworks 2025 4%

Nature of Early Play 2025 4%
Freenotes Harmony Park 2025 4%

Pro Playgrounds 2025-2030 10%
Wisdom Playgrounds 2025-2030 10%

World Klass Playgrounds 2025-2030 10%
Superior Recreation 2025-2030 10%

8% from $0-$4,999 (3)
12% $5,000-$9,999 (3)

15% $10,000-$14,999 (3)
18% $15,000-$24,999 (3)

Website 20% $25,000-above (3)

Gametime 2025.00 10%+ (4)

Miracle Recreation Equipment 
Company

Legacy Construction Services Group LLC dba Pro Playground- Tallahassee, FL

Miller Recreation Equipment & Design, Inc. dba Miracle Recreation Equipment 
Company - Monett , MO

BIDDERS:

PlayCore Wisconsin, Inc. dba Gametime - Fort Payne, FL

ITEM 1: PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT

Creative Shade Solutions - Tarpon Springs, FL

BSN Sports, LLC- Farmers Branch, TX

Florida Recreational Products LLC - Lynn Haven, FL

Industrial Shadeports Inc. - Fort Lauderdale, FL

Kompan, Inc. - Austin, TX

Lanier Plans, Inc. DBA Korkat - Carrollton, GA

Dragon Recreation Services - Fort Myers, FL

Page 3 of 23

http://www.bsnsports.com/
http://www.bsnsports.com/


TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

Catalog Name Number Discount
Action Play Systems 3%

Playworld 5%
Berliner 3%
Cre8Play 3%

Exofit 5%
Trekfit 3%

Jambette 2025-2026 4%
Wisdom 2025 6%

World Klass Play 2025 4%
Play Ground Equipment.com 2025 6%

Landscape Structures, Inc. 2025 3%

Shade America, Inc. - St. Augustine, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid
Childworks 2025 5%

Grounds for Play 2025 5%
Indoor Play 2025 5%

Cre8play 2025 5%
GameTime 2025 5%

Jensen Swing 2025 5%
Superior Playgrounds 2025 5%

UltraPlay 2025 5%
Pole Padding- Custom 2025 5%

Sports Play 2025 5%
Henderson Recreation 2025 6% (14)

Child Works 2025 10% (14)
Action Play Systems 2025 10% (14)

Miracle Recreation Equipment Co. 2025 15% (3) (15)
Hags 2025 5% (3)

UPC Parks 2025 5% (3)
SoftPlay 2025 5% (3)

ITEM 1: PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT

Swartz Associates, Inc. - Naples, FL

Webuildfun, Inc. - Allen, TX

Playmore West, Inc.- Fort Myers, FL

Playspace Services- Melbourne, FL

Project Innovations Inc. - Tarpon Springs, FL

BIDDERS:

Southern Park and Play, LLC - Melbourne, FL

Rep Services, Inc. - Longwood, FL

No Bid- Installation only -See section 5.
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

Catalog Name Catalog Number/Year Percentage Discount off of Catalog

Ultra Play 2025 3.5%
Premier Polystell 2025 3.5%

Ultrasite 2025 5%
SRP/Webcoat 2025 5%

Frog Furnishings 2025 5%
Bison 2025 5%

NRS Bleachers 2025 5%

No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ultra Site Website 5% (1)

Frog Furnishings Website 5% (1)
Doty & Sons Website 5% (1)

Most Dependable Fountains Website 5% (1)
Murdock Fountains Website 5% (1)

Superior 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Webcoat 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Action Fit 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Bark Park 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Everlast Climbing 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Sportsfield Specialties 2025 Web/Digital 5%
National Rec. Systems 2025 Web/Digital 5%

GT Grandstands 2025 Web/Digital 5%
DERO 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Jaypro 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Athletic Connection 2025 Web/Digital 5%
King River Castings 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Store.blissproducts.com 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Stewart Tennis 2025 Web/Digital 5%

US Tennis 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Gared Sports 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Kay Park 2025 Web/Digital 5%
American Flagpole 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Umbrella Source 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Beacon Athletics 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Colorado Time Systems 2025 Web/Digital 5%Bliss Products and Services, Inc. -  Lithia Springs, GA

ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT

Apollo Sunguard Systems, Inc. - Sarasota, FL

Advanced Recreational Concepts, LLC- Melbourne, FL

BIDDERS:

360 Recreation LLC- Orlando, FL
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

Catalog Name Catalog Number/Year Percentage Discount off of Catalog
Spectrum Aquatics 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Electro-Mech 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Daktronics 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Greenfields Outdoors 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Jensen Swings 2025 Web/Digital 5%

LOLL 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Landscape Forms 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Qualite Lighting 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Recycle Plastic Factory 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Wausau Tile 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Dog On It Parks 2025 Web/Digital 5%

www.bsnsports.com www.bsnsports.com 10%

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid
Action Playsystems 01/2025 10%

Gared 01/2025 10%
Henderson 01/2025 10%

Industrial Shadeports Current (2023,2024 & 2025) 5%

Kompan US Price List 2025 4%
Superior Amenities 2025 4%

Paris 2025 4%
Frog Furnishings 2025 4%

Thomas Steele 2025 4%
Pro Playgrounds 2025-2030 10%

Wisdom Playgrounds 2025-2030 10%
World Klass Playgrounds 2025-2030 10%

Superior Recreation 2025-2030 10%

BIDDERS:
ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT

Legacy Construction Services Group LLC dba Pro Playground- Tallahassee, FL

Creative Shade Solutions - Tarpon Springs, FL

Dragon Recreation Services - Fort Myers, FL

Lanier Plans, Inc. DBA Korkat - Carrollton, GA

Bliss Products and Services, Inc. -  Lithia Springs, GA

BSN Sports, LLC- Farmers Branch, TX

Florida Recreational Products LLC - Lynn Haven, FL

Industrial Shadeports Inc. - Fort Lauderdale, FL

Kompan, Inc. - Austin, TX
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

Catalog Name Number Discount

Mircle Recreation Equipment Company Website 5%
Wabash valley Website 5%

GT Site (Amenities) 2025 3%

Wabash Vallet 3%
Premier Polysteel 3%

Webcoat 2025 4%
Wisdom 2025 4%

Playground Equipment.com 2025 4%
Markstarr 2025 4%

Anthem 2025 4%

DuMor Site Furnishings 2025 3%
Anova Furnishings 2025 3%

No Bid No Bid No Bid
Victor Stanley 2025 5%

Keystone Ridge 2025 5%
Thomas Steele 2025 5%

Commercial Zone 2025 5%
Anova 2025 5%

Pilot Rocks/RJ Thomas Manufacturing 2025 5%
UltraSite 2025 5%

Superior Amenities 2025 5%
Stem Williams 2025 5%

Barco Products/Kirby Built 2025 5%

BIDDERS:
ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT

Miller Recreation Equipment & Design, Inc. dba Miracle Recreation Equipment 
Company - Monett , MO

PlayCore Wisconsin, Inc. dba Gametime - Fort Payne, FL

Playspace Services- Melbourne, FL

Project Innovations Inc. - Tarpon Springs, FL

Southern Park and Play, LLC - Melbourne, FL

Playmore West, Inc.- Fort Myers, FL

Rep Services, Inc. - Longwood, FL

Shade America, Inc. - St. Augustine, FL 

No Bid- Installation only -See section 5.
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

Catalog Name Number Discount
First Team Sports 2025 8% (14)

Ultra Site 2025 8% (14)
My T Coat 2025 8% (14)

National Recreation Systems 2025 8% (14)
Site Scapes, Inc. 2025 5% (14)

Kay Park Recreation 2025 5% (14)
Frog Furnishings 2025 8% (14)

Ultra Site 2025 5% (3)
BardPark 2025 5% (3)
Action Fit 2025 5% (3)

Wabash Valley 2025 5% (3)
Thomas Steele/Madrax 2025 5% (3)

MyTCoat 2025 5% (3)
Bison 2025 5% (3)

Harmony Parks 2025 5% (3)
Greenfields Fitness 2025 5% (3)
Action Play Systems 2025 5% (3)

BIDDERS:
ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT

Webuildfun, Inc. - Allen, TX

Swartz Associates, Inc. - Naples, FL
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

Catalog Name Catalog Number/Year Percentage Discount off of Catalog

Shade System 2025 3.5%
Modern Shade 2025 3.5%

SRP Shade 2025 5%
USA Shade 2025 5%

Shade Systems 2025 5%
Cedar Forest Products 2025 5%

Apollo Sunguard 2024 5%
Modern Shade Website 5%
Superior Shade Website 5%
Shade America Website 5%

Cedar Forest Products Website 5%
Suncoast Buildings Website 5%

Superior Shade 2025 Web/Digital 5%
USA Shade 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Accent Awnings 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Americana Building 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Play and Park Structures 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Shade Systems 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Creative Shade 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Store.blissproducts.com 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Big Cypress Tiki Huts 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Hut World 2025 Web/Digital 5%

www.bsnsports.com www.bsnsports.com 10%
Fabric Shade Structures 01/2025 15%

Fabric Shade Sails 01/2025 10%
Steel Shade Structures 01/2025 10%

RCP Structures 2025.00 5%

Bliss Products and Services, Inc. -  Lithia Springs, GA

BSN Sports, LLC- Farmers Branch, TX

Apollo Sunguard Systems, Inc. - Sarasota, FL

Creative Shade Solutions - Tarpon Springs, FL

Dragon Recreation Services - Fort Myers, FL

ITEM 3: SHADE STRUCTURE

Advanced Recreational Concepts, LLC- Melbourne, FL

360 Recreation LLC- Orlando, FL

BIDDERS:
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

Catalog Name Number Discount

Shade Systems 01/2025 10%
BCI- Burke 01/2025 10%

Industrial Shadeports Current (2023,2024 & 2025) 5%

Shade Price List 2025 4%
Superior Shade 2025 4%
Superior Shelter 2025 4%
Enwood Shelter 2025 4%

Coverworx Shelter 2025 4%

Superior Shade 2025-2030 10%

USA Shade Website 5%

GT Shade 2025 3%
USA Shade 3%

Shade Systems 3%
Apollo Sunguard 3%

Americana 3%
Playworld Shade 3%

Pro Shade By Project Innovations 2025 4%

Skyways Shades 2025 3%
Poligon Fabric 2024 3%

No Bid- Installation only -See section 5.

Legacy Construction Services Group LLC dba Pro Playground- Tallahassee, FL

Miller Recreation Equipment & Design, Inc. dba Miracle Recreation Equipment 
Company - Monett , MO

Florida Recreational Products LLC - Lynn Haven, FL

PlayCore Wisconsin, Inc. dba Gametime - Fort Payne, FL

Project Innovations Inc. - Tarpon Springs, FL

BIDDERS:

Kompan, Inc. - Austin, TX

Lanier Plans, Inc. DBA Korkat - Carrollton, GA

Playmore West, Inc.- Fort Myers, FL

Playspace Services- Melbourne, FL

ITEM 3: SHADE STRUCTURE

Industrial Shadeports Inc. - Fort Lauderdale, FL

Rep Services, Inc. - Longwood, FL
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

Catalog Name Number Discount

Shade America 2025 5%
Superior Shade 2025 5%

Ultra Shade 2025 5%
EZ Up 2025 5%

Americana 2025 5%
Barco Products 2025 5%

Superior Shade 2025 6% (14)
Americana 2025 6% (14)

USA Shade 2025 5% (3)
Classic Recreation-Shelters 2025 5% (3)Webuildfun, Inc. - Allen, TX

Swartz Associates, Inc. - Naples, FL

BIDDERS:

Shade America, Inc. - St. Augustine, FL 

Southern Park and Play, LLC - Melbourne, FL

ITEM 3: SHADE STRUCTURE
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

Catalog Name Catalog Number/Year Percentage Discount off of Catalog
Artificial Grass AR Group-X Grass 5%

Playground Mulch-Imulch 2%
Pour in Place Rubber Fibar 2%

Sprint Play 2025 3%
Rubber Designs 2025 5%

Playspace Services 2025 5% or less
Poly Soft 2025 3%

Flexground 2025 3
Forever Lawn 2025 3

No Bid No Bid No Bid
Shady Surfacing Website 5% (1)

Foreverlawn 5% (1)
Safety First 5% (1)

X-Grass 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Zeager Bros 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Fibar 2025 Web/Digital 5%
East Coast Mulch 2025 Web/Digital 5%

IMC Outdoor 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Rubber Recycle 2025 Web/Digital 5%

OTS 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Surface Max 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Forestry Resources 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Express Mulch 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Choppers 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Store.blissproducts.com 2025 Web/Digital 5%

American Mulch 2025 Web/Digital 5%
Kemfer Sawmill 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Dura Play 2025 Web/Digital 5%
I Play 2025 Web/Digital 5%

Play Hard Recreation 2025 Web/Digital 5%

No Bid No Bid No BidBSN Sports, LLC- Farmers Branch, TX

ITEM 4: SURFACING MATERIALS

Apollo Sunguard Systems, Inc. - Sarasota, FL

Bliss Products and Services, Inc. -  Lithia Springs, GA

360 Recreation LLC- Orlando, FL

BIDDERS:

Advanced Recreational Concepts, LLC- Melbourne, FL
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

Catalog Name Number Discount

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid
Vitrituf 01/2025 5%

Sunshine Turf 01/2025 5%
Zrager 01/2025 5%

Industrial Shadeports Current (2023,2024 & 2025) 5%

Kompan Price List 2025 9%

Outdoor Safety Surfacing 2025.00 4%

Pro Playgrounds 2025-2030 10%

No Fault Surfacing Website 5%

GT Impax 2025 5% (6)
The Mulch and Soil Company 3%

Zeager 3%
DuraPlay 3%

Sunshine Turf 3%
The Recreational Group 3%

No Fault 3%
Foreverlawn 3%

Pro-techs 3%

Legacy Construction Services Group LLC dba Pro Playground- Tallahassee, FL

Miller Recreation Equipment & Design, Inc. dba Miracle Recreation Equipment 
Company - Monett , MO

Kompan, Inc. - Austin, TX

Florida Recreational Products LLC - Lynn Haven, FL

Dragon Recreation Services - Fort Myers, FL

Lanier Plans, Inc. DBA Korkat - Carrollton, GA

Industrial Shadeports Inc. - Fort Lauderdale, FL

ITEM 4: SURFACING MATERIALS
BIDDERS:

PlayCore Wisconsin, Inc. dba Gametime - Fort Payne, FL

Playmore West, Inc.- Fort Myers, FL

Creative Shade Solutions - Tarpon Springs, FL
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

Catalog Name Number Discount
Sprint Play 2025 3%

Rubber Design 2025 5%
Playspace Services 2025 5% or less

Poly Soft 2025 3%
Flexground 2025 3%

Forever lawn 2025 3%

2025 4%
IMulch N/A 3%

Forever Lawn 2024 3%
Tot Turf 2022 3%

No Fualt Sports Group 2022 3%
Safe4Play N/A 3%
Dura Play 2022.00 3%

No Bid No Bid No Bid
Superior Recreation 2025 5%

Ultra Play 2025 5%
IPEMA Mulch 2025 5%

Action Play Systems 2025 5%
Kompan 2025 5%

Forestry  Resources 2025 10% (14)
Cowart Mulch 2025 10% (14)
IMC Outdoor 2025 8% (14)

Synlawn 2025 5% (3)
Vitriturf 2025 5% (3)
No Fault 2025 5% (3)
DuraPlay 2025 5% (3)

Fibar 2025.00 5% (3)

Rep Services, Inc. - Longwood, FL

Webuildfun, Inc. - Allen, TX

Swartz Associates, Inc. - Naples, FL

Shade America, Inc. - St. Augustine, FL 

Southern Park and Play, LLC - Melbourne, FL

ITEM 4: SURFACING MATERIALS

Project Innovations Inc. - Tarpon Springs, FL

Playspace Services- Melbourne, FL

Kids Pro Surf Turf & Play Pad by 
Project Innovations Inc

BIDDERS:
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

Percentage Mark Up of Equipment Cost

25%
25%

37%
80%
80%
80%
80%

75% (1)
75% (1)
75% (1)
75% (1)
75% (1)

10%

75%
75%

65%
30%
30%
30%

85%
35-100%
35-100%
35-100%
35-100%
35-100%

Industrial Shadeports Inc. - Fort Lauderdale, FL

Safe 4 Play
IGS

BIDDERS:

Kompan, Inc. - Austin, TX HG Construction

Dragon Recreation Services - Fort Myers, FL Dragon Recreation Services

Industrial Shadeports
Precision

Florida Recreational Products, LLC

BSN Sports, LLC- Farmers Branch, TX

Apollo Sunguard Systems, Inc. - Sarasota, FL

Total Maintenance

Finns Playgrounds Installations

Sky Living

Florida Recreational Products LLC - Lynn Haven, FL

InMotion Recreation

ITEM 5: INSTALLATION OR SUBCONTRACTOR COMPANY NAME

Shady Surfacing

Playcore

Eddington Builds, LLC

Legakis Enterprises

Bliss Products
Safety First

Creative Shade Solutions
Creative Shade Solutions - Tarpon Springs, FL

Advanced Recreational Concepts, LLC- Melbourne, FL

Bliss Products and Services, Inc. -  Lithia Springs, GA

Complete Construction

Playspace Services
Home Builders, Inc.

PK, Inc.
Trinity Installation & Repairs

Installer/Subcontractor Name

Hurley Construction, Inc.
360 Recreation LLC- Orlando, FL
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

Percentage Mark up
35%
35%
90%
90%

35%

27%

35% (5)
40%
60%

150%
100%

37%
65%
65%
65%
65%
65%
85%
85%
85%

25%  (8)

No Bid

BIDDERS:

ITEM 5: INSTALLATION OR SUBCONTRACTOR COMPANY NAME

Installer/Sub Contractor Name

Legacy Construction Services Group LLC dba Pro Playground- Tallahassee, FL

Miller Recreation Equipment & Design, Inc. dba Miracle Recreation Equipment 
Company - Monett , MO

Korkat-Playgrounds

Korkat-Shade

Project Innovations Inc. - Tarpon Springs, FL River Cremasco

No Bid

Shade America, Inc. - St. Augustine, FL 

Noah Priest

Korkat-Amenities

Playspace Services- Melbourne, FL

PlayCore Wisconsin, Inc. dba Gametime - Fort Payne, FL

Ryan's Maintenance

Lanier Plans, Inc. DBA Korkat - Carrollton, GA Korkat-Shelter

Gametime Certified Installers

Pro Playground

Playspace Services (7)
Jason Donton

Rep Services, Inc. - Longwood, FL

Playmore West, Inc-Playground Equipment

Playmore West, Inc-Shade
Playmore West, Inc.- Fort Myers, FL Playmore West, Inc-Loose Fill Surfacing/Engineered Wood Fiber

Talon Gauthier
Ron Kramer

Playmore West, Inc-Site Furnishings

Shade America, Inc.

Southern Park and Play, LLC - Melbourne, FL

Johnny Pitts Construction
AI Bosgraaf and Sons, Inc.

DW Recreation Services, Inc.
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

Percentage Mark up
38% (11)
118% (12)
65% (13)

30%

BIDDERS:

ITEM 5: INSTALLATION OR SUBCONTRACTOR COMPANY NAME

Installer/Sub Contractor Name
Kennico, Inc. or

Ryan's MaintenanceWebuildfun, Inc. - Allen, TX

Swartz Associates, Inc. - Naples, FL Precision Playground
Jim's Complete Construction or
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

$85.00 $85.00

$600.00 $1,200.00

$175.00 $275.00

$300.00 plus mobilization fee $300.00 plus mobilization fee

No Bid No Bid

$175.00 (2) $250.00 (2)

$75.00 $90.00

$50.00 $100.00

$135.00 $200.00

$175.00 $225.00

$75.00 $112.50

$50.00 $75.00
Legacy Construction Services Group LLC dba Pro Playground- Tallahassee, FL

BIDDERS:

BSN Sports, LLC- Farmers Branch, TX

ITEM 7: REPAIR TECHNICIAN-
NON-STANDARD HOURLY 

RATE- PER HOUR

ITEM 6: REPAIR TECHNICIAN-
STANDARD HOURLY RATE- PER 

HOUR

Industrial Shadeports Inc. - Fort Lauderdale, FL

360 Recreation LLC- Orlando, FL

Florida Recreational Products LLC - Lynn Haven, FL

Advanced Recreational Concepts, LLC- Melbourne, FL

Apollo Sunguard Systems, Inc.-Sarasota , FL

Dragon Recreation Services - Fort Myers, FL

Kompan, Inc. - Austin, TX

Lanier Plans, Inc. DBA Korkat - Carrollton, GA

Creative Shade Solutions - Tarpon Springs, FL

Bliss Products and Services, Inc. -  Lithia Springs, GA
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

$175.00 $175.00

$100.00 $150.00

$200.00 $250.00

$600.00 $1,200.00

$950.00 $1,250.00

No Bid No Bid

$195.00 (9) $125.00 (10) $235.00 (9) $175.00 (10)

No Bid No Bid

$250.00 $300.00

$250.00 $250.00

Miller Recreation Equipment & Design, Inc. dba Miracle Recreation Equipment 
Company - Monett , MO

Shade America, Inc. - St. Augustine, FL 

Swartz Associates, Inc. - Naples, FL

Webuildfun, Inc. - Allen, TX

Playspace Services- Melbourne, FL

Project Innovations Inc. - Tarpon Springs, FL

Southern Park and Play, LLC - Melbourne, FL

Rep Services, Inc. - Longwood, FL

BIDDERS:

ITEM 6: REPAIR TECHNICIAN-
STANDARD HOURLY RATE- PER 

HOUR

ITEM 7: REPAIR TECHNICIAN-
NON-STANDARD HOURLY 

RATE- PER HOUR

PlayCore Wisconsin, Inc. dba Gametime - Fort Payne, FL

Playmore West, Inc.- Fort Myers, FL
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

Additional Details

PCard- NO
15% 5% Delivery 30-90 days

PCard- YES
15% 10% Delivery 90 or less

PCard- NO
15% 10.00% Delivery 90 days

PCard- NO
15% 10.00% Delivery 160 days

PCard- Not provided
No Bid No Bid Delivery Not provided

PCard- YES
15% 10% Delivery 60

PCard- NO
15% 10% Delivery 45 days

PCard- NO
15% 10% Delivery 60 days

PCard- YES
15% 10% Delivery 60 days

PCard- YES
15% 10% Delivery 60-180 days

PCard- YES
10% 10% Delivery 70 days

Dragon Recreation Services - Fort Myers, FL

360 Recreation LLC- Orlando, FL

Advanced Recreational Concepts, LLC- Melbourne, FL

Apollo Sunguard Systems, Inc.-Sarasota , FL

Kompan, Inc. - Austin, TX

Lanier Plans, Inc. DBA Korkat - Carrollton, GA

Bliss Products and Services, Inc. -  Lithia Springs, GA

BSN Sports, LLC- Farmers Branch, TX

Creative Shade Solutions - Tarpon Springs, FL

Industrial Shadeports Inc. - Fort Lauderdale, FL

Florida Recreational Products LLC - Lynn Haven, FL

BIDDERS:

ITEM 8: PERCENTAGE MARK-UP 
OF REPAIR MATERIALS

ITEM 9: RENTAL OF 
EQUIPMENT
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

Additional Details

PCard- YES
10% 5% Delivery 30 days

PCard- YES
No Bid 10% Delivery  42-56 days

PCard- YES
0% 10% Delivery  60 days

PCard-NO
15% 10% Delivery  30-150 days

PCard-YES
15% 10% Delivery  90 days or less

PCard-No
15% 10% Delivery  180 days

PCard-NO
No Bid No Bid Delivery  90 days

PCard-YES
15% 10% Delivery  90 days

PCard- YES
No Bid No Bid Delivery 30-45 days

PCard-  NO
No Bid No Bid Delivery 30-70 days

PCard-  YES
10% 10% Delivery 56-84 days

Legacy Construction Services Group LLC dba Pro Playground- Tallahassee, FL

ITEM 8: PERCENTAGE MARK-UP 
OF REPAIR MATERIALS

Miller Recreation Equipment & Design, Inc. dba Miracle Recreation Equipment 
Company - Monett , MO

Southern Park and Play, LLC - Melbourne, FL

Shade America, Inc. - St. Augustine, FL 

Webuildfun, Inc. - Allen, TX

Swartz Associates, Inc. - Naples, FL

PlayCore Wisconsin, Inc. dba Gametime - Fort Payne, FL

Playmore West, Inc.- Fort Myers, FL

Playspace Services- Melbourne, FL

Project Innovations Inc. - Tarpon Springs, FL

Rep Services, Inc. - Longwood, FL

BIDDERS:

ITEM 9: RENTAL OF 
EQUIPMENT
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

NOTES:
1) Playground Equipment

Installation Notes

2) Travel rates $125.00 per hour. 
3) Discount does not include freight, specials/sales flyers, parts.
4) All GameTime Equipment
    All GameTime -$100 and above 10% discount on equipment list price
    All Playground Systems-15% discount on equipment list price
    GameTime GTImpaz Surfacing Components
    GameTime GT Fit Items- 10% discount on equipment list price
5) Installation
    Minimum trip charge for nay installation service-$2,500
    Shade and shelter installations at a different rate and to be determined for we=ach project, will include footers and crane rental. And additional services as needed.  
    All installation services by a GameTime certified installer. With invoicing and billing going through Gametime.
   Site Preparation-
          Digout/Excavation $1.75 per SQ FT          4" think concrete $1200 per SQ FT
          Removal of Spoils $2.00 per SQ FT          crushed stone $5.50 per SQ FT 
          Concrete Curb $50.00 per LN FT               Utility locates $1,500.00 each
          Signed/Sealed Drawings $1,400.00 per job
6) Surfacing Matrix (all pricing includes installation, but no sub-base)
     Poured Rubber- GT Aromatic- 1/2" thick wear course-50% color-Aromatic Urethane

1000+ sq. ft.
4’ fall height (2” thick)      $25.00
5’ fall height (2.5” thick)   $26.00
6’ fall height (3” thick)      $27.00
8’ fall height (3.5” thick)   $29.00

Add $1.75 per sq. ft. for 100% Color
Add $2.50 per sq. ft. for Aliphatic Binder

     a. Play and Park Structures swings and swing components have a 1% discount.
     b. Engineering and permitting have 0% discount.

     c. Shade and Shelter installation- Prices per job.
     d. Sports courts-Priced per Job.
     e. Site prep and site restoration are not included in install-Priced per job.

     h. Only play and park structures requires certified installers.
     i. Site work and demolition is priced per job.

     f. Concrete slabs-Priced per job.
     g. Concrete curb- Priced per job.
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 26-0041-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., June 11, 2025

NOTES:
6) continued
     GT Turf, GT vTurf-60 oz. with infill

1000+ sq. ft.
0’ fall height      $25.00
4’ fall height      $26.00
6’ fall height      $27.00
8’ fall height      $29.00

     Engineered Wood Fiber
     Regardless of truck size 1-100 cubic yards, freight is $1,500 per truck load
     Each cubic yard of ADA & ASTM compliant Wood Fiber is $30.00
    Wood Fiber Installation = $.75 per sq. ft.
Please call for more up to date quote, as Wood Fiber Freight cost does fluctuate monthly!
7) Playground Equipment installation only.
     Freenotes Harmony Park, Playcraft Systems, Grounds for Play, Ultra Play, Playtopia, Sports Play, ID Sculpture
Site Equipment installation only.
    Tuuci, Ultrasite,SRP/Webcoat, Frog Furnishings, Bison NRS Bleachers
Shade Structure installation only.
   SRP Shade, USA Shade, Shade Systems, Cedar Forest Products
8) Includes foundations, equipment and labor.
9) Supervisor 1 team leader.
10) General worker
11) Playground Equipment and Site Equipment. $1,300.00 minimum charge for installation.
12) Shade Structures. $1,300.00 minimum charge for installation.
13)Surfacing Materials. $1,300.00 minimum charge for installation.
14) Prepay & add freight for all manufacturers. Any Permitting requirements and cost (if applicable) will incur additional fee.
15)  8% for $0.00 - $4,999.
       12% for $5,000-$9,999
       15% $10,000-$14,999
       18% $15,000-$24,999
       20% $25,000-above

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of 
proceedings under chapter 120, Florida Statutes.
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