AcoR CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE e

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

2600 Hollywood Blvd,
HolTywood FL 33020 USA

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder Is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed. If a
SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may requlre an endorsement. A statement on this Eg
certificate does not confer rights to the certiflcate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s). F]
PFIODUCEFL ] GONTACT ﬁ
Aon Risk Services Central, Inc. PHONE - FAX — e
Philadelphia pA office (NG, No, Exy; (B66) 283-7122 (AIC. Mo); 80036370105 3
one Liberty Place : E-MAIL °
1650 M%Egt Street ADDRESS! 2
i e delahia PA 19103 USA INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
INSURED INSURER A: Liberty Mutual Fire Ins Co 23035
andritz Separation Inc, ) INSURER B: Liberty Insurance Corparation 42404
1010 Commercial Blwd., South
ArTington TX 76001 USA INSURER C:
INSURER D3
INSURER E:
INSURER F:
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 570081974708 REVISION NUMBER: -
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABCOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED, NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY GONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TQ ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS, Lirmits shown are as requosted
kil TYPE OF INSURANCE sl e POLICY NUMBER Ty B | FoLCTERE ] LIMITS
A | X | COMMERGIAL GENERAL LIABILITY TBZ265 1004304100 m 72021 EAGH OCCURRENGE $2,000,000
DAMAGE TO RENTED
| cLams-mane OCGUR PAEMISES Joa sosrence) $1,000,000
MED EXP {Any one parson} §5,000
PERSONAL & ADV INJURY $2,000,000] 3
— I~
| GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENEAAL AGGREGATE $10,000,000 &
X | poLicy I:I FRo. Loe PRODUCTS - GOMP/OP AGG §2,000,000] 2
OTHER; E
A AS2-651-004304~030 06/01/2020{056/01/2021| COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT ot
AUTONOBILE LIABILITY /01/ ZOMRMED ¢ 1,000,000
| any auTo BODILY INJURY { Fer parsan) 2
| owneD ) iﬁ'}%bsULED BODILY INJURY (Per accident) o
| AREDAToE NON-OWNED B PROPERTY DAMAGE 8
L onwy AUTOS ONLY {Per accident £
[
UMBRELLA LIAB accun EACH OCGURRENGE O
|| Excesswae | | cLamswacs AGOREGATE
pEo|  [rerEnTION
B | WORKERS GOMPENGATION AND . WA765D004304130 06/01/2020[06/01/2021] y | PER 8TATUTE | |om.
EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY /N (A08) ER
B S'Q‘F’,EEEVKFE‘EL%?.’&%TL“.‘,EE%’?E"EG”T"’E E i WC7651004304140 06/01,2020|06,/01/2021 E.L, EACH AGGIDENT $1,000,000
{Mandalory in NH) {(wI) E.L. DISEASE-EA EMPLOYEE $1,000,G00
D APTION OF SPERATIONS below : ’ EL. DISEASE POLICY LIMIT 31,000, 000]—
é
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Addilional Remarks Schedule, may be attached If more space Is required) ﬁ
RE: Quote No: 20430803, Project Name; Citg of Hollywood. certificate Holder is added as an Additional Insured with respect [t
to the General Liability and Automobile_Liability policies, if required by written contract with Certificate Holder and subject E"—:;
te the policy terms, conditions and exclusions. o
“u B
o
CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION oY
SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLIGIES RE CANCELLED BEFORE THE =
EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTIGE WILL BE DELIVERED IN ACCOADANCE WITH THE A
POLICY PROVISIONS,
city of HolTlywood AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE
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Robert Lowerx ‘ :

From: Horace Mclarty

Sent: Monday, April 27, 2020 431 PM
To: Coy Mathis

Ce: Robert Lowery

Subject: FW: Andritz Insurance
Attachments: Andritz Insurance.pdf
Approved

Replacing and repairing equipment for the Wastewater Plant

Horace McLarty
Accountant, Human Resources/Risk Management

Office: (954) 521-3252
Fax: (954) 921-3678
Email: hmclarty@hollywoodfl.org

From: Coy Mathis
Sent: Monday, April 27, 2020 2:50 PM
To: Horace Mclarty <HMCEARTY@hollywoadfl.org>
Cc: Robert Lowery <RLOWERY@hollywoodfl.org>
Subject: Andritz Insurance

Horace,

Andritz Separation Inc. is golng to perform more work for us at the Belt Filter Press site at the WWTP. Please review
and approve the attached COl. Thank you.

Coy




