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Piggybacking Request Form
(Use for purchase(s) over $25,000, when piggybacking off other contracts)

Date 7/9/19

Department/Office 4000 Division/Area 4031

Oy ;
Contract Administrator Robert Walker 4\\ Title Public Utilities Manager
Phone 954-921-3046 Email rawalker@hollywoodfl.org

1. Requested Vendor Thompson Pump & Manufacturing Vendor Number 5949
Co, Inc.

Address PO Box 291370, Port Orange, FL 32129-1370

Contact Person Alan Curry Title Municipal Sales Representative
Phone 561-624-7801 Email acurry@thompsonpump.com

2. Contract title requesting to piggyback? FSA18-VEH16.0-Cab & Chassis Trucks & Heavy Equipment

Awarding Agency Florida Sheriffs Association

Contract Expiration Date 9/30/19

Copy of Contract and Awarding Agency documentation is attached.

X Yes [ ] No

3. Product/Service being requested (be specific). Thompson Pump model 6JSCEE-DIST-4LE2T-MC 6"
Sound Attenduated, compressor assisted, trailer mounted, high efficency, low pressure pump.

4. Detailed description of the products/services function and purpose. To be utilized in emergency flooding
response operations as well as general pumping and construction repairs within the City of Hollywood limits.

Procurement Service Division use only

Requisition # R Purchase Order # P Blanket Purchase Oder # BPO
(As Applicable) (As Applicable) (As Applicable)

(Revised 08/2015)



5. Please explain what process the Department/Office took to verify and/or identify this contract. Contacted

manufacturer of equipment & requested a price guote to purchase.

6. Were alternative contracts evaluated to determine that the City is obtaining the most advantageous confract
pricing for the required product/service?
Yes [ ] No

Please explain Reveiwed the pricing costs on the Florida Sheriffs Association current contract.

7. Total cost of the requested product/service. $54,165.00
8. Total estimated annual {fiscal year) cost of requested product/service.$54,165.00

Account Number(s) 443.418901.53800.563010.000915.000.000 -
9. Is this product/service covered by a warranty? [X] Yes [] No

If yes, please attach a copy of the warranty details.

10. Would this purchase(s) result in the potential of future purchases for related products/services being
restricted to a particular vendor or create a specific vendor as sole source provider for related items?

[ Yes No

If yes, please describe the related products/services and estimated cost(s.)

11. Would this purchase(s) result in any future maintenance costs which are not included in the initial purchase?
1 Yes XI No
If yes, please attach a draft maintenance plan which includes cost estimates and funding source(s.)
12. Is this a grant related purchase? [ Yes X] No
If yes, please provide details (timeline, expiration dates, milestones, special procurement requirements,
etc.)
Will this require matching funds? [[] Yes [X] No
What is the grant source? N/A__
What is the grant (doltar) amount? N/A
13. Please complete an advanced search of the vendor recommended for award on the Federal Government's
Systems for Award Management at www.sam.gov.
Date of Advanced Search 7/3/19
Company Name(s) Searched Search Results

Procurement Service Division use only

Requisition # R Purchase Order # P Bianket Purchase Cder # BPQ
{As Applicable) {As Applicable) (As Applicable)

(Revised 08/2015})



REQUESTING DEPARTMENT RECOMMENDATION

Note: By signing and returning this form, you are verifying and acknowledging that you have reviewed all
portions (scope, terms, conditions, pricing, etc.) of the requested contract and recommend its approval
based on the contract complying with the City of Hollywood’s scope and pricing requirements and to the
best of you knowledge the contract does not violate any applicable policy, statue, governing rule or

regulation.

PV i

By a4

Contact Persop’s Signature Date
A ity

Supew%ﬂ

Date
* |17/ 14

Director's Signature

Date

APPROVAL (Procurement Service Division Use Only)

Verified By: Date
Approved Date
By:
Procurement Service Division use only
Requisition # R Purchase Order # P Blanket Purchase Oder # BPO
(As Applicable) (As Applicable) (As Applicable)

(Revised 08/2015)
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Municipal Sales

4620 City Center Dr., Port Orange, FL, USA 32119
(800) 767-7310 » Fax: (386) 761-0362
thompsonpump.com

acurr

FSA18-VEH16.0, Spec #81

Price_ _Quote

Rl e T
R i e B ;':.' o P'ric'é"_:
» There are no specified duty points for this quotation
615C Vehicle
ZONE: Southern
BASE PRICE: 1 | $38,914.00 | $38,914.00
Base Model includes: TPM Basic (auto start/stop control
panel with Floats/Tachometer/Hour meter/Engine Safety
Shut Down) Battery, Light package, Trailer, 24 Month
Warranty, and Operational Training
Add Options:
= Upgrade to aluminum sound attenuated 4” pump 4/6 Silent Knight 1 $9,754.00 $9,754.00
package, 4JSC-FT4/6JSC-LHP-FT4
= Optional Equipment, Optional corrosion resistant Special Metals 1 $3,500.00 $3,500.00
impeller metal for 4” and 6” pumps
- Optional Equipment, Hydraulic Brakes per axle Hydraulic Brakes 1 $895.00 $895.00
Delete Options:
= Delete Option, Downgrade pump from 6JSC to 6JSC-LHP 6ISC-FT4-LHP 1 ($2,245.00) ($2,245.00)
with FT4 engine-trailer mounted from 6JSC
- Delete Option, Remove air/water separation chamber E-Chamber 1 ($363.00) ($363.00)
Non-Specified Add Options:
- 316 Stainless Steel Enviroprime System 1 $3,510.00 $3,510.00
- Zinc Anodes $200.00 $200.00
Final Model: 61SCEE-DIST-4LE2T-MC Total $54,165.00

° FOB: DESTINATION

. DELIVERY FREIGHT: INCLUDED IN BASE PRICE

L] TERMS: NET 30-DAYS (WITH APPROVED CREDIT)

® DELIVERY: 12-14 WEEKS OR SOONER AFTER RECEIPT OF A HARD COPY PURCHASE ORDER

PLEASE PROVIDE ATAX EXEMPTION CERTIFICATE AT TIME OR ORDER IF APPLICABLE

NO PENALTIES OR LIQUIDATED DAMAGES ARE ACCEPTABLE

CANCELLATION OF THIS ORDER OR RETURN OF THIS UNIT MAY RESULT IN RE-STOCKING FEES

THIS QUOTE IS VALID UNTIL SEPTEMBER 30, 2019




FSA Cooperative Purchasing Program

"FLORIDA

/ SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION

COO PERATIVE

PURCHASING PROGRAM

Contract: FSA18-VEH16.0
Cab & Chassis Trucks & Heavy Equipment

Contract: FSA18-VEL26.0
Police Rated, Administrative,
Utility Vehicles, Trucks and Vans

Contract Terms and Conditions




FSA18-VEH16.0 | Competitive Purchasing Program Page 1 of 8

'F (https://www.facebook.com/floridasheriffsassociation/)

FLORIDA SHERIFFS
ASSOCIATION

(https://www.flsheriffs.org/)

Become a Member (https://membership.flsheriffs.org/Membership-LP.html#Choose)

About L4
Sheriffs v
Programs -
Publications v

Join Today (https://membership.flsheriffs.org/Membership-LP.html)

Renew Membership (https://membership.flsheriffs.org/Membership-LP.html#Choose)

PURCHASING PROGRAM

« Back to Main Purchasing Page (https://www.flsheriffs.org/law-enforcement-

programs/cooperative-purchasing-program)

FSA18-VEH16.0 CAB & CHASSIS TRUCKS AND HEAVY
EQUIPMENT

Effective October 1, 2018 — September 30, 2019

https://www flsheriffs.org/law-enforcement-programs/purchasing2018/cab-chassis-trucks-a... ~ 7/3/2019



FSA18-VEH16.0 | Competitive Purchasing Program Page 8 of 8

Training {/law-enforcement-programs/training)
Our Programs (/law-enforcement-programs/our-programs)
FSA Store (4 (https://www.companypromostore.com/stores/fsamembers/?

utm_source=website&utm_medium=footer)

SHERIFF LOGIN (HTTPS://WWW.FLSHERIFFS.CRG/LOGIN)

f(https://www.facebook.com/ﬂoridasheriffsassociation/) ,

0 You
(https://twitter.com/FLSheriffs) (https://www.instagram.c:om/floridasheriff/) Tuhe]

(https://www.youtube.com/user/FloridaSheriffs?feature=mhum)

Florida Sheriffs Association
2617 Mahan Drive
Tallahassee, FL 32308
(800) 877-2168

| ¥ Standby Systems GENERAC | moustenn.
Power Goneration e oW R |

Call Carlog Aveituno, Director of Engineering [ENHELUS RN
(https://fengine.multiview.com/r?
e=eyJ2ljoiMS4xliwiYXYiOjMzMDQOMSwiYXQiOjQsimJOljowLCJjbSIENjkwMTgzLCJjaCIBMTYzN;j

©2019 Florida Sherifis Association // Privacy and Refund Policy (/privacy-and-refund-policy)

https://www.flsheriffs.org/law-enforcement-programs/purchasing2018/cab-chassis-trucks-a...  7/3/2019
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All About Florida

FLORIDA SHERIFEFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership

Type of Vehicle

Pat's Pump & Blower

Pat's Pump & Blower

Pat's Pump & Blower

Pat's Pump & Blower

Godwin Pumps of America

Godwin Pumps of America

Godwin Pumps of America

Godwin Pumps of America

United Rentals (North America), Inc.

United Rentals (North America), Inc,

United Rentals (North America), Inc.

United Rentals (North America), Ine,

Holland Pump Company

Holland Pump Company

2019 BBA BA150E
2019 BBA BA150E
2019 BBA BA1S0E
2019 BBA BA150E
2019 BBA BA150E
2019 BBA BA150E
2019 BBA BA130E
2019 BBA BA150E

2019 Godwin CD150M
2019 Godwin CD150M
2019 Godwin CD150M
2019 Godwin CD150M
2019 Godwin CD150M
2019 Godwin CD150M
2019 Godwin CD150M
2019 Godwin CD150M

2019 Pioneer PP06S121.71
2019 Pioneer PP66S12L.71
2019 Pioneer PP66S121.71
2019 Pioneer PP66S121.71
2019 Pioneer PP665121.71
2019 Pioneer PP665121.71
2019 Pioneer PP66S12L71
2019 Pioneer PP66512L71

Zone

Western
Western
Northern
Notrthern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Waestern
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

2019 Holland Pumps (PTSTPC-P1104D44T) Western
2019 Heltand Pumps {(PT6TPC-P1104D44T) Western
2019 Holland Pumps (PT6TPC-P1104D44T) Northern

Base Unit
Price

$42,123.00
~NB -~
$42,123.00
-—-NB --
$42,123.00
- NB w=
$42,123.00
- NB -

$35,712.00
--NB --
$35,712.00
--NBE --
$35,712.00
weNEB --
$35,712.00
~-NB --

$41,500.00
—-NB --
$41,500.00
- NB -
$41,500.00
--NB --
$41,500.00
«-NB -

$40,264.00
-~ NB --
$40,064.00



Holland Pump Company

Holland Pump Company

Thompson Pump & Manufacturing Company, Inc.

Thompson Pump & Manufacturing Company, Inc.

Thompson Pump & Manufacturing Company, Inc.

Thempson Pump & Manufacturing Company, Inc.

Tradewinds Power

Tradewinds Power

Tradewinds Power

Tradewinds Power

2019 Holland Pumps (PT6TPC-P1104D44T)
2019 Holland Pumps (PT6TPC-P1104D44T)
2019 Holland Pumps (PT6TPC-P1104D44T)
2019 Holland Pumps (PT6TPC-P1104D44T)
2019 Holland Pumps (PT6TPC-P1104D44T)

2019 Supervac Triton
2019 Supervac Triton
2019 Supervac Triton
2019 Supervac Triton
2019 Supervac Triton
2019 Supervac Triton
2019 Supervac Triton
2019 Supervac Triton

2019 Thompson 6JSC
2019 Thompson 6JSC
2019 Thompson 6JSC
2019 Thompson 6JSC
2019 Thompson 6JSC
2019 Thompson 6JSC
2019 Thompson 6JSC
2019 Thompson 6JSC

2019 Tradewinds TPK064750
2019 Tradewinds TPK064750
2019 Tradewinds TPK064750
2019 Tradewinds TPK064750
2019 Tradewinds TPK064750
2019 Tradewinds TPK064750
2019 Tradewinds TPK064750
2019 Tradewinds TPK064750

Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

* Western
Western
*Northern
Northern

* Central
Central

* Southern

Southern

--NB --
$40,064.00
--NB --
$40,064.00
--NB --

--NB --

$38,914.00
- NB --
$38,914.00
—NB --
$38,914.00
—-NB --
$38,914.00
—-NB --

$34,900.00
--NB --
$34,900.00
—-NB --
$34,900.00
--NB --
$34,900.00
—-NB -
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

6 INCH MOBILE PUMP PACKAGE
SPECIFICATION #81

2019 Thompson 6JSC

The Thompson 6JSC purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $38,914.00 $38,914.00 $38,914.00 $38,914.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE: 61SC

DEALER: Thompson Pump & Thompson Pump & Thompson Pump & Thompson Pump &
Manufacturing Company,  Manufacturing Company,  Manufacturing Company,  Manufacturing Company,
Inc. Inc. Inc. Inc.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern

BASE PRICE: $38,914.00 $38,914.00 $38,914.00 $38,914.00

Order Code Delete Options All Zones

3p- i Downgrade to 3" pump i ($36,931.00)l i

Downgrade pump from 6JSC to 3D- trailer mounted 1

! Downgrade to 4" pump ($5,766.00)l

Downgrade pump from 6JSC to 4JSC-LHP with FT4 engine- trailer mounted 1

4JSCM-FT4-LHP

4JSVM-FT4-LHP ! Downgrade pump package - specify (%41 16.00)l
Downgrade pump from 6JSC to 4JSV-LHP vacuum assisted with FT4 engine- trailer mounted 1

41SC-STP ! Downgrade pump package - specify ($’.F,288.‘1)0)l
Downgrade pump from 6JSC to 4JSC- trailer mounted 1

4JSV-STP ! Downgrade pump package - specify ($5,591.00)l
Dawngrade pump from 6JSC to 4JSV vacuum-assisted with FT4 engine- trailer mounted 1

AT-LHP-WTP ' Downgrade pump package - specify ($30,631.00)l
Downgrade pump from 6JSC to 4T-LHP-WTP diesel with FT4 engine- trailer mounted !

4D-FT4 ! Downgrade pump package - specify (3&'20,992&".00)I
Dovwngrade pump from 6JSC to 4D-FT4 diesel with FT4 engine- trailer mounted 1

6-WTP ! Downgrade pump package - specify ($13,57’9.00)1
Downgrade pump from 6JSC to 6" Trash Pump with FT4 engine- trailer mounted |

SK Dewatering ] Downgrade pump package - specify (&35,797.00)1
Downgrade pump from 6JSC to 6" Silent Wellpoint Dewatering Pump- trailer mownted 1

4- Trailer ' Downgrade pump package - specify ($1,588.00)]
Trailer for 4JSCM/4JSVM model 1

6- Trailer ! Downgrade pump packa%e - specify ($1,942.00)1

Trailer for 6JSC/6JSV models
L' Delete remote control ($2,791.00)]
Downgrade pump to basic manual start control panel |

TPM Panel- Basic

8- Trailer | Delete option - specify ($2,944.00){
Trailer for §JSC models 1

10- Trailer ! Delete option - specify ($6,163.00)"
Trailer for 10JSC-HP/12JSC-LHP models |

12- Trailer ! Delete option - specify (!’58,700.00)1
Trailer for 12JSC-HP/18JSC-HP/18JSC-PEAK models 1

3- Trailer | Delete option - specify ($290.()0)1
Trailer for 3D Model 1

Float Box | Delete option - specif?' ($160.00)1
Remove float storage box

E-Chamber ' Delete option - specify ($363.00)I
Remaove airAwater separation chamber 1

Light Package : Delete option - s]ljecify ($281.00)1
DOT Light Package

ECON-Options ! Delete option - specify (3943.00)1

Removal of CLB. FEND, and LJ for 4" and 6" pumps only 1



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

4-wTP !
6JSC-FT4-LHP !
6JSV-FT4-LHP !
4TSC-FT4 !

4JSV-FT4 !

Order Code
8JSCE-FT4-C !

10JSC-FT4-C !
12JSC-FT4-V !

4- Silent Knight !

4/6- Silent Knight !

6- Silent Knight !

8/10/12- Silent
Knight '
12/18- Silent
Knight !

18- Silent Knight |

6ISC-FT4-C/K !
6ISV-FT4-C/K '
4]SC-HP-FT4 !
4JSV-HP-FT4 !

6JSC-FT4-J/D !

6JSC

Thompson Pump & Thompson Pump & Thompson Pump &
Manufacturing Company,  Manufacturing Company,  Manufacturing Company,
Inc. Inc. Inc.

Western Northern Central

$38.914.00 $38,914.00 $38,914.00

Delete option - specify
Downgrade pump from 6JSC to 4" Trash Pump with FT4 engine- trailer mounted l

Delete option - specify
Downgrade pump from 6JSC to 6JSC-LHP with FT4 engine- trailer mounted 1

Delete option - specify
Downgrade pump from 6JSC to 6JSC-LHP with FT4 engine- trailer mounted 1

Delete option - specify
Downgrade pump from 6JSC to 4JSC- with FT4 engine- trailer mowunted |

Delete option - specify
Downgrade pump from 6JSC to 4JSV- with FT4 engine- trailer mounted 1

Delete option - specify
Delete option - specify

Add Options

Upgrade to 8" pump
Upgrade pump from 6J5C to 8JSC-HP with FT4 engine- trailer mounted 1

Upgrade to 10" pump
Upgrade pump from 6JSC to 10JSC-HP with FT4 engine- trailer mounted 1

Upgrade to 12" pump
Upgrade pump from 6JSC to 12JSC-HP with FT4 engine- trailer mounted |

Upgrade to aluminum sound attenuated 3" pump package
Upgrade to sound attenuated 4JSC-LHP Silent Knight, Sound Attenuated Enclosure |

Upgrade to aluminum sound attenuated 4" pump package
Upgrade to sound attenuated 4JSC-FT4/6JSC-LHP-FT4 Silent Knight, Sound Attenuated Enclosure 1

Upgrade to aluminum sound attenuated 6" pump package
Upgrade to sound attenuated 6JSC/6JSV Silent Knight, Sound Attenuated Enclosure |

Upgrade to aluminum sound attenuated 8" pump package
Upgrade to sound attenuated 8JSC/10JSC/12JSC-LHP Silent Knight, Sound Attenuated Enclosure 1

Upgrade to aluminum sound attenuated 10" pump package
Upgrade to sound attenuated 12JSC-HP/18JSC-HP Silent Knight, Sound Attenuated Enclosure 1

Upgrade to aluminum sound attenuated 12" pump package
Upgrade to sound attenuated 18JSC-PEAK Silent Knight, Sound Attenuated Enclosure |

.Upgradc - specify

Upgrade pump firom 6JSC ta 6JSC-C/K with FT4 engine- trailer mounted 1

Upgrade - specify
Upgrade pump from 6JSC to 6JSV-C/K vacinuum assisted, with FT4 engine- trailer mounted 1

Upgrade - specify
Upgrade pump firom 6JSC to 4JSC-HP with FT4 engine- trailer mounted 1

Upgrade - specify
Upgrade pump from 6JSC to 4JSV-HP with FT4 engine- trailer mounted |

Upgrade - specify
Upgrade pump from 6JSC to 6JSC-J/D with FT4 engine-trailer mounted 1

Thompson Pump &
Manufacturing Company,

Inc.
Southern
$38,914.00

($15,032.00)"

| ($2,245.00)"

($906.00)"
($3,796.00)"
($2,456.00)"

NA
NA

All Zones
$39,277.00"

$44,825.00"
$86,368.00"
$8,100.00"
$9,754.00"
$11,875.00"
$14,184.00"
$17,799.00'
$19,213.00"
$3,462.00"
$5,894.00"
$8,925.00"
$11,356.00"

$11,427.00"



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

6JSV-FT4-J/D !
24V Engine L

DC Battery
Disconnect
6JSC-STP !
6JSV-STP !
81SC-STP !
12JSC-LHP-STP !
12JSC-HP-STP !
18JSC-HP-STP |
18JSC-PEAK-STP !
41SC-HP-STP !
TPM Panel-
Advanced :

Hose Racks !
Level Transducer !
Inside Work

Lights !
QOutside Work

Lights !

U Tank '

D Tank |

AC Power Inverter :

SCADA Interface |

TPM Omni !

6JSC

Thompson Pump &
Manufacturing Company,

Inc.
Western
$38,914.00

Upgrade - specify

Thompson Pump &
Manufacturing Company,
Inc.

Northern
$38,914.00

Thompson Pump &
Manufacturing Company,
Inc.

Central
$38,914.00

Upgrade pump from 6JSC to 6JSV-J/D vacuum assisted with FT4 engine-trailer mounted 1

Upgrade - specify

Thompson Pump &
Manufacturing Company,

Inc.
Southern
$38,914.00

Upgrade diesel engine from 12VDC to 24VDC with (2) 12VDC battery banks and charging system for LS 1

Upgrade - specify

Optional battery disconnect mounted inside the pump 1

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade pump from 6JSC to 6JSC-STP 1

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade pump from 6JSC to 6JSV-STP vacuum-assisted !

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade pump from 6JSC to 8JSC-STP 1

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade pump from 6JSC to 12JSC-LHP-STP 1

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade pump from 6JSC to 12JSC-HP-STP 1

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade pump from 6JSC to 18JSC-HP-STP 1

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade pump from 6J5C to 18JSC-PEAK-STP 1

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade pump from 6JSC to 4JSC-HP-STP |

Upgrade - specify

Advanced auto start/stop control panel with application specific features 1

Upgrade - specify

Hose racks for mobilizing suction and discharge hoses with the pump |

Optional equipment - specify
Level/Pressure transducer with 50" of wet cable and leveling guard 1

Optional equipment - specify

(2) DC powered LED work lights with ON/OFF switch mounted inside the Silent Knight enclosure 1

Optional equipment - specify

(2) DC powered LED work lights with ON/OFF switch mounted outside the pump set 1

Optional equipment - specify

UL-142 modular DW fuel tank with std. dimensions 1

Optional equipment - specify

Non-Ul madular DW fuel tank, std. dimensions |

Optional equipment - specify
DC to AC power inverter mounted inside the Silent Knight enclosure |

Optional equipment - specify

SCADA Interface with up to 4 dry contact connections to be hard wived for remote monitoring of pump status 1

Optional equipment - specify

DC or AC powered beacon light with 75' HL float and (1) additional alarm 1

$13,819.00' |
$1,350.00'
$390.00"
$3,729.00'
$9,065.00'
$14,936.00'
$34,133.00'
$82,381.00"
$106,929.00'
$126,318.00"
$4,230.00"
$3,109.00'
$842.00
$2,120.00"
$510.00"
$665.00"
$4,385.00'
$2,730.00'
$1,269.00!
$2,100.00"

$1,997.00"



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

Annual Monitoring-
Omni

Annual Monitoring-
RECON 2000T |

Solar Battery
Charger i

RECON 2000T !

Z Tank !

SK Protection :

Mod Tank Coating :
STP-SCI '
STP-DD

STP-SU '

Strorage Box .
Battery Charger :
Spare Tire '
Hydraulic Brakes !
Throttle Actuator |
32HPU/60HST-J !
12ISV-FT4-V !
8x10 HP Suction

Hose !

3 Inch Hose
Package !

4x20 Suction Hose |

6ISC

Thompson Pump & Thompson Pump & Thompson Pump &

Manufacturing Company,  Manufacturing Company,  Manufacturing Company,

Inc. Inc. Inc. Inc.
Western Northern Central Southern
$38,914.00 $38,914.00 $38.,914.00 $38,914.00

Optional equipment - specify
TPM Omni- 12 month cellular subscription to monitoring database to receive alarms 1

j Optional equipment - specify

RECON 20007~ 12 Month subscription for cellular monitoring, plus capabilities to control the pump from remote
website with RECON 2000T control panel 1

Optional equipment - specify
Solar powered battery charger

Optional equipment - specify
RECON 2000T Advanced control panel that allows pumps to be monitored and controlled remotely from a computer,
tablet, or smartphone |

Optional equipment - specify
Additional fuel capacity for 4”-8" modular fuel tanks- max 150 gallon- skid only 1

Optional equipment - specify
Addf?anan’ protective components to finish coat on the Silent Knight enclosure- surface prep and UV resistant clear
coat

Optional equipment - specify
Corrosion resistant coating for modular fuel tanks |

Optional equipment - specify
Optional impeller for specific applications, select models only 1

Optional equipment - specify
Optional DRS or DCS for specific applications, select models only |

Optional equipment - specify
Optional Start-Up Testing and Training for specific applications, select models only 1

Optional equipment - specify
Optional lockable storage box for trailer-mounted pumps 1

Optional equipment - specify
Optional 120V Battery Charger 1

Optional equipment - specify
Optional on-board spare tire for trailer mounted pumps 1

Optional equipment - specify
Optional hydraulic brakes per axle for trailer mounted pumps 1

Optional equipment - specify
Optional throttle actuator to adjust RPM automatically in specific applications 1

Optional equipment - specify
Upgrade pump from 6JSC to 32HPU/60HST with FT4 engine- trailer mounted 1

Optional equipment - specify
Upgrade pump from 6JSC to 12JSV-HP vacuum-assisted with FT4 engine- trailer mounted 1

Optional equipment - specify
8" x 10" HP Suction/Discharge Hose, C- Ball x Socket 1

Optional equipment - specify
(L) 3" x 20’ Suction Hose, B- CxE and (1) 3" x 50' R- Lay-Flat Discharge Hose, B- CxE 1

Optional equipment - specify
4" x 20" Suction Hose, Ball x Socket |

Thompson Pump &
Manufacturing Company,

$450.00"

$650.00"

$868.00"

$4,425.00"

$2,900.00'

$921.00"

$3,045.00"
$1,523.00
$653.00"
$471.00"
$650.00"
$471.00"
$316.00"
$895.00"
$1,185.00"
$4,156.00"
$91,720.00"
$874.00"
$252.00°

$218.00"



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

4x10 Suction Hose 1

4x50 Discharge
Hose '

4x10 HP Discharge
Hose !

6x20 Suction Hose |

6x10 Suction Hose 1

6x50 Discharge
Hose

6x10 HP Discharge
1

Hose

AUX FT-254 !

AUX FT- 500 !

8ISV-LHP-FT4 !

Special Metals .

FPM- 4/6 Pumps |

FPM- 8/10/12/18

Pumps 1

Engine Warranty !

TPM Warranty L

% Discount ]

6JSC

Thompson Pump & Thompson Pump & Thompson Pump &
Manufacturing Company,  Manufacturing Company, = Manufacturing Company,
Inc. Inc. Inc.

Western Northern Central

$38,914.00 $38,914.00 $38,914.00

Optional equipment - specify

| 4" x 10" Suction Hose, Ball x Socket 1

- Optional equipment - specify

4" x 50' Low Pressure Lay-Flat Discharge Hose, Ball x Socket 1

Optional equipment - specify
4" x 10" HP Discharge Hose, C-Ball x Socket 1

Optional equipment - specify
6" x 20 Suction Hose, Ball x Socket 1

Optional equipment - specify
6" x 10" Suction Hose, Ball x Socket 1

Optional equipment - specify
6" x 50' Low Pressure Lay-Flat Discharge Hose, Ball x Socket !

Optional equipment - specify
6"x 10" HP Discharge Hose, C-Ball x Socket |

Optional equipment - specify
Optional UL-142, DW auxiliary fuel tank with SS braided 15' of SS supply/return fuel lines |

Optional equipment - specify
Optional UL-142, DW auxiliary fuel tank with SS braided 15" of S supply/veturn fuel lines 1

Optional equipment - specify
Upgrade pump from 6JSC to 8JSVE-LHP with FT4 engine, trailer mounted 1

Optional equipment - specify
Optional corrosion resistant impeller metal for 4" and 6" pump 1

Maintenance Plan - specify
(1) Std. FPM Service for 4" and 6" Pumps |

Maintenance Plan - specify
(1 Std. FPM Service for 8", 10", 12", and 18" pumps |

Warranty - specify

Additional 12 month diesel engine warranty based on TPM service agreement |

Warranty - specify
Additional 12 month Thompson Pump warranty based on TPM service agreement 1

Warranty - specify

Thompson Pump &
Manufacturing Company,

Inc.
Southern
$38.914.00

Equal discount percentage off manufacturers current LIST pricing for any non-specified options and any additional

models and options not included.

$185.00"
$172.00"
$231.00"
$449.00'
$284.00"
$264.00"
$455.00"
$5,984.00"
$8,110.00"
$30,889.00"
$3,500.00"
$490.00'
$834.00"
$1,650.00'
1

$750.00

Std!
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6 INCH MOBILE PUMP PACKAGE
SPECIFICATION #81

2019 Thompson 6JSC
(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Thompson 6JSC purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as

awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE:

DEALER:
ZONE:

6JSC (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

Western Northern

BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Order Code

Order Code

Delete Options

‘Downgrade to 3" pump

Downgrade to 4" pump

Downgrade pump package - specify
Downgrade pump package - specify
Downgrade pump package - specify
Downgrade pump package - specify
Downgrade pump package - specify
Downgrade pump package - specify
Downgrade pump package - specify
Downgrade pump package - specify
Downgrade pump package - specify
Delete remote control

Delete option - specify

Delete option - specify

Delete option - specify

Delete option - specify

Delete option - specify

Delete option - specify

Delete option - specify

Delete option - specify

Delete option - specify

Delete option - specify

Delete option - specify

Delete option - specify

Delete option - specify

Delete option - specify

Delete option - specify

Add Options
Upgrade to 8" pump

Upgrade to 10" pump
Upgrade to 12" pump
Upgrade to aluminum sound attenuated 3" pump package
Upgrade to aluminum sound attenuated 4" pump package

Upgrade to aluminum sound attenuated 6" pump package

Central
-- No bid --

Southern
-- No bid --

All Zones

All Zones



VEHICLE: 6J5C (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central
BASE PRICE: - No bid - ~No bid - - No bid -

Upgrade to aluminum sound attenuated 8" pump package
Upgrade to aluminum sound attenuated 10" pump package
Upgrade to aluminum sound attenuated 12" pump package
Upgrade - specify

Upgrade -~ specily

- { Upgrade - specify

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade - specify

Upgrade - specify

Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specity
Optional equipment -~ specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Opticnal equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specity
Optional equipment - specify

Southern
-- No bid --




VEHICLE:

6JSC (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

DEALER:
ZONE: Western
BASE PRICE: w No bid -

Optional equipment - specify
Optiénal eciuipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment ~ specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Maintenance Plan - specify
Maintenance Plan - specify
Warranty - specify

Warranty - specify

Warranty - specify

Northern
-- No bid --

Central
-- No bid --

Southern
-- No bid --
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Municipal Sales

4620 City Center Dr., Port Orange, FL, USA 32119
(800} 767-7310 = Fax: (386) 761-0362
acurry@thompsonpump.com

FSA18-VEH16.0, Spec #81

_hrice Quote

~ Description ~ Order Codes aty FSAUmt ~ subto
i A = AL SR ot g 'Pri_i:é"-"j_’*
* There are no specified duty points for this quotation
6J5C Vehicle
ZONE: Southern
BASE PRICE: 1 | $38,914.00 | $38,914.00
Base Model includes: TPM Basic (auto start/stop control
panel with Floats/Tachometer/Hour meter/Engine Safety
Shut Down) Battery, Light package, Trailer, 24 Month
Warranty, and Operational Training
Add Options:
- Upgrade to aluminum sound attenuated 4” pump 4/6 Silent Knight 1 $9,754.00 $9,754.00
package, 4JSC-FT4/6JSC-LHP-FT4
- Optional Equipment, Optional corrosion resistant Special Metals 1 $3,500.00 $3,500.00
impeller metal for 4” and 6" pumps
- Optional Equipment, Hydraulic Brakes per axle Hydraulic Brakes 1 $895.00 $895.00
Delete Options:
- Delete Option, Downgrade pump from 6JSC to 6JSC-LHP 6JSC-FT4-LHP 1 ($2,245.00) (52,245.00)
with FT4 engine-trailer mounted from 6JSC
-+ Delete Option, Remove air/water separation chamber E-Chamber 1 ($363.00) ($363.00)
Non-Specified Add Options:
- 316 Stainless Steel Enviroprime System 1 $3,510.00 $3,510.00
+  Zinc Anodes $200.00 $200.00
Final Model: 6JSCEE-DIST-4LE2T-MC Total $54,165.00

° FOB: DESTINATION

® DELIVERY FREIGHT: INCLUDED IN BASE PRICE

L] TERMS: NET 30-DAYS (WITH APPROVED CREDIT)

DELIVERY: 12-14 WEEKS OR SOONER AFTER RECEIPT OF A HARD COPY PURCHASE ORDER

PLEASE PROVIDE ATAX EXEMPTION CERTIFICATE AT TIME OR ORDER IF APPLICABLE

NO PENALTIES OR LIQUIDATED DAMAGES ARE ACCEPTABLE

CANCELLATION OF THIS ORDER OR RETURN OF THIS UNIT MAY RESULT IN RE-STOCKING FEES

THIS QUOTE IS VALID UNTIL SEPTEMBER 30, 2019




Municipal Sales
4620 City Center Dr., Port Orange, FL, USA 32119
(800) 767-7310 = Fax: (386) 761-0362
acurry@thompsonpump.com
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May 3, 2019 Quote # WPB-AC-029-2019(revised)

City of Hollywood

Storm Water Division
1701 N. 21% Ave
Hollywood, FL 33020

PH: (954) 921-3046

M: (954) 850-4423
rawalker@hollywoodfl.org

RE: 6” Trailer-Mounted, Trash Pump
Hello Rob,

Thank you for your interest in Thompson Pump & Manufacturing and the products and the services that we
provide. Per your request, we are providing 2018 Florida Sheriffs Association Contract Specification #81 pricing for
(1) Thompson Pump Model 61SCEE-DIST-4LE2T-MC, a 6” Sound Attenuated, Compressor-Assisted, Trailer-
Mounted, High Efficiency, Low Pressure Pump. We understand this pump will be utilized by The City of Hollywood
Storm Water Division for various de-watering, flooding projects around the City.

The net price is derived from our 2018 Florida Sheriffs Association Contract Bid Award #FSA18-VEH16.0-Cab &
Chassis Trucks & Heavy Equipment. This Florida based government contract enables City of Hollywood to avoid
the hassle and expense of purchasing this pump through the public bid pracess. The FSA contract basically works
like a “piggy back” for our equipment. You can order this unit by simply putting our FSA bid award number on
your purchase order. Our FSA contract number is: FSA18-VEH16.0, Spec #81.

Should you require further information or have any questions, please contact me at the number below.

Sincerely,

At oo @W

Allan Curry

Thompson Pump & Manufacturing Co., Inc
Municipal Sales Representative

Cell: (561) 284-51489,

Email: acurry@thompsonpump.com

CC: Dave Perry, Municipal Sales Manager



Elizabeth Ducker

From: Santiago Echeverri

Sent: Monday, July 15, 2019 11,38 AM

To: Robert Walker

Cc Angel Lopez; Elizabeth Ducker, Eugene Champion

Subject: RE: pump 893

Attachments: Reso - Thompson Pump Manufacturing Co. Inc. Piggyback Underground Utilit...doc
Robert,

Please see attach proposed funding language for the pump.

Mac,

Can you please transfer 54,165.00 from 443-419901-53800-531210-000900-000-000 to 443-419901-53800-563010-
000915-000-000.

Thank you

From: Robert Walker

Sent: Wednesday, July 10, 2019 2:06 PM

To: Santiago Echeverri <SECHEVERRI@hollywoodfi.org>

Cc: Angel Lopez <ALOPEZ@hollywoodfl.org>; Elizabeth Ducker <EDUCKER@hollywoodfl.org>
Subject: FW: pump 893

Santlago,
Here’s the updated reso from my end, just needs your pertion updated.

Thanks,

Dobent ‘Watter

ety of Follywood, P '
Depantinent of Palilie Utilivics
Uondergroand Ttdities Dividion
Plione: G5¢-921- 5046

Fay: 954-967-4574

From: Angel Lopez
Sent: Wednesday, March 06, 2019 10:40 AM
To: Anthony Marucci <AMARUCCI@hollywoodfl.org>; Robert Walker <RAWALKER@hollywoodfl.org>; Francois Domond




<FDOMOND@hollywoodfl.org>
Subject: RE: pump 893

Thanks Aj

From: Anthony Marucci

Sent: Wednesday, March 06, 2019 9:48 AM
To: Robert Walker; Francois Domond

Cc: Angel Lopez

Subject: RE: pump 893

Sir,
Made contact with Thompsen pumps got ball rolling , thanks

From: Robert Walker

Sent: Wednesday, March 06, 2019 8:45 AM
To: Francois Domond

Cc: Angel Lopez; Anthony Marucci

Subject: RE: pump 893

AJ,
Please proceed to obtain a quote so we can prepare the proper documentation required for the purchasing process.

Thanks,

Robert Waller

Cety of Follywood, Tl
Depantment of Pubitée Urdeties
Underground Utileties Deviscon
Plione: 954-921-5046

Pax: G54-967-4574

From: Francois Domond

Sent: Wednesday, March 06, 2019 8:27 AM

To: Robert Walker <RAWALKER@hollywoodfl.org>

Cc: Angel Lopez <ALOPEZ@hollyweaodfl.org>; Anthony Marucci <AMARUCCI@hollywoodfl.org>
Subject: RE: pump 893

Yeg

From: Robert Walker

Sent: Wednesday, March 06, 2019 8:21 AM

To: Francois Domond <FDOMOND&hollywoodfl.org>

Cc: Angel Lopez <ALOPEZ @hotlywoodfl.org>; Anthony Marucci <AMARUCCI@hollywoodfl.org>
Subject: FW: pump 893




Francois,

We have a 6” trash pump ( unit 893 ) that was brought to the garage for repairs. The garage deemed it not repairable.
Would we be able to replace this pump?

Thanks,

Bobent Walken

ety of Folltywood, Ft
Depantment of Pablie Utdities
Undergroand Urilities Division
Plhone: 954-9E1-3046

Fav: Go5q-967-4574

From: Anthony Marucci

Sent: Wednesday, March 06, 2019 7:52 AM

To: Robert Walker <RAWALKER@hollvwoodfl.org>
Cc: Angel Lopez <ALOPEZ@hollywoodfl.org>
Subject: pump 893

Sir,
This pump has been condemned by the garage and sending you this to see about getting a replacement

ANTHONY (&J) MARUCCH,

UTILITIES OPERATION SUPERVISOR
PHONE 954-921-3046

FAX 9534-967-4574

EMAIL AMARUCCI@HOLLYWOODFL.ORG




