PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
215 Manatee Avenue West
Bradenton, Florida 34205
Direct Line (941) 708-8770 FAX Line (941) 708-8485

Renewal Amendment, Park and Playground Equipment, SDMC No.
16-0025-MR, Renewal 1

This Amendment to Park and Playground Equipment, SDMC no. 16-0025-MR (*Contract) Is made and entered into as
of the last date signed below by and between The School District of Manatee County ("District” and Bliss Products and
Services ("Contractor”). District and Contractor are collectively referred to herein as the "Parties.” All capitalized terms
used herein shall have the meaning assigned to them in the Contract, unless otherwise defined herein,

Contract Renewal:
The District hereby executes its first renewal option for a period of September 9, 2018 through September 8,
2019 years. The new expiration date is September 8, 2019,

Conflict of Terms:
To the extent any of the terms of this agreement conflict with the terms of the contract, the terms of this
agreement shall control. All other terms of the contract remain in full force.

Warranty of Authority:
Each person signing this Agreement warrants that he or she is duly authorized to do so and to bind the

respective party.

Equal Employment Opportunity:
Except as otherwise provided under 41 CFR Part 60, all contracts that meet the definition of “federally assisted
construction contract” in 41 CFR Part 60-1.3 must include the equal opportunity clause provided under 41
CFR 60~1.4(b), in accordance with Executive Order 11244, “Equal Employment Opportunity” (30 FR 12319,
12935, 3 CFR Part, 1964~ 1965 Comp., p. 339), as amended by Executive Order 11375, “Amending Executive
Order 11246 Relating to Equal Employment Opportunity,” and implementing regulations at 41 CFR part 40,
“Office of Federal Contract Compliance Programs, Equal Employment Opportunity, Department of Labor.”

Anti-Discrimination:

a. the bidder certifies that they are in compliance with the non-discrimination clause contained in Section 202,
Executive Order 11244, as amended by Executive Order 11375 relative to equal employment opportunity for
all persons without regard to race, colar, religion, sex or national origin. The provisions of the ADA Act of 1990
pertaining to employment shall also be applicable.

b. the bidder shall not discriminate on the basis of race, gender, gender identity or expresslon, refigion, national
origin, ethnicity, sexual orientation, age or disability in the solicitation, selection, hiring, or treatment of sub-
contractors, vendors, suppliers, or commercial customers. Bidder shall provide equal opportunity for sub-
contractors to participate in all of its public sector and private sector sub-contracting opportunities, provided
that nothing contained in this clause shall prohibit or limit otherwise lawful efforts to remedy the effects of
marketplace discrimination that has occurred or is occurring in the marketplace. Bidder understands and agrees
that violation of this clause is a material breach of the contract and may result in contract determination,
debarment, or other sanctions

Minority, Small, and Women Owned Business:
School District of Manatee County encourages the use of Minority Owned Businesses, Small Businesses, and

Women Owned Businesses. Contractor agrees to ensure small businesses, minority owned businesses and
women's business enterprises are used whenever possible, such as when participation as partners, joint-
venture's, prime contractor, sub-contractors, and in contracting opportunities.

Davis-Bacon Act: as amended (40 U.S.C. 3141-3148):

Page 1of4
Revised 2/28/18 CFR 200



Renewal Amendment Continued
Bid/RFP Park and Playground, SDMC No. 16-0025-MR

When required by Federal program legislation, all prime construction contracts in excess of $2,000 awarded
by non-Federal entities must include a provision for compliance with the Davis-Bacon Act (40 US.C. 3141-
3144, and 3146-3148) as supplemented by Department of Labor regulations (29 CFR Part 5, “Labor Standards
Provisions Applicable to Contracts Covering Federally Financed and Assisted Construction™). In accordance
with the statute, contractors must be required to pay wages to laborers and mechanics at a rate not less than
the prevalling wages specified in a wage determination made by the Secretary of Labor. In addition, contractors
must be required to pay wages not less than once a week. The non-Federal entity must place a copy of the
current prevailing wage determination issued by the Department of Labor in each solicitation. The decision to
award a contract or subcontract must be conditioned upon the acceptance of the wage determination. The
non-Federal entity must report all suspected or reported violations to the Federal awarding agency. The
contracts must also include a provision for compliance with the Copeland “Antiickback” Act (40 U.S.C. 3145),
as supplemented by Department of Labor regulations

Contract Work Hours and Safety Standards Act (40 U.S.C. 3701-3708):

Where applicable, all contracts awarded by the nonfederal entity in excess of $100,000 that involve the
employment of mechanics or laborers must include a provision for compliance with 40 U.S.C. 3702 and 3704,
as supplemented by Department of Labor regulations (29 CFR Part 5). Under 40 U.5.C. 3702 of the Act, each
contractor must be required to compute the wages of every mechanic and laborer on the basis of a standard
workweek of 40 hours. Work In excess of the standard workweek is permissible provided that the worker is
compensated at a rate of not less than one and a half times the basic rate of pay for all hours worked in excess
of 40 hours in the workweek. The requirements of 40 U.S.C. 3704 are applicable to construction work and
provide that no laborer or mechanic must be required to work in surroundings or under working conditions,
which are unsanitary, hazardous, or dangerous. These requirements do not apply to the purchases of supplies
or materials or articles ordinarily available on the open market, or contracts for transportation or transmission
of intelligence.

Rights to Inventions Made Under a Contract or Agreement:
If the Federal award meets the definition of “funding agreement” under 37 CFR §401.2 (a) and the recipient or
sub recipient wishes to enter into a contract with a small business firm or nonprofit organization regarding the
substitution of partles, assignment or performance of experimental, developmental, or research work under
that “funding agreement,” the recipient or sub recipient must comply with the requirements of 37 CFR Part
401, "Rights to Inventions Made by Nonprofit Organizations and Small Business Firms Under Government
Grants, Contracts and Cooperative Agreements,” and any implementing regulations issued by the awarding

agency.

Clean Alr Act {42 U.S.C. 7401-7671q.) and the Federal Water Pollution Control Act {33U.5.C. 1251-1387):

As amended—Contracts and sub grants of amounts in excess of $150,000 must contain a provision that
requires the non-Federal award to agree to comply with all applicable standards, orders or regulations issued
pursuant to the Clean Air Act (42 U.S.C. 7401-7671q) and the Federal Water Pollution Control Act as amended
{33 U.S.C. 1251-1387). Violations must be reported to the Federal awarding agency and the Regional Office
of the Environmental Protection Agency (EPA). Mandatory standards and policies relating to energy efficiency
which are contained in the state energy conservation plan issued in compliance with the Energy Policy and
Conservation Act (42 U.S.C. 6201).

Debarment and Suspension (Executive Orders 12549 and 12689);
A contract award (see 2 CFR 180.220) must not be made to parties listed on the government wide Excluded
Parties List System in the System for Award Management (SAM), in accordance with the OMB guidelines at 2
CFR 180 that implement Executive Orders 12549 (3 CFR Part 1986 Comp., p. 189) and 12689 (3 CFR Part
1989 Comp., p. 235), “Debarment and Suspension.” The Excluded Parties List System in SAM contains the
names of parties debarred, suspended, or otherwise excluded by agencies, as well as parties declared ineligible
under statutory or regulatory authority other than Executive Order 12549.

Byrd Anti-Lobbying Amendment (31 U.5.C. 1352):
Contractors that apply or bid for an award of $100,000 or more must file the required certification. Each tier
certifies to the tier above that it will not and has not used Federal appropriated funds to pay any person or
organization for influencing or attempting to influence an officer or employee of any agency, a member of
Congress, officer or employee of Congress, or an employee of a member of Congress in connection with
obtaining any Federal contract, grant or any other award covered by 31 U.S.C. 1352. Each tier must also
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Renewal Amendment Continued
Bid/RFP Park and Playground Equipment, SDMC No. 16-0025-MR

disclose any lobbying with non-Federal funds that takes place in connection with obtaining any Federal award.
Such disclosures are forwarded from tier to tier up to the non-Federal award.

Section 6002 of The Solid Waste Disposal Act:

The requirements of Section 6002 include procuring only items designated in guidelines of the Environmental
Protection Agency (EPA) at 40 CFR Part 247 that contain the highest percentage of recovered materials
practicable, consistent with maintaining a satisfactory level of competition, where the purchase price of the
item exceeds $10,000 or the value of the quantity acquired during the preceding fiscal year exceeded $10,000;
procuring solid waste Mmanagement services in a manner that maximizes energy and resource recovery; and
establishing an affirmative procurement program for procurement of recovered materials identified in the EPA
guidelines. (78 FR 78608, Dec. 26, 2013, as amended at 79 FR 75885, Dec. 19,2014).

Record Retention Requirements for Contracts Paid for with Federal Funds 2 CFR §200.333:
When federal funds are expended by HCPS for any contract resulting from this procurement process, the
vendor certifies that it will comply with the record retention requirements detailed in 2 CFR §200.333. The
vendor further certifies that vendor will retain all records as required by 2 CFR §200.333 for a period of three
years after grantees or sub-grantees submit final expenditure reports or quarterly or annual financial reports,
as applicable, and all other pending matters are closed.

SIGNATURES:
CONTRACTOR:
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Superintendent Date
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The current awarded tabulation Is posted on the Purchasing website:
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Renewal Amendment Continued
Bid/RFP Park and Playground, SDMC No. 16-0025-MR

www.manateeschools.net

If you do not agree to this renewal, please indicate on this renewal agreement and return to Purchasing Department.
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Posted 8/7/15 at 12:15 pm

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

BID ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

CONTRACT PERIOD: SEPTEMBER 9, 2015 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 8, 2018

BOARD APPROVED ON SEPTEMBER 8, 2015

CONTRACT PERIOD: SEPTEMBER 9, 2018 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 8, 2019

BOARD APPROVED ON August 28, 2018
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS: FL. ITEM 1: PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT ITEM 1: INSTALLATION Sub
PREF. Catalog Name Number Discount Certifications Mark Up % Subcontractor Certifications
FL Brevard  |Advanced Recreational Concepts, LLC *
FL Sarasota  [Apollo Sunguard Systems Inc *
GA Bliss Products and Services Inc
FL Hillsborough [Florida Playstructures and Water Features Inc *
FL Citrus Gulf Coast Sports LLC *
WA Kompan Inc
FL Miami-Dade |Leadex Corperation *
FL Manatee  [Miller Recreation Equipment & Design *
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR
Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS: FL. ITEM 1: PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT ITEM 1: INSTALLATION Sub
PREF. Catalog Name Number Discount Certifications Mark Up % Subcontractor Certifications
MO Miracle Recreation Equipment Company
TN Playcore Wisconsin DBA GameTime Inc
FL Lee Playmore West Inc *
GA PPLPT Farmington Inc/ Playworx Playsets LLC
FL Pinellas Project Innovations LLC *
FL Martin RCP Shelters Inc * No Bid No Bid No Bid
FL Sarasota  |Recycled Plastic Factory LLC * No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 *
FL Seminole Rep Services Inc
FL [Saint Johns Shade America Inc * No Bid No Bid No Bid
FL |Marion Shade Systems Inc * No Bid No Bid No Bid
FL |Brevard Southern Park and Play Systems *
FL Collier Swartz Associates Inc *
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS: ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT ITEM 2: INSTALLATION
Catalog Name Number Discount Certifications Mark Up % Subcontractor Certifications
FL Brevard  |Advanced Recreational Concepts, LLC
FL Sarasota  |Apollo Sunguard Systems Inc
GA Bliss Products and Services Inc
FL Hillsborough |Florida Playstructures and Water Features Inc
FL Citrus Gulf Coast Sports LLC
WA Kompan Inc
FL Miami-Dade |Leadex Corperation No Bid No Bid No Bid
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS: ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT ITEM 2: INSTALLATION
Catalog Name Number Discount Certifications Mark Up % Subcontractor Certifications
FL Manatee  [Miller Recreation Equipment & Design *
MO Miracle Recreation Equipment Company
TN Playcore Wisconsin DBA GameTime Inc
FL Lee Playmore West Inc *
GA PPLPT Farmington Inc/ Playworx Playsets LLC
FL Pinellas Project Innovations LLC *
FL Martin RCP Shelters Inc *
FL Sarasota  |Recycled Plastic Factory LLC *
FL |Seminole Rep Services Inc *
FL [Saint Johns Shade America Inc * No Bid No Bid No Bid
FL [Marion Shade Systems Inc * No Bid No Bid No Bid
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS: ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT ITEM 2: INSTALLATION
Catalog Name Number Discount Certifications Mark Up % Subcontractor Certifications

FL |Brevard Southern Park and Play Systems *

FL Collier Swartz Associates Inc *
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS: ITEM 3: SURFACING MATERIALS ITEM 3: INSTALLATION
Catalog Name Number Discount Certifications Mark Up % Subcontractor Certifications
FL Brevard  |Advanced Recreational Concepts, LLC *
FL Sarasota  [Apollo Sunguard Systems Inc *
GA Bliss Products and Services Inc
FL Hillsborough [Florida Playstructures and Water Features Inc *
FL Citrus Gulf Coast Sports LLC *
WA Kompan Inc
FL Miami-Dade |[Leadex Corporation *
FL Manatee  [Miller Recreation Equipment & Design *
MO Miracle Recreation Equipment Company
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS: ITEM 3: SURFACING MATERIALS ITEM 3: INSTALLATION
Catalog Name Number Discount Certifications Mark Up % Subcontractor Certifications
TN Playcore Wisconsin DBA GameTime Inc
FL Lee Playmore West Inc *
GA PPLPT Farmington Inc/ Playworx Playsets LLC
FL Pinellas Project Innovations LLC *
FL Martin RCP Shelters Inc * No Bid No Bid No Bid
FL Sarasota  [Recycled Plastic Factory LLC * No Bid No Bid
FL . Rep Services Inc * No Bid
Seminole
FL |Saint Johns Shade America Inc * No Bid No Bid No Bid
FL |Marion Shade Systems Inc * No Bid No Bid No Bid
FL (Brevard Southern Park and Play Systems *
FL Collier Swartz Associates Inc *
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS: ITEM 4: SHADE STRUCTURE ITEM 4: INSTALLATION
Catalog Name Number Discount Certifications Mark Up % Subcontractor Certifications
FL Brevard  |Advanced Recreational Concepts, LLC *
FL Sarasota  |Apollo Sunguard Systems Inc *
GA Bliss Products and Services Inc
FL Hillsborough [Florida Playstructures and Water Features Inc *
FL Citrus Gulf Coast Sports LLC *
WA Kompan Inc
FL Miami-Dade |[Leadex Corporation *
FL Manatee  [Miller Recreation Equipment & Design *
MO Miracle Recreation Equipment Company
TN Playcore Wisconsin DBA GameTime Inc
FL Lee Playmore West Inc *
GA PPLPT Farmington Inc/ Playworx Playsets LLC
FL Pinellas Project Innovations LLC * No Bid No Bid No Bid
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS: ITEM 4: SHADE STRUCTURE ITEM 4: INSTALLATION
Catalog Name Number Discount Certifications Mark Up % Subcontractor Certifications
FL Martin RCP Shelters Inc *
FL Sarasota  |Recycled Plastic Factory LLC *
FL |Seminole Rep Services Inc *
FL |Saint Johns Shade America Inc *
FL [Marion Shade Systems Inc *
FL (Brevard Southern Park and Play Systems *
FL Collier Swartz Associates Inc *
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

ITEM 5: REPAIRS
HOURLY RATE

State County BIDDERS:
FL Brevard  |Advanced Recreational Concepts, LLC
FL Sarasota  [Apollo Sunguard Systems Inc
GA Bliss Products and Services Inc
FL Hillsborough [Florida Playstructures and Water Features Inc
FL Citrus Gulf Coast Sports LLC
WA Kompan Inc
FL Miami-Dade |[Leadex Corporation
FL Manatee  [Miller Recreation Equipment & Design
MO Miracle Recreation Equipment Company
TN Playcore Wisconsin DBA GameTime Inc
FL Lee Playmore West Inc
GA PPLPT Farmington Inc/ Playworx Playsets LLC
FL Martin RCP Shelters Inc
FL Sarasota  [Recycled Plastic Factory LLC
FL [Seminole Rep Services Inc

ITEM 6:
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS: ITEM 5: REPAIRS ITEM 6:
HOURLY RATE PERCENTAGE MARK
UP FOR REPAIR
MATERIAL
FL |Saint Johns Shade America Inc * $250.00 No Bid
FL |Marion Shade Systems Inc * No Bid No Bid
FL |Brevard Southern Park and Play Systems * $75.00 30.00%
FL Collier Swartz Associates Inc * $200.00 No Bid
NOTES:

* ldentified Florida as the principal place of business.
1) $55.0 per CF blown in.
2) As per attached contract pricing catalog.
3) Fixed percentage will be 65% of installed with Blower Truck
4) Poured in place rubber surfacing and artificial turf are quoted as " delivered and Installed"
5) Installation percentage covers erection of structure only. It does not include site work or any concrete foundations. That is priced per job.
6) Apollo Sunguard Systems is the manufacturer.
7) There is no install certification for site furnishing.
8) Certification for installation not available.
9) 45% erection only. Footers quoted per job. Engineering not included.
10) Kompan has not submitted a percentage on this request. Our subcontractors do not calculate their cost to install surfacing based upon the price of the materials. Each type of surfacing is calculated in a different manner.
Mat installation is based upon each unit-$35.00 per unit
Border installation is based upon each unit -$15.00 per unit
Pour in Place Rubber pricing includes installation of the surfacing- there is not a separate line item charge for installation
Engineered Wood Fiber installation is based upon cubic yard- $16.00 per cubic yard
Rubber Tile installation is based upon square footage- $3.00 per square foot
Rubber Mulch installation is based upon square footage-$10.00 per square foot
We are willing to extend a fixed 4% discount to the retail price of these installation services.
11) for Greenfield
12) List includes materials and Installation. Based on Thickness, Fall Height and quantity
13) Pricing listed in bid. Installed by Leadex.
14) 8% $0-$4999
12% $5000-$9999
159% $10000-$14999
18% $15000-$24999
20% $25000-Above. Discount does not include freight, specials, parts
15) Bleachers. Discount does not include freight, specials, parts
16) Discount not on freight
17) Installation by No Fault included
18) No discount for parts
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR
Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

NOTES:

19) Caries-Install prices noted on price sheet/catalog where applicable

20) We are the Manufacturer

21) Installation by manufacture

22) USA Shade & Porter/Parasol don not require certified installers

23) Installation 30 % on full playground units. All other items would be priced per item and varies in costs.

24) Provided by manufacture

25) No manufacture certifications are required for site equipment installation

26) Installation costs would be priced per items needing installation and varies in price depending what is required
27) Certification not required for wood fiber and rubber mulch

28) Installation cost would vary based on type of materials being installed and what is required for installation

29) Installation costs vary by items ordered and what is required by installation

30) $800.00 minimum charge for installation

31) Prepay and add freight for all manufacturers

32) Any permitting requirements and costs (if applicable) will incur an additional fee. All jobsite insurance requirements supplied by Kennico Inc
33) Does not exist for these products

34) All jobsite insurance requirements supplied by Kennico Inc

NON-RESPONSIVE
a) Vendor did not submit requested markup.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under chapter

120, Florida Statutes.
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