From:

Owner:

Engineer:

Plans:

Location:

Proposal
Date:

City of Hollywood
Hollywood Blvd. Festoon Lighting

Guaranteed Maximum Price

Burkhardt Construction, Inc.
Attn: Marc Kleisley

1400 Alabama Ave., Suite #20
West Palm Beach, FL 33401
Tel: (561) 659-1400

Fax: (561) 659-1402

City of Hollywood, C.R.A.
Attn: Moshe Anuar, P.E.
1948 Harrison Street
Hollywood, FL 33020
Tel: (954) 924-2980

Fax: (954) 924-2981

Kimley-Horn

Attn: James Pankonin, PLA, LEED AP
1777 Main Street, Suite 200
Sarasota, FL 34236

Tel: (941) 379-7620

Hollywood Blvd. Festoon Lighting

Hollywood Blvd. from 21st Avenue to 19th Avenue

Hollywood, FL

6/19/2017; Rev. 6/20/17

CCTV Camera Poles, conduit and wire installation

Festoon lighting and landscape improvements

Total Guaranteed Maximum Price

134,248.93

984,492.12

$ 1,118,741.05

BURKHARDT
CONSTRUCTION, INC.
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From:

Owner:

Engineer:

Plans:

Location:

Proposal
Date:

City of Hollywood
Hollywood Blvd. Festoon Lighting

Guaranteed Maximum Price

Burkhardt Construction, Inc.
Attn: Marc Kleisley

1400 Alabama Ave., Suite #20
West Palm Beach, FL 33401
Tel: (561) 659-1400

Fax: (561) 659-1402

City of Hollywood, C.R.A.
Attn: Moshe Anuar, P.E.
1948 Harrison Street
Hollywood, FL 33020
Tel: (954) 924-2980

Fax: (954) 924-2981

Kimley-Horn

Attn: James Pankonin, PLA, LEED AP
1777 Main Street, Suite 200

Sarasota, FL 34236

Tel: (941) 379-7620

Hollywood Blvd. Festoon Lighting
Hollywood Blvd. from 21st Avenue to 19th Avenue

Hollywood, FL

6/19/2017; Rev. 6/20/17

Direct Construction Cost

General Conditions

Construction Management Fee

Profit

Contingency

Preconstruction Services

Exceptions & Clarifications

Plan Log

Total Guaranteed Maximum Price

$ 932,800.73
$ 52,990.31
$ 27,950.00
$ 75,000.00
$ 25,000.00

$ 5,000.00

$ 1,118,741.05

BURKHARDT
CONSTRUCTION, INC.
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City of Hollywood
Hollywood Blvd. Festoon Lighting

GENERAL CONDITIONS

From: Burkhardt Construction, Inc.
Attn: Marc Kleisley
1400 Alabama Ave., Suite #20
West Palm Beach, FL 33401
Tel: (561) 659-1400
Fax: (561) 659-1402

Owner: City of Hollywood, C.R.A.
Attn: Moshe Anuar, P.E.
1948 Harrison Street
Hollywood, FL 33020
Tel: (954) 924-2980
Fax: (954) 924-2981

Engineer: Kimley-Horn
Attn: James Pankonin, PLA, LEED AP
1777 Main Street, Suite 200
Sarasota, FL 34236
Tel: (941) 379-7620

Project: Hollywood Blvd. Festoon Lighting
Location: Hollywood Blvd. from 21st Avenue to 19th Avenue
Hollywood, FL
Proposal
. 6/19/2017; Rev. 6/20/17
Date:
Item Description Amount
MOBILIZATION (move-in, move-out) $0.00
TRANSPORT $65.00 / Hr X 0 $0.00
EQUIPMENT $35.00/  Hr. X 0 $0.00

SUBCONTRACTOR MOBILIZATION(S)
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Item Description Amount

PROJECT FIELD OFFICE | $3,000.00
OFFICE $1,000.00/  mo. X 0 $0.00
YARD $1,000.00 /  mo. X 0 $0.00
EMPLOYEE PARKING FEES $500.00 /  mo. X 0 $0.00
WORK PLATFORM FOR YARD $200.00 /  mo. X 0 $0.00
TEMPORARY FENCING FOR YARD $500.00 /  mo. X 0 $0.00
CONSTRUCTION YARD LIGHTING $0.00/  mo. X 0 $0.00
OFFICE FURNISHINGS $500.00 /  mo. X 0 $0.00
COMPUTERS $300.00/  mo. X 0 $0.00
PROCORE MANAGEMENT SOFTWARE $500.00 /  mo. X 3 $1,500.00
SUBMITTAL SOFTWARE $1,500.00/ Is X 0 $0.00
COPY MACHINE $350.00/  mo. X 0 $0.00
FAX MACHINE $100.00 /  mo. X 0 $0.00
INTERNET SERVICE $150.00/  mo. X 0 $0.00
CELLULAR TELEPHONE $500.00 /  mo. X 0 $0.00
TELEPHONE $150.00/  mo. X 0 $0.00
FEDERAL EXPRESS MAILINGS $100.00 /  mo. X 0 $0.00
POSTAGE $50.00 /  mo. X 0 $0.00
PHOTOGRAPHS

AERIAL PHOTOS $110.00/  mo. X 0 $0.00

JOB PHOTOS $50.00 /  wk X 0 $0.00

PRE-CONSTRUCTION VIDEO $1,500.00/ Is X 1 $1,500.00
PLAN REPRODUCTION COST/PRINTING $200.00 /  set X 0 $0.00
OFFICE SUPPLIES $50.00 /  mo. X 0 $0.00
FIRST AID SUPPLIES $50.00 /  mo. X 0 $0.00
WATER SERVICE $35.00/  mo. X 0 $0.00
SANITARY SERVICE $50.00 /  mo. X 0 $0.00
ELECTRIC SERVICE $200.00/  mo. X 0 $0.00
GARBAGE SERVICE $25.00/  mo. X 0 $0.00
CONSTRUCTION WATER $500.00 /  mo. X 0 $0.00
JOHN DEERE GATOR (1) $500.00 /  mo. X 0 $0.00
ICE $275.00/  mo. X 0 $0.00

BONDS [ $13,984.25
GENERAL BOND $1,118,740.00 x  1.25% $13,984.25

SUBCONTRACTORS BONDS

PARTNERING INITIATIVES $0.00
NOTICES, LETTERS, INFORMATION MEETINGS not included

INSURANCE | $21,256.06
GENERAL INSURANCE $1,118,740.00 x  1.90% $21,256.06

Commercial General Liability
Comprehensive Automobile Liability
Owner Idemnification

Professional (Errors/Omissions) Liability
Excess/Umbrella Liability

ADD'L INSUREDS $100.00 /  ea. X 0 $0.00
ADDED INSURANCES NOT INCLUDED
Railroad protective Liability Ins. NOT INCLUDED
Builders Risk Insurance NOT INCLUDED
Installation Floater NOT INCLUDED
Flood Insurance NOT INCLUDED
SUBCONTRACTORS' INSURANCE INCLUDED IN THEIR DIRECT COSTS
SANITARY SERVICES [ $750.00 |
JOB TOILET (2ea.) $250.00 /  mo. X 3 $750.00
TESTING COSTS $1,500.00
DENSITIES
PRESSURE

RKHARDT
CONSTRUCTION, INC.
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Item Description Amount

PROCTORS
BACTERIOLOGICAL
CONCRETE CYLINDERS
ENGINEERING & REPORTING
TV'ING OF INSTALLED LINES

FEES [ $0.00 |
COH BUILDING DEPT. PERMIT/REVISION x  2.00% NO FEE ANTICIPATED
PERMIT SUBMISSION AND EXPEDITING $0.00
FDOT GENERAL USE PERMITS NO FEE ANTICIPATED
SURVEYING [ $10,000.00
LAYOUT & ASBUILTS $500,000.00 x  1.50% $7,500.00
ALLOWANCE FOR RESTAKING $2,500.00 / LS X 1 $2,500.00
& DRAFTING
SMALL HAND TOOLS/EQUIPMENT RENTAL $2,500.00
ALLOWANCE (GENERAL)
HANDLING, STORAGE, UN-LOADING OF OWNER DIRECT PURCHASE MATERIALS $2,500.00
GENERAL CONDITIONS TOTAL $52,990.31

RKHARDT
CONSTRUCTION, INC.
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From:

Owner:

Engineer:

Plans:

Location:

Proposal

Due Date:

City of Hollywood

Hollywood Blvd. Festoon Lighting

CONSTRUCTION MANAGEMENT FEE

Burkhardt Construction, Inc.
Attn: Marc Kleisley

1400 Alabama Ave., Suite #20
West Palm Beach, FL 33401
Tel: (561) 659-1400

Fax: (561) 659-1402

City of Hollywood, C.R.A.
Attn: Moshe Anuar, P.E.
1948 Harrison Street
Hollywood, FL 33020
Tel: (954) 924-2980

Fax: (954) 924-2981

Kimley-Horn

Attn: James Pankonin, PLA, LEED AP
1777 Main Street, Suite 200
Sarasota, FL 34236

Tel: (941) 379-7620

Hollywood Blvd. Festoon Lighting

Hollywood Blvd. from 21st Avenue to 19th Avenue
Hollywood, FL

6/19/2017; Rev. 6/20/17

EXHIBIT "C"

Item Description Quantity (Hrs./week)  WKs. Rate/Hr.

Amount

Assistant Project Manager 10 Hrs./WKk. 13 $ 75.00

Construction Field Manager 14 Hrs./WKk. 13 $ 100.00

Total Construction Management Fee

BURKHARDT
CONSTRUCTION, INC.

$ 9,750.00

$ 18,200.00

$ 27,950.00
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City of Hollywood

Hollywood Blvd. Festoon Lighting
Direct Construction Cost

Prepared by Burkhardt Construction, Inc.

EXHIBIT "A"

6/20/2017

BURKHARDT

CONSTRUCTION, INC,

Item Description Quantity U/M Unit Price Amount Labor Equipment Material Subcontractor  General/Rental Subtotal
MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC $25,000.00 ALLOW 25000 25000
DEMOLITION/CLEARING & GRUBBING $93,335.50
NPDES FILING AND REPORTING 1|EA $2,500.00( $ 2,500.00 BCI 2500 2500
FLOWABLE CONCRETE BACKFILL IN TRENCH 50|CY $150.00| $ 7,500.00 ALLOW 7500 7500
FURNISH AND INSTALL SILT FENCE 1|LS $2,500.00( $ 2,500.00 ARAZOZA 2500 2500
FURNISH AND INSTALL INLET PROTECTION 1|LS $2,500.00| $ 2,500.00 ARAZOZA 2500 2500
SAWCUT EXISTING CONCRETE 450|LF $10.00( $ 4,500.00 ARAZOZA 4500 4500
REMOVE EXISTING CONCRETE HEADER CURB 142|LF $20.00| $ 2,840.00 ARAZOZA 2840 2840
REMOVE EXISTING CONCRETE SIDEWALK 95|SF $11.30( $ 1,073.50 ARAZOZA 1073.5 1073.5
REMOVE EXISTING PAVER SIDEWALK 1431|SF $7.00| $ 10,017.00 ARAZOZA 10017 10017
RESTORE EXISTING CONCRETE SIDEWALK 140(SF $17.86| $ 2,500.00 ALLOW 2500 2500
RESTORE EXISTING PAVER SIDEWALK 1250(SF $10.00| $ 12,500.00 ALLOW 12500 12500
RESTORE EXISTING ASPHALT PAVEMENT 100(SF $50.00( $ 5,000.00 ALLOW 5000 5000
CUT, CAP & RECONNECT WATER SERVICE TO DRINKING FOUNTAIN 4|EA $750.00| $ 3,000.00 ARAZOZA 3000 3000
REMOVE, RELOCATE & RE-INSTALL EXISTING ADA DRINKING FOUNTAIN 4|EA $2,000.00( $ 8,000.00 ARAZOZA 8000 8000
REMOVE, RELOCATE & RE-INSTALL EXISTING ADA PARKING SIGN & POST 4|EA $600.00| $ 2,400.00 ARAZOZA 2400 2400
PROTECT EXISTING VALVE BOX 4|EA $100.00| $ 400.00 ARAZOZA 400 400
REMOVE EXISTING SHRUBS 7160|SF $0.50| $ 3,580.00 ARAZOZA 3580 3580
REMOVE EXISTING TREE 13|EA $1,000.00( $ 13,000.00 ARAZOZA 13000 13000
PROTECT EXISTING TREE 127|EA $75.00| $ 9,525.00 ARAZOZA 9525 9525
EARTHWORK AND GRADING $5,625.00
EXCAVATE & GRADE PLANTING PITS, REMOVE & DISPOSE EXCESS MATERIAL OFFSITE 125|CY $45.00( $ 5,625.00 ARAZOZA 5625 5625
WATER / SEWER / DRAINAGE $39,380.00
PROVIDE UNDERDRAIN IN NEW PLANTING PITS & CONNECT TO ADJACENT STORM DRAIN 22|EA $1,790.00| $ 39,380.00 ARAZOZA 39380 39380
LANDSCAPE AND IRRIGATION $238,988.00
FURNISH AND INSTALL FLEXIPAVE NOT INCLUDED
CODIAEUM VARIEGATUM 'MAMMEY", 7 GAL 30" HT MIN 53|EA $30.00( $ 1,590.00 ARAZOZA 1590 1590
DURANTA REPENS 'GOLD MOUND', 3 GAL 14" FULL 81|EA $8.00| $ 648.00 ARAZOZA 648 648
FICUS MICROCARPA 'GREEN ISLAND' 3 GAL 14" FULL 30" O.C. 730|EA $8.00| $ 5,840.00 ARAZOZA 5840 5840
PHILODENDRON XANADU 3 GAL 14" FULL 30" O.C. 296|EA $10.00| $ 2,960.00 ARAZOZA 2960 2960
BISMARCKIA NOBILIS 'SILVER' FIELD MATCHED CHARACTER FG HEAVY 20 CT MIN 14' SPR 31|EA $2,500.00( $ 77,500.00
MIN ARAZOZA 77500 77500
PHOENIX DACTILIFERA MEJDOOL FIELD MATCHED CHARACTER FG HEAVY 20 CT MIN 14’ 11|EA $6,250.00( $ 68,750.00
SPR MIN ARAZOZA 68750 68750
ROYSTONEA REGIA FIELD MATCHED CHARACTER FG HEAVY 20' GW MIN 14' SPR 14/EA $2,000.00( $ 28,000.00 ARAZOZA 28000 28000
FURNISH & INSTALL 3" MULCH AS SPECIFIED AT ALL NEWLY PLANTED TREES, PALMS, 80|CY $30.00( $ 2,400.00
PLANTING BEDS AND SHRUBS ARAZOZA 2400 2400
FURNISH & INSTALL ALL PLANTING SOILS AS SPECIFIED IN THE NEW PLANTING PITS (24" 125|CY $35.00( $ 4,375.00
DEEP) ARAZOZA 4375 4375
FURNISH & INSTALL ROOT BARRIER 24" DEEP 735|LF $15.00( $ 11,025.00 ARAZOZA 11025 11025
FURNISH & INSTALL ALL PRE & POST EMERGENTS, SOIL AMENDMENTS, AND FERTILIZER 1|LS $3,000.00| $ 3,000.00
AS REQUIRED ARAZOZA 3000 3000
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EXHIBIT "A"

6/20/2017

BURKHARDT

CONSTRUCTION, INC,

Item Description Quantity U/M Unit Price Amount Labor Equipment Material Subcontractor ~ General/Rental Subtotal
FURNISH & INSTALL TREE BRACING & PROTECTIVE CAGE AS PER DETAIL 6/LS-150 FOR 56|EA $60.00( $ 3,360.00
ALL NEWLY INSTALLED TREES & PALMS ARAZOZA 3360 3360
SELECTIVE PRUNING WITH A CERTIFIED ARBORIST TO EXISTING TREES / PALMS AS 1|LS $6,000.00( $ 6,000.00 ARAZOZA 6000 6000
NEEDED FOR FESTOON / CURTAIN LIGHTING INSTALLATION. TREE / PALM TRIMMING TO
BE PERFORMED SIMULTANEOUSLY WITH FESTOON / CURTAIN LIGHT INSTALLATION
FURNISH & INSTALL ALL PRE & POST EMERGENTS, SOIL AMENDMENTS, AND FERTILIZER 1|LS INCLUDED INCLUDED ARAZOZA INCL 0
AS REQUIRED
FURNISH & INSTALL PALM STAKING - TREE FROG AS PER ALT. DETAIL 9/LS-150 FOR ALL 1|LS $5,040.00| $ 5,040.00
NEWLY INSTALLED TREES & PALMS ARAZOZA 5040 5040
IRRIGATION SYSTEM COMPLETE (INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO) 1|LS $18,500.00| $ 18,500.00 ARAZOZA 18500 18500
EXISTING SHRUB SPRAY: REPLACE NON-FUNCTIONING IRRIGATION SPRAY HEADS &
COMPONENTS AS NECESSARY TO ENSURE IRRIGATION SYSTEM PROVIDES 100% HEAD
TO HEAD COVERAGE OF THE PROPOSED PLANT MATERIAL.NEW IRRIGATION BUBBLER
TO MATCH EXISTING: PROPOSED TREE IS LOCATED IN AN EXISTING TREE PLANTER
THAT IS BELIEVED TO HAVE IRRIGATION. FIELD VERIFY IF ANY ADDITIONAL LATERAL
PIPING IS NEEDED AND TIE INTO EXISTING IRRIGATION SYSTEM AS REQUIRED IF NO
IRRIGATION EXIST IN THE PLANTER. NEW IRRIGATION BUBBLER TO MATCH EXISTING:
PROPOSED TREE IS LOCATED IN A NEW TREE PLANTER. PROVIDE NEW LATERAL PIPE
AND SLEEVING AS NEEDED TO TIE INTO EXISTING IRRIGATION SYSTEM
ELECTRICAL $530,472.23
OWNER FURNISHED CCTV POLE 4|EA NIC NIC COH PREVIOUSLY ORDERED 0
OWNER FURNISHED FESTOON LIGHTING POLE AND CURTAIN LIGHTING POLE 17\EA $3,489.25| $ 59,317.23 COH 53822 3767.54 1727.69 59317.23
OWNER FURNISHED CCTV FOUNDATIONS - 24" X 48" (ALLOWANCE) 4|EA $1,000.00| $ 4,000.00 COH ALLOW 4000 4000
OWNER FURNISHED LIGHTING FOUNDATIONS - 24" X 78" (ALLOWANCE) 17\EA $1,500.00( $ 25,500.00 COH ALLOW 25500 25500
WINDLOAD CALCULATIONS AND FOUNDATION DESIGN 1|LS $6,500.00| $ 6,500.00 ALLOW 6500 6500
INSTALL CCTV POLE AND FOUNDATION 4|EA $1,650.00( $ 6,600.00 CURRENT CONN 6600 6600
FURNISH AND INSTALL 2" CONDUIT 3400(LF $17.15| $ 58,310.00 CURRENT CONN 58310 58310
FURNISH AND INSTALL CCTV 11" X 18" PULLBOX 6|EA $838.33| $ 5,030.00 CURRENT CONN 5030 5030
MODIFICATIONS AND TIE-IN TO SERVICE POINT 1|LS $4,500.00| $ 4,500.00 CURRENT CONN 4500 4500
FURNISH & INSTALL (2) #4 AWG CONDUCTOR, (2) #10 AWG CONDUCTOR & (1) #4 AWG 265|LF $6.42| $ 1,700.00
GROUND WIRE CURRENT CONN 1700 1700
FURNISH & INSTALL (2) #10 AWG CONDUCTOR, (4) #4 AWG CONDUCTOR & (1) #4 AWG 1050|LF $9.05| $ 9,500.00
GROUND WIRE CURRENT CONN 9500 9500
FURNISH & INSTALL (2) #4 AWG CONDUCTOR & (1) #4 AWG GROUND WIRE 825|LF $4.24| $ 3,500.00 CURRENT CONN 3500 3500
FURNISH & INSTALL (6) #4 AWG CONDUCTOR, (2) #10 AWG CONDUCTOR & (1) #4 AWG 225|LF $11.33| $ 2,550.00
GROUND WIRE CURRENT CONN 2550 2550
FURNISH & INSTALL (2) #10 AWG CONDUCTORS & (1) #10 AWG GROUND WIRE 160|LF $1.66| $ 265.00 CURRENT CONN 265 265
FURNISH & INSTALL 1" PVC CONDUIT WITH (2) #10 AWG CONDUCTOR & (1) #10 AWG 575|LF $27.30( $ 15,700.00 15700
GROUND WIRE FROM PULL BOX TO POLE CURRENT CONN 15700
FURNISH & INSTALL CURTAIN LIGHTING FLEXIFLEX 100M RGB LIGHTS, PRODUCT # 650|LF $201.69| $ 131,100.00 131100
FM1005-B2B-(4)4'(9)VARIES(N) INCLUDING EYE BOLTS & TREE STRAPS; ATTACH LIGHT TO
EYE BOLTS ON POLE & STRAPS ON TREE AS PER DETAILS ON PLAN SHEET LI-150 CURRENT CONN 131100
FURNISH & INSTALL FESTOON LIGHTING - TOKISTAR LIGHTING EXBK-24-VI-S14-C, 3500|LF $44.74| $ 156,600.00 156600 156600
INCLUDING WIRE ROPE ASSEMBLY, EYE BOLTS & TREE STRAPS; MOUNTING FIXTURE TO
WIRE ROPE WITH MOUNTING ADAPTER & MOUNTING DISC, ATTACH LIGHT TO EYE
BOLTS ON POLE & STRAPS ON TREE AS PER DETAILS ON PLAN SHEET LI-150 CURRENT CONN
INSTALL ONLY OWNER SUPPLIED 22' POLE AND FOUNDATION FOR FESTOON LIGHT 10|EA $1,335.00| $ 13,350.00 CURRENT CONN 13350 13350
INSTALL ONLY OWNER SUPPLIED 24' POLE AND FOUNDATION FOR CURTAIN LIGHT 7|EA $1,314.29| $ 9,200.00 CURRENT CONN 9200 9200
FURNISH & INSTALL TOCKISTAR LIGHTING TRANSFORMER T24-300 XFMR 120V - 24VAC, 10|EA $325.00| $ 3,250.00 3250
FESTOON POLE MOUNTED WITH MOUNTING BRACKET WELDED TO POLE CURRENT CONN 3250
FURNISH & INSTALL 11" X 18" PULLBOX ANSI/SCTE TIER 5 MINIMUM RATING, WITH 13|EA $838.46| $ 10,900.00 10900
'ELECTRIC' ON COVER CURRENT CONN 10900
SERVICE PANEL CONNECTION, 4 NEW 20 AMP CIRCUITS. NEW CIRCUIT BREAKERS 1|EA $3,100.00| $ 3,100.00 CURRENT CONN 3,100.00 3100
SHALL MATCH A/C RATING OF EXISTING PANELBOARD. (1) 2" CONDUIT MAXIMUM, (1)
LIGHTING CONTACTOR, (1) LIGHTING CONTROL WITH TIME CLOCK ET8015C BY
INTERMATIC
ALTERNATE BID NOT INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED
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Item Description Quantity U/M Unit Price Amount Labor Equipment Material Subcontractor  General/Rental Subtotal
FURNISH & INSTALL RGB COLOR CHANGING FESTOON LIGHT & NECESSARY
EQUIPMENT IN LIEU OF THE SPECIFIED WHITE LIGHT NOT INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED
FURNISH & INSTALL RGB COLOR CHANGING CURTAIN LIGHT & NECESSARY EQUIPMENT
IN LIEU OF THE SPECIFIED WHITE LIGHT NOT INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED
Labor Equipment Material Subcontractor ~ General/Rental Subtotal
0.00 53822 3767.54 875,211.19 932800.7262

Hollywood Blvd. Festoon Lighting Total Direct Construction Cost

6/20/2017

$932,800.73

BURKHARDT

CONSTRUCTION, INC,

EXHIBIT "A"
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City of Hollywood
Hollywood Blvd. Festoon Lighting

Exceptions & Clarifications - 6/19/17; Rev. 6/20/17

10

11

12

13

14

GENERAL
Scope of work and quantities are based on Bid Set Plans recevied 5/19/17 for the Hollywood Blvd. Festoon
Lighting.

G.M.P. does includes a 2.6% contingency.

G.M.P. does not include any permit fees, capital improvement fees, connection fees or impact fees.

It is understood that the Direct Construction Cost (Exhibit "A") is unit prices for the shown in the Hollywood
Blvd. Festoon lighting plans and as modified by these exceptions and clarifications.

G.M.P. is based on the assumption that portions of roadways will be closed to vehicular traffic during some
phases of construction.

G.M.P. cost estimate does not include any low voltage wire, cameras or CCTV equipment.
G.M.P. includes an additional 2" conduit along Hollywood Blvd. for festoon lighting.
G.M.P. does not include milling and re-surfacing.

Project master schedule and schedule updates shall be a bar chart schedule acceptable to the Owner
prepared by CMAR in house personnel.

Project Manual as described in the contract shall mean the closeout project manual which shall be updated
periodically and presented to the Owner upon completion of the project. The information contained in this
manual shall be as requested by the Owner.

G.M.P. cost estimate does not include additional insurance premiums for naming individual property
owners as additional insureds.

G.M.P. includes all sales tax on materials. Should the Owner decide to direct Owner purchase certain
materials, the tax savings will revert to the owner.

All Construction easements shall be executed and all permits shall be issued prior to commencement of
the project.

Burkhardt Construction, Inc. (BCI) is not liable for failure to perform such work or any damages that occur if
such failure is as a result of Acts of God (including fire, flood, earthquake, storm, hurricane or other natural
disaster). If BCl asserts Force Majeure as the reason for failure to perform such work or such damages
occur as a result of any Act of God, then BCI must prove that they took reasonable steps to minimize
delay or damages caused by unforseeable events, that BCI substantially fulfilled all obligations, and that
the owner was timely notified of the likelihood or actual occurrence of the event described as an Act of God
(Force Majeure). Any construction related damages that took place as a result, shall be repaired or
removed and replaced at the same contract unit prices and shall be paid out of the contingency.

BURKHARDT
CONSTRUCTION, INC.
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City of Hollywood
Hollywood Blvd. Festoon Lighting

Exceptions & Clarifications - 6/19/17; Rev. 6/20/17

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

In the event that the terms and provisions of all attached Exhibits conflict with or are omitted from the terms
and provisions of this Contract, the terms and provisions of the attached Exhibits shall govern with respect
to the performance of the work.

G.M.P. does not include costs for removal / remediation of asbestos cement pipe or any other hazardous
materials.

G.M.P. is based upon owner supplied decorative pole and concrete foundation.
Prices are based on re-using excavated material for backfill. No unsuitable subsoil excavation, removal or

replacement. Demucking is specifically excluded. Unsuitable soil, if encountered shall be removed,
disposed of, replaced as directed by the Owner and billed to the Owner at the actual direct cost.

A soils report was not included.
G.M.P. does not include Flexipave system for the tree pits.
G.M.P. does not include any traffic signalilzation work.

G.M.P. does not include any FEC flagmen or work within FEC r.o.w.

BURKHARDT
CONSTRUCTION, INC.
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City of Hollywood
Hollywood Blvd. Festoon Lighting

LANDSCAPE AND IRRIGATION BID ANALYSIS

Plans: Hollywood Blvd. Festoon Lighting
Complete Plan Log Attached
Location: Hollywood Blvd. from 21st Avenue to 19th Avenue INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID BID NOT RECEIVED BID NOT RECEIVED
Hollywood, FL
ARAZOZA BROTHERS BOTANICA NANAKS LOPEZ GROUP BRIGHTVIEW
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY [ UM | UNITPRICE || AMOUNT _ |JUNIT PRICE| AMOUNT |[UNIT PRICE| AMOUNT |UNIT PRICE|  AMOUNT UNIT PRICE|  AMOUNT
LANDSCAPE AND IRRIGATION INCOMPLETE
DEMOLITION/CLEARING & GRUBBING $73,335.50 $40,690.00 NO BID
NPDES FILING AND REPORTING 1|LS BY OTHERS $ - $ - $ -
FURNISH AND INSTALL SILT FENCE 1|LS $2,500.00| $ 2,500.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
FURNISH AND INSTALL INLET PROTECTION 1|LS $2,500.00| $ 2,500.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC 1S $16,606-00| $—16,606-60 $— $— $— F —
SAWCUT EXISTING CONCRETE 450|LF $10.00| $ 4,500.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
REMOVE EXISTING CONCRETE HEADER CURB 142|LF $20.00| $ 2,840.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
REMOVE EXISTING CONCRETE SIDEWALK 95|SF $11.30| $ 1,073.50 $ - $ - $ - $ -
REMOVE EXISTING PAVER SIDEWALK 1431|SF $7.00$  10,017.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
CUT, CAP & RECONNECT WATER SERVICE TO DRINKING FOUNTAIN 4|EA $750.00| $ 3,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
REMOVE, RELOCATE & INSTALL EXISTING ADA DRINKING FOUNTAIN 4|EA $2,000.00| $ 8,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
REMOVE, RELOCATE & INSTALL EXISTING ADA PARKING SIGN & POST 4|EA $600.00| $ 2,400.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
PROTECT EXISTING VALVE BOX 4|EA $100.00| $ 400.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
REMOVE EXISTING SHRUBS 7,160|SF $0.50| $ 3,580.00 $1.50| $ 10,740.00 $ - $ - $ -
REMOVE EXISTING TREE 13|EA $1,000.00| $ 13,000.00 $350.00| $  4,550.00 $ - $ - $ -
PROTECT EXISTING TREE 127|EA $75.00| $ 9,525.00 $200.00| $ 25,400.00 $ - $ - $ -
EARTHWORK AND GRADING $5,625.00 $21,875.00 NO BID
EXCAVATE & GRADE PLANTING PITS, REMOVE & DISPOSE EXCESS MATERIAL OFFSITE 125|CY $45.00] $ 5,625.00 $175.00] $ 21,875.00 $ - $ - $ -
WATER / SEWER / DRAINAGE $39,380.00 NO BID NO BID
PROVIDE UNDERDRAIN IN NEW PLANTING PITS & CONNECT TO ADJACENT STORM DRAIN 22|EA $1,790.00] $  39,380.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
LANDSCAPING $344,133.60 $469,429.25 $223,105.39
FURNISH & INSTALL FLEXIPAVE 3,963|SF $31.20| $ 123,645.60 $26.00| $ 103,038.00 $0.00| $ - $ - $ -
CODIAEUM VARIEGATUM 'MAMMEY", 7 GAL 30" HT MIN 53|EA $30.00| $ 1,590.00 $52.00| $ 2,756.00 $98.50/ $  5,220.50 $ - $ -
DURANTA REPENS 'GOLD MOUND', 3 GAL 14" FULL 81|EA $8.00| $ 648.00 $13.00| $ 1,053.00 $9.85| $ 797.85 $ - $ -
FICUS MICROCARPA 'GREEN ISLAND' 3 GAL 14" FULL 30" O.C. 730|EA $8.00| $ 5,840.00 $11.00| $ 8,030.00 $7.88/ $ 5,752.40 $ - $ -
PHILODENDRON XANADU 3 GAL 14" FULL 30" O.C. 296|EA $10.00| $ 2,960.00 $20.00| $ 5,920.00 $9.85| $ 2,915.60 $ - $ -
BISMARCKIA NOBILIS 'SILVER' FIELD MATCHED CHARACTER FG HEAVY 20 CT MIN 14' SPR MIN 31|EA $2,500.00| $ 77,500.00 $5,425.00| $ 168,175.00 $1,800.00| $ 55,800.00 $ - $ -
PHOENIX DACTILIFERA MEJDOOL FIELD MATCHED CHARACTER FG HEAVY 20 CT MIN 14' SPR MIN 11|EA $6,250.00| $ 68,750.00 $7,250.00| $ 79,750.00 $7,480.00| $ 82,280.00 $ - $ -
ROYSTONEA REGIA FIELD MATCHED CHARACTER FG HEAVY 20' GW MIN 14' SPR 14|EA $2,000.00| $ 28,000.00 $3,800.00| $ 53,200.00 $2,561.00| $ 35,854.00 $ - $ -
FURNISH & INSTALL 3" MULCH AS SPECIFIED AT ALL NEWLY PLANTED TREES, PALMS, PLANTING BEDS 80|CY $30.00| $ 2,400.00 $125.00| $ 10,000.00 $28.30| $ 2,264.00 $ - $ -
FURNISH & INSTALL ALL PLANTING SOILS AS SPECIFIED IN THE NEW PLANTING PITS (24" DEEP) 125|CY $35.00| $ 4,375.00 $95.00| $ 11,875.00 $39.24| $  4,905.00 $ - $ -
FURNISH & INSTALL ROOT BARRIER 24" DEEP 735|LF $15.00| $ 11,025.00 $9.35| $ 6,872.25 $15.00/ $ 11,025.00 $ - $ -
FURNISH & INSTALL ALL PRE & POST EMERGENTS, SOIL AMENDMENTS, AND FERTILIZER AS REQUIRED 1|LS $3,000.00| $ 3,000.00 $3,500.00| $ 3,500.00 $3,000.00| $ 3,000.00 $ - $ -
FURNISH & INSTALL TREE BRACING & PROTECTIVE CAGE AS PER DETAIL 6/LS-150 FOR ALL NEWLY 56|EA $60.00| $ 3,360.00 $100.00| $ 5,600.00 $24.84| $  1,391.04 $ - $ -
INSTALLED TREES & PALMS
SELECTIVE PRUNING WITH A CERTIFIED ARBORIST TO EXISTING TREES / PALMS AS NEEDED FOR 1|LS $6,000.00| $ 6,000.00 $0.00| $ - $3,500.00| $ 3,500.00 $ - $ -
FESTOON / CURTAIN LIGHTING INSTALLATION. TREE / PALM TRIMMING TO BE PERFORMED
SIMULTANEOUSLY WITH FESTOON / CURTAIN LIGHT INSTALLATION
FURNISH & INSTALL ALL PRE & POST EMERGENTS, SOIL AMENDMENTS, AND FERTILIZER AS REQUIRED 1|LS $0.00| INCL $3,500.00| $ 3,500.00 $0.00| $ - $ - $ -
FURNISH & INSTALL PALM STAKING - TREE FROG AS PER ALT. DETAIL 9/LS-150 FOR ALL NEWLY 56|EA $90.00| $ 5,040.00 $110.00| $ 6,160.00 $150.00| $ 8,400.00 $ - $ -
INSTALLED TREES & PALMS
IRRIGATION $18,500.00 NO BID $14,500.00
IRRIGATION SYSTEM COMPLETE (INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO) 1|Ls $18,500.00[ $  18,500.00 $ - $14,500.00[ $ 14,500.00 $ - $ -
EXISTING SHRUB SPRAY: REPLACE NON-FUNCTIONING IRRIGATION SPRAY HEADS & COMPONENTS
AS NECESSARY TO ENSURE IRRIGATION SYSTEM PROVIDES 100% HEAD TO HEAD COVERAGE OF THE
PROPOSED PLANT MATERIAL.NEW IRRIGATION BUBBLER TO MATCH EXISTING: PROPOSED TREE IS
LOCATED IN AN EXISTING TREE PLANTER THAT IS BELIEVED TO HAVE IRRIGATION. FIELD VERIFY IF
ANY ADDITIONAL LATERAL PIPING IS NEEDED AND TIE INTO EXISTING IRRIGATION SYSTEM AS
REQUIRED IF NO IRRIGATION EXIST IN THE PLANTER. NEW IRRIGATION BUBBLER TO MATCH EXISTING:
PROPOSED TREE IS LOCATED IN A NEW TREE PLANTER. PROVIDE NEW LATERAL PIPE AND SLEEVING
AS NEEDED TO TIE INTO EXISTING IRRIGATION SYSTEM
BID TOTAL AMOUNT $480,974.10 $531,994.25 $237,605.39 #REF! #REF!
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City of Hollywood
Hollywood Blvd. Festoon Lighting

ELECTRICAL BID ANALYSIS

Plans: Hollywood Blvd. Festoon Lighting
Complete Plan Log Attached

Location: Hollywood Blvd. from 21st Avenue to 19th Avenue BID NOT RECEIVED BID NOT RECEIVED
Hollywood, FL

C.R. DUNN IMPERIAL CURRENT CONNECTIONS DAVCO ELECTRIC TIRONE ELECTRIC
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY || UM || UNITPRICE ||  AMOUNT UNIT PRICE||  AMOUNT UNIT PRICE||  AMOUNT UNIT PRICE||  AMOUNT UNIT PRICE||  AMOUNT
ELCTRICAL AND SITE LIGHTING

DEMOLITION BY OTHERS BY OTHERS BY OTHERS BY OTHERS BY OTHERS
MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC 1 LS |BY OTHERS BY OTHERS BY OTHERS BY OTHERS BY OTHERS
REMOVE & RESTORE EXISTING CONCRETE SIDEWALK 140 SF |[BY OTHERS BY OTHERS BY OTHERS BY OTHERS BY OTHERS
REMOVE & RESTORE EXISTING PAVER SIDEWALK 1250 SF |[BY OTHERS BY OTHERS BY OTHERS BY OTHERS BY OTHERS
REMOVE & RESTORE EXISTING ASPHALT PAVEMENT 100 SF |BY OTHERS BY OTHERS BY OTHERS BY OTHERS BY OTHERS
FLOWABLE CONCRETE BACKFILL IN TRENCH 2721 CF |BY OTHERS BY OTHERS BY OTHERS BY OTHERS BY OTHERS

ELECTRICAL $448,599.45 $579,680.00 $435,155.00 $0.00 $0.00
INSTALL CCTV POLE AND FOUNDATION 4|EA $750.00| $ 3,000.00 $3,000.00| $ 12,000.00 $1,650.00| $ 6,600.00 |BY OTHERS BY OTHERS
FURNISH AND INSTALL 2" DIRECTIONAL BORE CONDUIT 2200|LF $16.75| $ 36,850.00 $24.00| $ 52,800.00 $26.50| $ 58,310.00 |BY OTHERS BY OTHERS
FURNISH AND INSTALL CCTV 11" X 18" PULLBOX 6|EA $754.00| $ 4,524.00 $2,000.00| $ 12,000.00 $838.33| $ 5,030.00 |BY OTHERS BY OTHERS
MODIFICATIONS AND TIE-IN TO SERVICE POINT 1|LS $4,260.00| $ 4,260.00 $5,000.00| $ 5,000.00 $4,500.00| $ 4,500.00
ADDITIONAL 2" CONDUIT ALONG HOLLYWOOD BLVD. 1200|LF $1.00| $ 1,200.00 $ - $0.00
FURNISH & INSTALL (2) #4 AWG CONDUCTOR, (2) #10 AWG CONDUCTOR & (1) #4 AWG GROUND WIRE 265|LF $781| $ 2,069.65 $5.00| $ 1,325.00 $6.42| $ 1,700.00 $0.00| $ - $0.00| $ -
FURNISH & INSTALL (2) #10 AWG CONDUCTOR, (4) #4 AWG CONDUCTOR & (1) #4 AWG GROUND WIRE 1050|LF $11.89| $ 12,484.50 $5.00| $ 5,250.00 $9.05| $ 9,500.00 $0.00| $ - $0.00| $ -
FURNISH & INSTALL (2) #4 AWG CONDUCTOR & (1) #4 AWG GROUND WIRE 825|LF $6.17| $ 5,090.25 $3.00| $ 2,475.00 $4.24| $ 3,500.00 $0.00| $ - $0.00| $ -
FURNISH & INSTALL (6) #4 AWG CONDUCTOR, (2) #10 AWG CONDUCTOR & (1) #4 AWG GROUND WIRE 225|LF $15.87| $ 3,570.75 $6.00| $ 1,350.00 $11.33| $ 2,550.00 $0.00| $ - $0.00| $ -
FURNISH & INSTALL (2) #10 AWG CONDUCTORS & (1) #10 AWG GROUND WIRE 160|LF $2.48| $ 396.80 $3.00| $ 480.00 $1.66| $ 265.00 $0.00| $ - $0.00| $ -
FURNISH & INSTALL 1" PVC CONDUIT WITH (2) #10 AWG CONDUCTOR & (1) #10 AWG GROUND WIRE FROM PULL 575|LF $14.08| $ 8,096.00 (included included $27.30( $ 15,700.00 $0.00| $ - $0.00| $ -
FURNISH & INSTALL CURTAIN LIGHTING FLEXIFLEX 100M RGB LIGHTS, PRODUCT # FM1005-B2B-(4)4'(9)VARIES(N) 650|LF $248.45| $  161,492.50 $300.00| $ 195,000.00 $201.69| $  131,100.00 $0.00| $ - $0.00| $ -
INCLUDING EYE BOLTS & TREE STRAPS; ATTACH LIGHT TO EYE BOLTS ON POLE & STRAPS ON TREE AS PER
DETAILS ON PLAN SHEET LI-150
FURNISH & INSTALL FESTOON LIGHTING - TOKISTAR LIGHTING EXBK-24-VI-S14-C, INCLUDING WIRE ROPE 3500(|LF $46.70| $  163,450.00 $60.00| $  210,000.00 $44.74| $  156,600.00 $0.00| $ - $0.00| $ -
ASSEMBLY, EYE BOLTS & TREE STRAPS; MOUNTING FIXTURE TO WIRE ROPE WITH MOUNTING ADAPTER &
MOUNTING DISC, ATTACH LIGHT TO EYE BOLTS ON POLE & STRAPS ON TREE AS PER DETAILS ON PLAN SHEET LI
INSTALL ONLY OWNER SUPPLIED 22' POLE AND FOUNDATION FOR FESTOON LIGHT 10|EA $1,374.00| $ 13,740.00 $3,000.00| $ 30,000.00 $1,335.00| $ 13,350.00 $0.00| $ - $0.00| $ -
INSTALL ONLY OWNER SUPPLIED 24' POLE AND FOUNDATION FOR CURTAIN LIGHT T|EA $1,419.00| $ 9,933.00 $3,000.00| $ 21,000.00 $1,314.29| $ 9,200.00 $0.00| $ - $0.00| $ -
FURNISH & INSTALL TOCKISTAR LIGHTING TRANSFORMER T24-300 XFMR 120V - 24VAC, FESTOON POLE 10|EA $375.00| $ 3,750.00 [included included $325.00| $ 3,250.00 $0.00| $ - $0.00| $ -
MOUNTED WITH MOUNTING BRACKET WELDED TO POLE
FURNISH & INSTALL 11" X 18" PULLBOX ANSI/SCTE TIER 5 MINIMUM RATING, WITH 'ELECTRIC' ON COVER 13|EA $754.00| $ 9,802.00 $2,000.00| $ 26,000.00 $838.46| $ 10,900.00 $0.00| $ - $0.00| $ -
SERVICE PANEL CONNECTION, 4 NEW 20 AMP CIRCUITS. NEW CIRCUIT BREAKERS SHALL MATCH A/C RATING OF 1|EA $4,890.00| $ 4,890.00 $5,000.00| $ 5,000.00 $3,100.00| $ 3,100.00 $0.00| $ - $0.00| $ -
EXISTING PANELBOARD. (1) 2" CONDUIT MAXIMUM, (1) LIGHTING CONTACTOR, (1) LIGHTING CONTROL WITH TIME
CLOCK ET8015C BY INTERMATIC
ALTERNATE BID $768,754.00 $853,500.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
FURNISH & INSTALL RGB COLOR CHANGING FESTOON LIGHT & NECESSARY EQUIPMENT IN LIEU OF THE 3500|LS $73.68| $ 257,880.00 $86.00/ $ 301,000.00 $0.00( $ - $0.00( $ - $0.00( $ -
SPECIFIED WHITE LIGHT
FURNISH & INSTALL RGB COLOR CHANGING CURTAIN LIGHT & NECESSARY EQUIPMENT IN LIEU OF THE 650|LS $785.96| $ 510,874.00 $850.00| $ 552,500.00 $0.00| $ - $0.00| $ - $0.00| $ -
SPECIFIED WHITE LIGHT

BID TOTAL AMOUNT $448,599.45 $579,680.00 $435,155.00 $0.00 $0.00

BURKHARDT

TRUCTION, INC.
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Owner:

Designer:

Location:

City of Hollywood

Hollywood Blvd. Festoon Lighting

PLAN LOG

City of Hollywood, C.R.A.
Attn: Moshe Anuar, P.E.
1948 Harrison Street
Hollywood, FL 33020

Kimley-Horn

Attn: James Pankonin, PLA, LEED AP
1777 Main Street, Suite 200
Sarasota, FL 34236

Hollywood Blvd. from 21st Avenue to 19th Avenue

Hollywood, FL
g';‘” TITLE DWG. NO. | Drawing Date |Received Date| Revision Date
rder
1|COVER SHEET CS-000 5/9/2017| 5/19/2017
2|PLAN LAYOUT CS-001 5/9/2017| 5/19/2017
3|DEMOLITION PLAN - 21ST TO 20TH D-100 5/9/2017| 5/19/2017
4|DEMOLITION PLAN - 20TH TO 19TH D-101 5/9/2017| 5/19/2017
5|DEMOLITION PLAN - 19TH TO YOUNG CIRCLE D-102 5/9/2017| 5/19/2017
6|LANDSCAPE PLAN - 21ST TO 20TH LS-100 5/9/2017| 5/19/2017
7|LANDSCAPE PLAN - 20TH TO 19TH LS-101 5/9/2017| 5/19/2017
8(LANDSCAPE PLAN - 19TH TO YOUNG CIRCLE LS-102 5/9/2017| 5/19/2017
9|LANDSCAPE DETAILS LS-150 5/9/2017| 5/19/2017
10{LANDSCAPE NOTES LS-151 5/9/2017| 5/19/2017
LIGHTING PLAN - 21ST TO 20TH LI-100 5/9/2017| 5/19/2017
LIGHTING PLAN - 20TH TO 19TH LI-101 5/9/2017| 5/19/2017
LIGHTING PLAN - 19TH TO YOUNG CIRCLE LI-102 5/9/2017| 5/19/2017
LIGHTING DETAILS LI-150 5/19/2017| 5/19/2017
CCTV CAMERA POLE AND BASE LI-151 5/9/2017| 5/19/2017
FESTOON AND CURTAIN LIGHTING POLE AND BASE LI-152 5/9/2017| 5/19/2017
CCTV PLAN AND DETAIL LI-200 5/19/2017| 5/19/2017
FOUNDATION DETAILS LI-250 5/19/2017| 5/19/2017 6/9/2017
SCHEMATIC IRRIGATION PLAN - 21ST TO 20TH IR-100 5/9/2017| 5/19/2017
SCHEMATIC IRRIGATION PLAN - 20TH TO 19TH IR-101 5/9/2017| 5/19/2017
11|SCHEMATIC IRRIGATION PLAN - 19TH TO YOUNG CIRCLE IR-102 5/9/2017| 5/19/2017
12|SCHEMATIC IRRIGATION DETAILS IR-150 5/9/2017| 5/19/2017

BURKHARDT

COMNSTRUCTION, ING.

Pagel4 of 14



