City of Hollywood

Procurement Services

~
Hollywo(xj Steve Stewart, Chief Procurement Officer
FLORIDA 2600 Hollywood Boulevard, Hollywood, FL 33020

AaN

EVALUATION TABULATION
IFB No. IFB-061-23-SK

Rifles and Related Equipment
RESPONSE DEADLINE: March 8, 2023 at 3:00 pm
Report Generated: Wednesday, March 22, 2023

SELECTED VENDOR TOTALS
*Vendor did not bid on all items or did not meet bid requirements
*Parabellum Weaponry LLC $1,554.00
*Dana Safety Supply, Inc $65,667.00
*IWI US Inc $176,550.00
Proforce Marketing, Inc $189,898.50
Clyde Armory, Inc. $227,604.00
Lou's Police Distributors $232,347.00
G T DISTRIBUTORS, INC. $239,850.00
Witmer Public Safety $246,909.00
Group, Inc.
Investigations & $249,900.00
Protective Services Inc

TABLE 1 (Table 10f2)

Bidder may bid on one or more line items. Pricing must be inclusive of shipping/handling.



EVALUATION TABULATION
IFB No. IFB-061-23-SK
Rifles and Related Equipment

Clyde Armory, Inc. Dana Safety Supply, Inc G T DISTRIBUTORS, INC. Investigations & IWI US Inc
Protective Services Inc

Selected Lineltem Description  Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
Measure

Unit Cost Total

X 1 RIFLE: Colt 150 Each $1,095.14 |$164,271.00 No Bid No Bid $1,159.00 |$173,850.00| $1,150.00 |$172,500.00| $737.00 |$110,550.00
Enhanced

Patrol Rifle
(EPR), M4
Carbine,

SKU:
LE6933-EPR,

11.5" BBL,

Semi Auto,
5.56mm,

MLOK Rail,

Ambi

Selector,

Magpul Flip
Sights, 1

mag,

Capacity:

30+1

X 2 EQUIPMENT- 150 Each $411.91 | $61,786.50 | $427.95 |$64,192.50 | $430.00 | $64,500.00 | $499.00 | $74,850.00 | $430.00 | $64,500.00
SIGHT:

Aimpoint
Duty RDS,
Red Dot
Sight, One-
Piece
Torsion Nut
Mount,
39MM, Item
#200759, 2
MOA,
CR2032
Battery,
Compact
Optic
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EVALUATION TABULATION
IFB No. IFB-061-23-SK
Rifles and Related Equipment

‘ Clyde Armory, Inc. Dana Safety Supply, Inc G T DISTRIBUTORS, INC. Investigations & IWI US Inc
Protective Services Inc
Selected Lineltem Description  Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
Measure
X 3 EQUIPMENT- 150 Each $10.31 $1,546.50 $9.83 $1,474.50 $10.00 $1,500.00 $17.00 $2,550.00 $10.00 $1,500.00
ADDITIONAL
MAGAZINE:
Magpul
PMAG® 30
AR/M4 GEN
M2 MOE®,
5.56x45
MAG571
Total $227,604.00 $65,667.00 $239,850.00 $249,900.00 $176,550.00

TABLE 1 (table 2 of 2)

Bidder may bid on one or more line items. Pricing must be inclusive of shipping/handling.
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EVALUATION TABULATION
IFB No. IFB-061-23-SK
Rifles and Related Equipment

Lou's Police Distributors Parabellum Weaponry LLC Proforce Marketing, Inc Witmer Public Safety Group,
Inc.

Selected Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
Measure

X 1 RIFLE: Colt 150 Each $1,135.00 $170,250.00 No Bid No Bid $838.98 $125,847.00 $1,193.99 $179,098.50
Enhanced
Patrol Rifle
(EPR), M4

Carbine, SKU:

LE6933-EPR,
11.5" BBL,
Semi Auto,

5.56mm,

MLOK Rail,
Ambi

Selector,

Magpul Flip

Sights, 1 mag,
Capacity:

30+1

X 2 EQUIPMENT- 150 Each $405.00 $60,750.00 No Bid No Bid $417.36 $62,604.00 $442.99 $66,448.50
SIGHT:
Aimpoint
Duty RDS,
Red Dot
Sight, One-
Piece Torsion
Nut Mount,
39MM, Item
#200759, 2
MOA,
CR2032
Battery,
Compact
Optic
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EVALUATION TABULATION
IFB No. IFB-061-23-SK
Rifles and Related Equipment

Lou's Police Distributors Parabellum Weaponry LLC Proforce Marketing, Inc Witmer Public Safety Group,
Inc.

Selected Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
Measure

X 3 EQUIPMENT- 150 Each $8.98 $1,347.00 $10.36 $1,554.00 $9.65 $1,447.50 $9.08 $1,362.00
ADDITIONAL
MAGAZINE:
Magpul
PMAG® 30
AR/M4 GEN
M2 MOE®,
5.56x45
MAG571

Total $232,347.00 $1,554.00 $189,898.50 $246,909.00
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