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CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)
03/12/2025

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: |If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER ﬁgh’)‘ECT William F. Comiskey,Jr.
; ; PHONE R FAX
King Risk Partners, LLC Ao No. Ext): (888) 377-0420 (AIC. No):
643 SW 4th Ave Suite 210 ML o5 bill.comiskey@king-insurance.com
INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
Gainesville FL 32601 INSURER A : Great Divide Insurance Company 25224
INSURED INSURER B :  Key Risk Insurance Company 10885
A.J. Panzarella LLC. dba Panzarella Waste & Recycling Services INSURER c: Penn America Insurance 32859
4600 Powerline Road INSURER D : Insurance Company of the West 27847
INSURER E : Houston Specialty Insurance Company 12936
Fort Lauderdale FL 33309 INSURER F :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER:  CL2522573222 REVISION NUMBER:
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.
INSR ADDL[SUBR POLICY EFF_| POLICY EXP
LTR TYPE OF INSURANCE INSD | WVD POLICY NUMBER (MM/DD/YYYY) | (MM/DD/YYYY) LIMITS
>X| COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE ¢ 1,000,000
DAMAGE TO RENTED
| CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR PREMISES (Ea occurrence) $ 100,000
MED EXP (Any one person) $ 5,000
A Y GLP2025680-16 03/13/2025 | 03/13/2026 | persONAL & ADV INJURY ¢ 1,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE ¢ 2,000,000
X| roLicy EECOT' Loc PRODUCTS - COMP/IOPAGG | 3 2:000,000
OTHER: $
COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY (Ea accident) $ 1,000,000
| Aany auto BODILY INJURY (Per person) | $
OWNED SCHEDULED . !
B OWNED Ly - SCHED Y BAP2025681-17 03/13/2025 | 03/13/2026 | BODILY INJURY (Per accident) | $
>¢| HIRED S¢| NoN-OwNeD PROPERTY DAMAGE 3
AUTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY (Per accident)
| Pollution Lia PIP-Basic $ 10,000
X| UMBRELLALIAB X| occur EACH OCCURRENCE ¢ 4,000,000
C EXCESS LIAB cLams-mane | Y XPA1000765 03/13/2025 | 03/13/2026 | AgGREGATE ¢ 4,000,000
DED | | ReTenTion g 10,000 $
WORKERS COMPENSATION xl PER OTH-
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY YIN STATUTE ER 000,000
D é%cp:EF?/FA’A'EEAE%FE/E@FETLT'JEDFEIE'??ECUT'VE N/A WFL50598614 04 03/13/2025 | 03/13/2026 |- EACHACCIDENT $ 1’000‘000
(Mandatory in NH) E.L. DISEASE - EAEMPLOYEE [ $ VY%
If yes, describe under 1.000.000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT [ § +~YY
. SCHEDULED 770,973
Equipment Floater
E BINDEREF03132025 03/13/2025 | 03/13/2026 |EQUIPMENT

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

City of Hollywood is added as additional insured.

Notice of cancellation is 30 days except for non-payment which is 10 days.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

City of Hollywood
Public Utilites
1621 N 14th Avenue

Hollywood FL 33019

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE
William
Comiskeny, Jr.

ACORD 25 (2016/03)

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD




From: Certificate of Insurance

To: Steven Urich

Cc: Daniela Behm; Certificate of Insurance

Subject: FW: A.J. Panzarella COI 25-26 City of Hollywood certificate revised
Date: Thursday, April 3, 2025 4:25:39 PM

Attachments: image004.png

image007.ong
Certificate for A.J. Panzarella.pdf

Acceptable.

Certificate of Insurance

Hellywood

FLORIDA

From: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>

Sent: Thursday, April 3, 2025 11:55 AM

To: Certificate of Insurance <COl@hollywoodfl.org>

Cc: Daniela Behm <DBEHM@hollywoodfl.org>

Subject: FW: A.J. Panzarella COI 25-26 City of Hollywood certificate revised

Please see the revised COI for Panzarella.
Steve

Steven Urich
Public Utilities Manager-Wastewater Treatment Plant
Public Utilities

Email: surich@HollywoodFL.org

From: Judy Chance <Judy.Chance@king-insurance.com>
Sent: Thursday, April 3, 2025 9:44 AM

To: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>; Deborah Volpe <debbie@PanzarellaWaste.com>
Subject: RE: A.J. Panzarella COI 25-26 City of Hollywood certificate revised

| have attached the revised certificate.

s Exclusive Judy Chance
o Commercial Lines Account Manager
Programs King Risk Partners
Is proud to join forces with and Office: (888) 401-4774 x11426
become: Fax: 888-465-0444
.Chan king-insurance.com
RISK PARTNERS www.king-insurance.com
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CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)
03/12/2025
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OTHER: $
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DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

City of Hollywood is added as additional insured.

Notice of cancellation is 30 days except for non-payment which is 10 days.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

City of Hollywood
Public Utilites
1621 N 14th Avenue

Hollywood FL 33019

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE
William
Comiskeny, Jr.

ACORD 25 (2016/03)

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD







From: Deborah Volpe <debbie@PanzarellaWaste.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 3, 2025 7:38 AM

To: Judy Chance <Judy.Chance@king-insurance.com>

Subject: RE: A.J. Panzarella COI 25-26 City of Hollywood revision for certificate #3 attached

Good Morning,

Can you please call me with regards to this COI.

PLEASE SEND ALL DISPATCH REQUESTS TO
DISPATCH@PANZARELLAWASTE.COM BY 3:00 pm THE DAY
BEFORE SERVICE IS REQUESTED

Regards,

Deborah (/)(//y)()
Sales Contract Office Administrator

PANZARELLA

WASTE & RECYCLING SERVICES

4600 Powerline Road

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309

Phone: 877-720-9594 Fax: 888-522-5064
bbi zarellaw

From: Judy Chance <Judy.Chance@king-insurance.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 2, 2025 5:24 PM

To: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>

Cc: Deborah Volpe <debbie@PanzarellaWaste.com>

Subject: RE: A.J. Panzarella COI 25-26 City of Hollywood revision for certificate #3 attached

| have attached the new revision requested.

s Exclusive Judy Chance
- Commercial Lines Account Manager
Programs King Risk Partners
Is proud to join forces with and Office: (888) 401-4774 x11426
become: Fax: 888-465-0444

Judy.Chance@king-insurance.com

, Boca Raton, FL 33432
www.king-insurance.com
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https://gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.king-insurance.com%2F&data=05%7C02%7CDBEHM%40hollywoodfl.org%7C8a34442791bd4f43d8fe08dd72edaaf6%7Cf0ba70bfc34c416db2009c6f6a563c05%7C0%7C0%7C638793087385484596%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=iNEBVkLeYpHChtSyt1kdE9ky43869IfZtqSygFAgklw%3D&reserved=0
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\)RISK PARTNERS
change coverage via emai
e sender and delete the message frc
via voice mail, email, fax or online via ot ebsite, a C
tend that this email, including any related emails, to be a transa )
ransactions Act 1y such similar act or law, unless expressly stated otherwise in the body of the email by the send

From: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>

Sent: Wednesday, April 2, 2025 11:30 AM

To: Deborah Volpe <debbie@PanzarellaWaste.com>

Cc: Judy Chance <Judy.Chance@king-insurance.com>; Daniela Behm <DBEHM@hollywoodfl.org>
Subject: FW: A.J. Panzarella COI 25-26 City of Hollywood revision for certificate #3 attached
Importance: High

Good morning Deborah,
| am sorry to ask again, but we need the attached COI to be revised based on the feedback below.

If it is helpful, this is the Certificate Holders Box in question from a different COIl accepted by the Risk Management
Department:

City of Hollywood
Public Utilities

1621 N 14th Avenue
Hollywood FL 33019

Steven Urich
Public Utilities Manager-Wastewater Treatment Plant
Public Utilities

Email: surich@HollywoodFL.org

From: Certificate of Insurance <COl@hollywoodfl.org>

Sent: Wednesday, April 2, 2025 11:14 AM

To: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>

Cc: Daniela Behm <DBEHM @hollywoodfl.org>; Certificate of Insurance <COl@hollywoodfl.org>
Subject: FW: A.J. Panzarella COI 25-26 City of Hollywood revision for certificate #3 attached
Importance: High

Good morning, the certificate coverages are good, but the vendor did not put the department name on the
certificate holders box please have it corrected and resend for approval.

1. The City of Hollywood must be the certificate holder per the following exact format:
City of Hollywood (Nothing else on this line)
Department Name & Room # (if applicable)
Department Address
Department Address

Certificate of Insurance

Hedlywood

FLORIDA,


mailto:surich@HollywoodFL.org
mailto:debbie@PanzarellaWaste.com
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From: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>

Sent: Monday, March 31, 2025 3:37 PM

To: Certificate of Insurance <COl@hollywoodfl.org>

Cc: Daniela Behm <DBEHM @hollywoodfl.org>

Subject: FW: A.J. Panzarella COI 25-26 City of Hollywood revision for certificate #3 attached

Good afternoon,

Please see the resubmission of the remaining COI for our screening and shop waste hauler.

Steve

Steven Urich
Public Utilities Manager-Wastewater Treatment Plant
Public Utilities

Email: surich@HollywoodFL.org

From: Judy Chance <Judy.Chance@king-insurance.com>

Sent: Monday, March 31, 2025 3:25 PM

To: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>

Cc: Deborah Volpe <debbie@PanzarellaWaste.com>

Subject: RE: A.J. Panzarella COI 25-26 City of Hollywood revision for certificate #3 attached

You don't often get email from judy.chance@king-insurance.com. Learn why this is important

i Exclusive Judy Chance
™ Commercial Lines Account Manager
Programs King Risk Partners
Is proud to join forces with and Office: (888) 401-4774 x11426
become: Fax: 888-465-0444

Judy.Chance@king-insurance.com

, Boca Raton, FL 33432
RISK PARTNERS www.king-insurance.com

From: Deborah Volpe <debbie@PanzarellaWaste.com>

Sent: Friday, March 28, 2025 3:40 PM

To: Judy Chance <Judy.Chance@king-insurance.com>

Subject: A.J. Panzarella COI 25-26 City of Hollywood revision for certificate #3 attached

Good Afternoon,

Please see the second attachment with all 3 of the COI's. Only the 3™ one needs to be fixed. Please see below
and exactly what they are looking for.
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PLEASE SEND ALL DISPATCH REQUESTS TO
DISPATCH@PANZARELLAWASTE.COM BY 3:00 pm THE DAY
BEFORE SERVICE IS REQUESTED

Regards,

& ()(/y)p
Sales Contract Office Administrator

oY  PANZARELLA
WASTE & RECYCLING SERVICES

4600 Powerline Road

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309

Phone: 877-720-9594 Fax: 888-522-5064
[ zar

| have attached the requested certificate.

From: Steven Urich <surich@Hollyw FlL.org>
Sent: Thursday, March 27, 2025 5:46 PM

To: Deborah Volpe <debbie@PanzarellaWaste.com>; Daniela Behm <DBEHM@hollywoodfl.org>
Cc: Certificate of Insurance <COl@hollywoodfl.org>

Subject: RE: Panzarella COI

Good evening Deborah,

Please see the response from our Riak Department. They are very precise in the format that must be used.
For convenience, | highlighted the line on the 3 COI that needs to be changed.

Please resubmit only the 34 COl. The other two do not need to be resubmitted.

Thank you,

Steve

Steven Urich

Public Utilities Manager-Wastewater Treatment Plant
Public Utilities

P.O. Box 229045

Hollywood, FL 33022

Email: surich@HollywoodFL.org

www.HollywoodFL.org LI
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From: Deborah Volpe <debbie@PanzarellaWaste.com>

Sent: Thursday, March 27, 2025 1:09 PM

To: Daniela Behm <DBEHM @hollywoodfl.org>; Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>
Cc: Certificate of Insurance <COl@hollywoodfl.org>

Subject: RE: Panzarella COI

Good Afternoon,

Ok, thank you. If | can be of further assistance, please don’t hesitate to contact me.

PLEASE SEND ALL DISPATCH REQUESTS TO
DISPATCH@PANZARELLAWASTE.COM BY 3:00 pm THE DAY
BEFORE SERVICE IS REQUESTED

Regards,

etorah Oigpe
Sales Contract Office Administrator

WASTE & RECYCLING SERVICES

4600 Powerline Road

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309

Phone: 877-720-9594 Fax: 888-522-5064
bbi zar

From: Daniela Behm <DBEHM @hollywoodfl.org>
Sent: Thursday, March 27, 2025 1:07 PM

To: Deborah Volpe <debbie@PanzarellaWaste.com>; Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>
Cc: Certificate of Insurance <COl@hollywoodfl.org>
Subject: RE: Panzarella COI

Good afternoon,
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Received. | will forward to Risk for their review/approval.

Thank you,

Daniela Behm
Utilities Administrative Procurement Coordinator

Public Utilities

P.O. Box 229045

Hollywood, FL 33022

Email: DBEHM@hollywoodfl.org

Telephone: 954-967-4455 ext.5641

www.HollywoodFL.org

From: Deborah Volpe <debbie@PanzarellaWaste.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 27, 2025 8:49 AM

To: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>

Cc: Daniela Behm <DBEHM @hollywoodfl.org>; Certificate of Insurance <COl@hollywoodfl.org>
Subject: RE: Panzarella COI

Good Morning,

Attached, please find your updated COl’s. If | can be of further assistance, please don’t hesitate to contact me.
Have a great day.

PLEASE SEND ALL DISPATCH REQUESTS TO
DISPATCH@PANZARELLAWASTE.COM BY 3:00 pm THE DAY
BEFORE SERVICE IS REQUESTED

Regards,

etbarah Clpe
Operations Office Administrator
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PANZARELLA

WASTE & RECYCLING SERVICES

4600 Powerline Road

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309

Phone: 877-720-9594 Fax: 888-522-5064
debbie@panzarellawaste.com

From: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>

Sent: Monday, March 24, 2025 4:05 PM

To: Deborah Volpe <debbie@PanzarellaWaste.com>

Cc: Daniela Behm <DBEHM @hollywoodfl.org>; Certificate of Insurance <COl@hollywoodfl.org>
Subject: FW: Panzarella COI

Good afternoon Deborah,

The comments provided by our Risk Department are below. Please make the requested changes and resend the
COls.

Thanks,

Steve

Steven Urich
Public Utilities Manager-Wastewater Treatment Plant

Public Utilities
Email: surich@HollywoodFL .or;
From: Certificate of Insurance <COl@hollywoodfl.org>

Sent: Monday, March 24, 2025 4:01 PM

To: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>

Cc: Daniela Behm <DBEHM @hollywoodfl.org>; Certificate of Insurance <COl@hollywoodfl.org>
Subject: FW: Panzarella COI

18t COI not Acceptable for the following reasons,

1. General Liability - the City requires to be named as an additional insured for general liability in the
Description of Operations Box.

2. Auto Liability - the City requires to be named as an additional insured for auto liability in the Description
of Operations Box

3. The City of Hollywood must be the certificate holder per the following exact format:
City of Hollywood (Nothing else on this line)
Department Name & Room # (if applicable)
Department Address
Department Address

2nd COI not acceptable,
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1. The City of Hollywood must be the certificate holder per the following exact format:
City of Hollywood (Nothing else on this line)
Department Name & Room # (if applicable)
Department Address
Department Address

3 COlI not acceptable,

1. The City of Hollywood must be the certificate holder per the following exact format:
City of Hollywood (Nothing else on this line)
Department Name & Room # (if applicable)
Department Address
Department Address

Certificate of Insurance

FLORIDA,

From: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>
Sent: Thursday, March 20, 2025 11:41 AM

To: Certificate of Insurance <COl@hollywoodfl.org>
Cc: Daniela Behm <DBEHM @hollywoodfl.org>
Subject: Panzarella COI

Good morning,

This COl is for a hauler for waste removal of grit screenings and shop rags and waste at the Wastewater Treatment
Plant.

Steven Urich
Public Utilities Manager-Wastewater Treatment Plant
Public Utilities

Email: surich@HollywoodFL .org

From: Deborah Volpe < ie@PanzarellaW .com>
Sent: Thursday, March 20, 2025 10:47 AM

To: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>

Cc: Daniela Behm <DBEHM @hollywoodfl.org>
Subject: RE: CPI Attached

Good Morning,

Attached, please find your current COI’s for the City of Hollywood. If | can be of further assistance, please don’t
hesitate to contact me.

PLEASE SEND ALL DISPATCH REQUESTS TO
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DISPATCH@PANZARELLAWASTE.COM BY 3:00 pm THE DAY
BEFORE SERVICE IS REQUESTED

Regards,

Q%PZ(’/ (I/[ (/7(////)(7
Operations Office Administrator

WASTE & RECYCLING SERVICES

4600 Powerline Road

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309

Phone: 877-720-9594 Fax: 888-522-5064
debbie@panzarellawaste.com

From: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>
Sent: Thursday, March 20, 2025 10:38 AM

To: Deborah Volpe <debbie@PanzarellaWaste.com>
Cc: Daniela Behm <DBEHM @hollywoodfl.org>
Subject: RE: CPI Attached

Perfect! Thank you!

Steven Urich
Public Utilities Manager-Wastewater Treatment Plant
Public Utilities

Email: surich@HollywoodFL .or;

From: Deborah Volpe <debbie@PanzarellaWaste.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 20, 2025 10:37 AM

To: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>; Al Panzarella <APanzarella@PanzarellaWaste.com>

Cc: Dispatch <dispatch@PanzarellaWaste.com>; Daniela Behm <DBEHM@hollywoodfl.org>
Subject: RE: CPI Attached

Good Morning,

You should have received it. No Worries, | will send it to you now.

PLEASE SEND ALL DISPATCH REQUESTS TO
DISPATCH@PANZARELLAWASTE.COM BY 3:00 pm THE DAY
BEFORE SERVICE IS REQUESTED
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Regards,

@;’ZC’W(I/{' (j)(// &
Operations Office Administrator

PANZARELLA

WASTE & RECYCLING SERVICES

4600 Powerline Road

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309

Phone: 877-720-9594 Fax: 888-522-5064
debbie@panzarellawaste.com

From: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>

Sent: Thursday, March 20, 2025 10:29 AM

To: Deborah Volpe <debbie@PanzarellaWaste.com>; Al Panzarella <APanzarella@PanzarellaWaste.com>
Cc: Dispatch <dispatch@PanzarellaWaste.com>; Daniela Behm <DBEHM @hollywoodfl.org>

Subject: RE: CPI Attached

Good morning Deborah,

Can you follow up with the new COI? The one we have on file expired the 13th,

Steven Urich
Public Utilities Manager-Wastewater Treatment Plant
Public Utilities

Email: surich@HollywoodFL.org

From: Deborah Volpe <debbie@PanzarellaWaste.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 13, 2025 9:08 AM

To: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>; Al Panzarella <APanzarella@PanzarellaWaste.com>
Cc: Dispatch <dispatch@PanzarellaWaste.com>
Subject: RE: CPI Attached

I You don't often get email from debbie@panzarellawaste.com. Learn why this is important
Good Morning,

| will follow up with regards to your COI.

PLEASE SEND ALL DISPATCH REQUESTS TO
DISPATCH@PANZARELLAWASTE.COM BY 3:00 pm THE DAY
BEFORE SERVICE IS REQUESTED
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Regards,

Detorath C)atpe
Operations Office Administrator

PANZARELLA

WASTE & RECYCGLING SERVICES

4600 Powerline Road

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309

Phone: 877-720-9594 Fax: 888-522-5064
debbie@panzarellawaste.com

From: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>

Sent: Thursday, March 13, 2025 9:06 AM

To: Al Panzarella <APanzarella@PanzarellaWaste.com>; Deborah Volpe <debbie@PanzarellaWaste.com>
Cc: Dispatch <di h@PanzarellaW .com>

Subject: RE: CPI Attached

Thank you
Steven Urich

Public Utilities Manager-Wastewater Treatment Plant
Public Utilities

Email: surich@HollywoodFL.or

From: Al Panzarella <APanzarella@PanzarellaWaste.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 13, 2025 9:05 AM

To: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>; Deborah Volpe <debbie@PanzarellaWaste.com>

Cc: Dispatch <dispatch@PanzarellaWaste.com>
Subject: RE: CPI Attached

All new COlI’s were going out yesterday/today. Debbie will make sure you get one today.

Al Panzarella

President/CEO

Panzarella Waste & Recycling Services
4600 Powerline Road

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309
877-720-9594

Fax: 888-522-5064
apanzarella@panzarellawaste.com
www.panzarellawaste.com
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From: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>

Sent: Thursday, March 13, 2025 9:03 AM

To: Al Panzarella <APanzarella@PanzarellaWaste.com>
Cc: Dispatch <dispatch@Panzarella\Waste.com>
Subject: RE: CPI Attached

Steven Urich
Public Utilities Manager-Wastewater Treatment Plant
Public Utilities

Email: surich@HollywoodFL.org

From: Al Panzarella <APanzarella@PanzarellaWaste.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 13, 2025 4:00 AM

To: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>

Cc: Dispatch <dispatch@PanzarellaWaste.com>

Subject: RE: CPI Attached

Good morning Steve,

Please find attached updated. CPI changed from 2.8% to 2.9%
Please forward documents changing so we can update in our system.
Thank you!

Al Panzarella

President/CEO

Panzarella Waste & Recycling Services
4600 Powerline Road

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309
877-720-9594

Fax: 888-522-5064
apanzarella@panzarellawaste.com

www.panzarellawaste.com

From: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>
Sent: Wednesday, March 12, 2025 2:58 PM

To: Al Panzarella <APanzarella@PanzarellaWaste.com>
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Subject: RE: CPI Attached

Good afternoon,

Please send the updated COI(s). The current versions expire tomorrow.
Thanks,

Steve

Steven Urich
Public Utilities Manager-Wastewater Treatment Plant
Public Utilities

Email: surich@HollywoodFL.org

From: Al Panzarella <APanzarella@PanzarellaWaste.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 11, 2025 11:08 AM

To: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFl.org>

Subject: RE: CPI Attached

Not until March, they will go out upon renewal

Al Panzarella

President/CEO

Panzarella Waste & Recycling Services
4600 Powerline Road

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309
877-720-9594

Fax: 888-522-5064

apanzarella@panzarellawaste.com
Www.panzarellawaste.com

r— [—

‘ = IS4

From: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>
Sent: Tuesday, February 11, 2025 11:06 AM
To: Al Panzarella <APanzarella@PanzarellaWaste.com>

Subject: RE: CPI Attached

Thank you.

| was also told that your current COI(s) with us are expiring soon. Can you please send updated ones?

Thank you,

Steve
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Steve Urich
Public Utilities Manager, Wastewater Treatment Plant
Phone: 954-921-3288 Ext: 5554

Hllywood

FLORIDA

Steven Urich
Public Utilities Manager-Wastewater Treatment Plant
Public Utilities

Email: surich@HollywoodFL.org

From: Al Panzarella <APanzarella@PanzarellaWaste.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 11, 2025 10:49 AM

To: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>
Subject: CPI Attached

Hi Steve,
See attached.

Al Panzarella

President/CEO

Panzarella Waste & Recycling Services
4600 Powerline Road

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309
877-720-9594

Fax: 888-522-5064
apanzarella@panzarellawaste.com

www.panzarellaw .com

From: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>
Sent: Monday, February 10, 2025 7:27 AM

To: Al Panzarella <APanzarella@PanzarellaWaste.com>
Subject: RE: [EXT]RE: Option to renew

Yes please and thank you.

Steve Urich
Public Utilities Manager, Wastewater Treatment Plant
Phone: 954-921-3288 Ext: 5554

Hdlywood

FLORIDA,
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mailto:surich@HollywoodFL.org
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Steven Urich
Public Utilities Manager-Wastewater Treatment Plant
Public Utilities

Email: surich@HollywoodFL .org

From: Al Panzarella <APanzarella@PanzarellaWaste.com>
Sent: Friday, February 7, 2025 4:30 AM

To: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>

Subject: [EXT]RE: Option to renew

You don't often get email from apz

Jpanzarellawaste.com. Learn why this is important
Yes, there is a CPI adjustment due upon renewal also do you need us to submit the documentation on that?

Al Panzarella

President/CEO

Panzarella Waste & Recycling Services
4600 Powerline Road

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309
877-720-9594

Fax: 888-522-5064

apanzarella@panzarellawaste.com

From: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>

Sent: Thursday, February 6, 2025 12:07 PM

To: Al Panzarella <APanzarella@PanzarellaWaste.com>
Subject: Option to renew

Good afternoon,

The City of Hollywood would like to exercise its first option to renew this contract. Can you please provide confirmation
that your company would agree to this renewal?

Thank you,

Steve Urich
Public Utilities Manager, Wastewater Treatment Plant
Phone: 954-921-3288 Ext: 5554

Hdlywood

FLORIDA

Steven Urich
Public Utilities Manager-Wastewater Treatment Plant
Public Utilities
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P.O. Box 229045
City of Hollywood, Florida 33022
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www.HollywoodFL.org LI

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the
content is safe.
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