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CONTACT INFORMATION

ADDENDA CONFIRMATION

  Addendum #1
Confirmed Jul 11, 2025 11:50 AM by Albert Panzarella

  Addendum #2
Confirmed Jul 11, 2025 11:50 AM by Albert Panzarella

  Addendum #3
Confirmed Jul 11, 2025 11:50 AM by Albert Panzarella

QUESTIONNAIRE

1. CONTRACTOR QUALIFICATIONS INFORMATION*
For each respective Section (A-D) your firm is interested in bidding, please upload the requested information per the Contractor Qualifications section. If 
bidding on more than one section, please separate the information per sections. This information can be uploaded all in one document.

A. Experience: Bidder or its key personnel must have at least five years of experience providing (Applicable Section) processing services of a similar 
scale as that required by the City.

B. Designated Facilities: Bidder must provide the name and address of the facility at which it proposes to process/dispose of the City’s (Applicable 
Section). If the Facility is not located within Broward County or is not within a 20-mile driving distance of the City of Hollywood’s city limits, bidder 
must also provide the name and address of a facility that meets those requirements at which it proposes to receive the City’s (Applicable Section) 
Processing Facility. Bidder must also provide the name and address of an alternate (Applicable Section) Facility it will utilize if the Designated 
Facility is not operational due to a natural disaster. Bidder must document that all facilities are permitted/licensed and operational at the time of bid 
submittal. Bidder must also provide an explanation of any outstanding compliance issues at the facilities, including but not limited to notices of 
violation, consent orders, etc.

 

 PMRF_Letter_Signed.pdf

 2025_PMRF_Recovered_Materials_Cert.pdf

 FDACS_WEIGHTS_&_MEASURING_SCALE_PERMIT_2025_-_2026_.pdf

 MRF_BROWARD_COUNTY_LOCAL_BUSINESS_TAX_RECEIPT_2024_-_2025.pdf

Company
Panzarella MRF, LLC.

Email
sales@panzarellawaste.com

Contact
Albert Panzarella

Address
4600 Powerline Road
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309

Phone
(877) 720-9594

Website
N/A

Submission Date
Jul 14, 2025 1:13 PM (Eastern Time)
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https://vendor-proposal.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/332767/fb32ffcf-1343-4cdf-8400-6f0bc93db557_MRF_BROWARD_COUNTY_LOCAL_BUSINESS_TAX_RECEIPT_2024_-_2025.pdf?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4HANMRR6S%2F20250730%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20250730T133233Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEJX%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FwEaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJHMEUCIQCPI1WMBoJn0pjtyBsmbOse3ZHUthTk4Wi4J5Kq6ZdWWQIgZxZPUydiCPwBN0XKVV9ko4yttnWrtCgigsrfkTSjKT0qjAUIvv%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FARACGgw4OTIzNjQ2ODc2NzIiDKvIiKXT0RkXjW9CNyrgBJA0U44rs0qsfrdxaqTQj2N%2FtUfUKbnfXdEaNKGeKzB%2F55MStxBthB%2BOeJAFLdjT9mkQ4oFJuD2nS%2BubWG9FphvNoLXoHYicc0ZyTm%2Bl5UwVuTe52eePOxka2xK1LcjprdwWsaCKEfo%2BVrESmCrD%2BPiikEmKpVZYF2K3xY9myxJaXM0qgIJ5glXuOUHKDYhdJEZNhLVSGEhP5sHii3%2FAE72UasuRJaIPsPLio8bbNrKzxI46coF1EJYoMTATukzc5TggVR0XUESVoeX1JZZq33nt8bj1Lh2HUDPLffg4nIj2hr4cUDnHcNyq0HD2uy365oPpTzUQ21Mkxc%2BwCH01a28jfxUtSzRusFSd4D7n0cg0u3SASHTjzDCIg0M1c7%2FdbT84ohJHm6rkf6d6zrtyHnrL3%2BhTVGgGNksC433m6WeKYLQdzJEoI%2FzMmPfMtNeG6l%2FJpVJ7fwxju8IhjLNvJcbg%2B1e18SYUicoAy%2B66LMCfJHULAYd%2F0wp02wEpMxkoifdRPgmvIsiTMDP0ZI2kWOeSPCgppkYTBjx0X8JwgFR9R5oSIoOL6GMAnAQ1KjDFmcZtbim%2FnG3tr688snWxKI7Mq%2BSElWitPqt8wXshYysg%2FLADzIeuMz9n55R3hU8f1yMCxqtkIJd%2FVq3bdLeIv6jBK%2BQIV98JZD%2F5GNyV9VVz1H8Yn656uM6oGWzX7pqMvwHodsVaFeOyPanun4HLCMI2sy1WDdQY3yA9Vmq5zagwW0eqJUR50%2BD0H0TOqVuk%2FIEnG3LPzenr%2FyoMOrezCiEljOGuswuKWqvQ9bZ2fNk7MLWvqMQGOpsB%2FTiNFqp3MrmiHF2B8osjf9kBercjLtC5ZqIgzUraOUntPt8u%2F3rcX%2BUB0Z5SWtbJSRocP6iv0vE6fn6%2BrO0vRarUfNpXIeOoAwzLXRYxGb88PuHAP5fORG%2F7NY82%2F02n1AXfdVwFozvG4LewhDTqE9mvXkocXBRJuFyX1MjfrDnUdSBAi%2Bl3htWZxoG2y9ZXd%2ByEgghu%2Bk0b4Pg%3D&X-Amz-Signature=9b3884d89a02c9cfdde0b2217a475d478563ea1bebbf936c6bb71e3db0c710c0&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22MRF_BROWARD_COUNTY_LOCAL_BUSINESS_TAX_RECEIPT_2024_-_2025.pdf%22&x-id=GetObject


 PMRFFDEPLicense.pdf

 Hazardous_Material_Management_License_10-1-24_=_9-30-26.pdf

 MRF_FINANCIAL_STABILITY_LETTER.pdf

 PMRF_ARTICLES_OF_INCORPORATION_20250710_0001.pdf

 PMRF_ENITY_NAME_SUN_BIZ_20250710_0001.pdf

 Pompano_Beach_Business_Tax_Receipt_10-1-24_-_9-30-25.pdf

2. VENDOR REFERENCE FORM*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload for each vendor reference. Reference forms are to be completed by your vendor reference. 
They must be sent back to you to be uploaded with your bid response. A minimum of three (3) references are required.

  Vendor_Reference_Form.pdf

 ALL_COUNTY_WASTE_SIGNED_VENDOR_REFERENCE_FORM.pdf

 WASTELINE_SOLUTIONS_SIGNED_VENDOR_REFERENCE_FORM.pdf

 WASTEPRO_SIGNED_VENDOR_REFERENCE_FORM.pdf

 PANZARELLA_WASTE_SIGNED_VENDOR_REFERENCE_FORM.pdf

3. HOLD HARMLESS AND INDEMNITY CLAUSE*
I, an authorized representative, the contractor, shall indemnify, defend and hold harmless the City of Hollywood, its elected and appointed officials, 
employees and agents for any and all suits, actions, legal or administrative proceedings, claims, damage, liabilities, interest, attorney’ s fees, costs of any 
kind whether arising prior to the start of activities or following the completion or acceptance and in any manner directly or indirectly caused, occasioned or 
contributed to in whole or in part by reason of any act, error or omission, fault or negligence whether active or passive by the contractor, or anyone acting 
under its direction, control, or on its behalf in connection with or incident to its performance of the contract.

 Confirmed

4. NON-COLLUSION STATEMENT*
I , being first duly sworn, depose that:

1. He/she is an authorized representative of the Company, the Proposer that has submitted the attached Proposal.
2. He/she has been fully informed regarding the preparation and contents of the attached Proposal and of all pertinent circumstances regarding such 

Proposal;
3. Such Proposal is genuine and is not a collusion or sham Proposal;
4. Neither the said Proposer nor any of its officers, partners, owners, agents, representatives, employees or parties in interest, including this affiant has

in any way colluded, conspired, connived or agreed, directly or indirectly with any other Proposer, firm or person to submit a collusive or sham 
Proposal in connection with the contractor for which the attached Proposal has been submitted or to refrain from bidding in connection with such 
contract, or has in any manner, directly or indirectly, sought by agreement or collusion or communication or conference with any other Proposer, firm 
or person to fix the price or prices, profit or cost element of the Proposal price or the Proposal price of any other Proposer, or to secure an 
advantage against the City of Hollywood or any person interested in the proposed Contract; and

5. The price or prices quoted in the attached Proposal are fair and proper and are not tainted by any collusion, conspiracy, connivance or unlawful 
agreement on the part of the Proposer or any of its agents, representatives, owners, employees, or parties in interest, including this affiant.

 Confirmed

5. CERTIFICATIONS REGARDING DEBARMENT, SUSPENSION AND OTHER RESPONSIBILITY MATTERS*
The applicant certifies that it and its principals:

1. Are not presently debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment, declared ineligible, sentenced to a denial of Federal benefits by a State or Federal 
court, or voluntarily excluded from covered transactions by any Federal department or agency;

2. Have not within a three-year period preceding this application been convicted of or had a civil judgment rendered against them for commission of 
fraud or a criminal offense in connection with obtaining, attempting to obtain, or performing a public (Federal, State, or local) transaction or contract 
under a public transaction, violation of Federal or State antitrust statutes or commission of embezzlement, theft, forgery, bribery, falsification or 
destruction of records, making false statements, or receiving stolen property;

3. Are not presently indicted for or otherwise criminally or civilly charged by a governmental entity (Federal, State, or local) with commission of any of 
the offenses enumerated in paragraph (b) of this certification; and

4. Have not within a three-year period preceding this application had one or more public transactions (Federal, State, or local) terminated for cause or 
default.

 Confirmed

6. DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE PROGRAM*

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

7/30/25, 9:32 AM Panzarella MRF, LLC. Response
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https://vendor-proposal.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/332767/e6a312a2-3459-403c-8021-7028c27f9180_PMRFFDEPLicense.pdf?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4HANMRR6S%2F20250730%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20250730T133233Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEJX%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FwEaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJHMEUCIQCPI1WMBoJn0pjtyBsmbOse3ZHUthTk4Wi4J5Kq6ZdWWQIgZxZPUydiCPwBN0XKVV9ko4yttnWrtCgigsrfkTSjKT0qjAUIvv%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FARACGgw4OTIzNjQ2ODc2NzIiDKvIiKXT0RkXjW9CNyrgBJA0U44rs0qsfrdxaqTQj2N%2FtUfUKbnfXdEaNKGeKzB%2F55MStxBthB%2BOeJAFLdjT9mkQ4oFJuD2nS%2BubWG9FphvNoLXoHYicc0ZyTm%2Bl5UwVuTe52eePOxka2xK1LcjprdwWsaCKEfo%2BVrESmCrD%2BPiikEmKpVZYF2K3xY9myxJaXM0qgIJ5glXuOUHKDYhdJEZNhLVSGEhP5sHii3%2FAE72UasuRJaIPsPLio8bbNrKzxI46coF1EJYoMTATukzc5TggVR0XUESVoeX1JZZq33nt8bj1Lh2HUDPLffg4nIj2hr4cUDnHcNyq0HD2uy365oPpTzUQ21Mkxc%2BwCH01a28jfxUtSzRusFSd4D7n0cg0u3SASHTjzDCIg0M1c7%2FdbT84ohJHm6rkf6d6zrtyHnrL3%2BhTVGgGNksC433m6WeKYLQdzJEoI%2FzMmPfMtNeG6l%2FJpVJ7fwxju8IhjLNvJcbg%2B1e18SYUicoAy%2B66LMCfJHULAYd%2F0wp02wEpMxkoifdRPgmvIsiTMDP0ZI2kWOeSPCgppkYTBjx0X8JwgFR9R5oSIoOL6GMAnAQ1KjDFmcZtbim%2FnG3tr688snWxKI7Mq%2BSElWitPqt8wXshYysg%2FLADzIeuMz9n55R3hU8f1yMCxqtkIJd%2FVq3bdLeIv6jBK%2BQIV98JZD%2F5GNyV9VVz1H8Yn656uM6oGWzX7pqMvwHodsVaFeOyPanun4HLCMI2sy1WDdQY3yA9Vmq5zagwW0eqJUR50%2BD0H0TOqVuk%2FIEnG3LPzenr%2FyoMOrezCiEljOGuswuKWqvQ9bZ2fNk7MLWvqMQGOpsB%2FTiNFqp3MrmiHF2B8osjf9kBercjLtC5ZqIgzUraOUntPt8u%2F3rcX%2BUB0Z5SWtbJSRocP6iv0vE6fn6%2BrO0vRarUfNpXIeOoAwzLXRYxGb88PuHAP5fORG%2F7NY82%2F02n1AXfdVwFozvG4LewhDTqE9mvXkocXBRJuFyX1MjfrDnUdSBAi%2Bl3htWZxoG2y9ZXd%2ByEgghu%2Bk0b4Pg%3D&X-Amz-Signature=5ea007cea883c37d85e427446dd50483bce24007ad31f21ed133ddcaf8044f98&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22PMRFFDEPLicense.pdf%22&x-id=GetObject
https://vendor-proposal.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/332767/e6a312a2-3459-403c-8021-7028c27f9180_PMRFFDEPLicense.pdf?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4HANMRR6S%2F20250730%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20250730T133233Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEJX%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FwEaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJHMEUCIQCPI1WMBoJn0pjtyBsmbOse3ZHUthTk4Wi4J5Kq6ZdWWQIgZxZPUydiCPwBN0XKVV9ko4yttnWrtCgigsrfkTSjKT0qjAUIvv%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FARACGgw4OTIzNjQ2ODc2NzIiDKvIiKXT0RkXjW9CNyrgBJA0U44rs0qsfrdxaqTQj2N%2FtUfUKbnfXdEaNKGeKzB%2F55MStxBthB%2BOeJAFLdjT9mkQ4oFJuD2nS%2BubWG9FphvNoLXoHYicc0ZyTm%2Bl5UwVuTe52eePOxka2xK1LcjprdwWsaCKEfo%2BVrESmCrD%2BPiikEmKpVZYF2K3xY9myxJaXM0qgIJ5glXuOUHKDYhdJEZNhLVSGEhP5sHii3%2FAE72UasuRJaIPsPLio8bbNrKzxI46coF1EJYoMTATukzc5TggVR0XUESVoeX1JZZq33nt8bj1Lh2HUDPLffg4nIj2hr4cUDnHcNyq0HD2uy365oPpTzUQ21Mkxc%2BwCH01a28jfxUtSzRusFSd4D7n0cg0u3SASHTjzDCIg0M1c7%2FdbT84ohJHm6rkf6d6zrtyHnrL3%2BhTVGgGNksC433m6WeKYLQdzJEoI%2FzMmPfMtNeG6l%2FJpVJ7fwxju8IhjLNvJcbg%2B1e18SYUicoAy%2B66LMCfJHULAYd%2F0wp02wEpMxkoifdRPgmvIsiTMDP0ZI2kWOeSPCgppkYTBjx0X8JwgFR9R5oSIoOL6GMAnAQ1KjDFmcZtbim%2FnG3tr688snWxKI7Mq%2BSElWitPqt8wXshYysg%2FLADzIeuMz9n55R3hU8f1yMCxqtkIJd%2FVq3bdLeIv6jBK%2BQIV98JZD%2F5GNyV9VVz1H8Yn656uM6oGWzX7pqMvwHodsVaFeOyPanun4HLCMI2sy1WDdQY3yA9Vmq5zagwW0eqJUR50%2BD0H0TOqVuk%2FIEnG3LPzenr%2FyoMOrezCiEljOGuswuKWqvQ9bZ2fNk7MLWvqMQGOpsB%2FTiNFqp3MrmiHF2B8osjf9kBercjLtC5ZqIgzUraOUntPt8u%2F3rcX%2BUB0Z5SWtbJSRocP6iv0vE6fn6%2BrO0vRarUfNpXIeOoAwzLXRYxGb88PuHAP5fORG%2F7NY82%2F02n1AXfdVwFozvG4LewhDTqE9mvXkocXBRJuFyX1MjfrDnUdSBAi%2Bl3htWZxoG2y9ZXd%2ByEgghu%2Bk0b4Pg%3D&X-Amz-Signature=5ea007cea883c37d85e427446dd50483bce24007ad31f21ed133ddcaf8044f98&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22PMRFFDEPLicense.pdf%22&x-id=GetObject
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1. IDENTICAL TIE PROPOSALS - Preference shall be given to businesses with drug-free workplace programs. Whenever two or more bids which are 
equal with respect to price, quality, and service are received by the State or by any political subdivision for the procurement of commodities or 
contractual services, a bid received from a business that certifies that it has implemented a drug-free workplace program shall be given preference 
in the award process. Established procedures for processing tie proposals will be followed if none of the tied vendors have a drug-free workplace 
program. In order to have a drug-free workplace program, a business shall:

1. Publish a statement notifying employees that the unlawful manufacture, distribution, dispensing, possession, or use of a controlled substance 
is prohibited in the workplace and specifying the actions that will be taken against employees for violations of such prohibition.

2. Inform employees about the dangers of drug abuse in the workplace, the business’s policy of maintaining a drug-free workplace, any 
available drug counseling, rehabilitation, and employee assistance programs, and the penalties that may be imposed upon employees for 
drug abuse violations.

3. Give each employee engaged in providing the commodities or contractual services that are under bid a copy of the statement specified in 
subsection (1).

4. In the statement specified in subsection (1), notify the employee that, as a condition of working on the commodities or contractual services 
that are under bid, the employee will abide by the terms of the statement and will notify the employer of any conviction of, or plea of guilty or 
nolo contendere to, any violation of chapter 893 or of any controlled substance law of the United States or any state, for a violation occurring 
in the workplace no later than five (5) days after such conviction.

5. Impose a sanction on, or require the satisfactory participation in a drug abuse assistance or rehabilitation program (if such is available in the 
employee’s community) by, any employee who is so convicted.

6. Make a good faith effort to continue to maintain a drug-free workplace through implementation of these requirements.

As the person authorized to sign the statement, I certify that this firm complies fully with the above requirements.

 Confirmed

7. SOLICITATION, GIVING, AND ACCEPTANCE OF GIFTS POLICY *
Florida Statute 112.313 prohibits the solicitation or acceptance of Gifts. “No Public officer, employee of an agency, local government attorney, or candidate 
for nomination or election shall solicit or accept anything of value to the recipient, including a gift, loan, reward, promise of future employment, favor, or 
service, based upon any understanding that the vote, official action, or judgment of the public officer, employee, local government attorney, or candidate 
would be influenced thereby.” The term “public officer” includes “any person elected or appointed to hold office in any agency, including any person serving 
on an advisory body.”

The City of Hollywood/Hollywood CRA policy prohibits all public officers, elected or appointed, all employees, and their families from accepting any gifts of 
any value, either directly or indirectly, from any contractor, vendor, consultant, or business with whom the City/CRA does business.

The State of Florida definition of “gifts” includes the following:

Real property or its use,
Tangible or intangible personal property, or its use,
A preferential rate or terms on a debt, loan, goods, or services,
 Forgiveness of indebtedness,
Transportation, lodging, or parking,
Food or beverage,
Membership dues,
Entrance fees, admission fees, or tickets to events, performances, or facilities,
Plants, flowers or floral arrangements
Services provided by persons pursuant to a professional license or certificate.
Other personal services for which a fee is normally charged by the person providing the services.
Any other similar service or thing having an attributable value not already provided for in this section.

Any contractor, vendor, consultant, or business found to have given a gift to a public officer or employee, or his/her family, will be subject to dismissal or 
revocation of contract.

As the person authorized to sign the statement, I certify that this firm will comply fully with this policy.

 Confirmed

8. Certificate of Insurance*
See requirements in the #SPECIAL TERM AND CONDITIONS section.

 Certificate_for_Panzarella_MRF.pdf

9. PROOF OF SUNBIZ REGISTRATION*
Enter company FEIN to be verified in Sunbiz

81-4216921
Click to Verify Value will be copied to clipboard

10. ACKNOWLEDGMENT AND SIGNATURE PAGE

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail
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https://procurement.opengov.com/portal/hollywoodfl/projects/170184/document?section=1564177
https://vendor-proposal.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/332767/560e1dd0-4c79-4b18-a3aa-f5d018c312ff_Certificate_for_Panzarella_MRF.pdf?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4HANMRR6S%2F20250730%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20250730T133233Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEJX%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FwEaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJHMEUCIQCPI1WMBoJn0pjtyBsmbOse3ZHUthTk4Wi4J5Kq6ZdWWQIgZxZPUydiCPwBN0XKVV9ko4yttnWrtCgigsrfkTSjKT0qjAUIvv%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FARACGgw4OTIzNjQ2ODc2NzIiDKvIiKXT0RkXjW9CNyrgBJA0U44rs0qsfrdxaqTQj2N%2FtUfUKbnfXdEaNKGeKzB%2F55MStxBthB%2BOeJAFLdjT9mkQ4oFJuD2nS%2BubWG9FphvNoLXoHYicc0ZyTm%2Bl5UwVuTe52eePOxka2xK1LcjprdwWsaCKEfo%2BVrESmCrD%2BPiikEmKpVZYF2K3xY9myxJaXM0qgIJ5glXuOUHKDYhdJEZNhLVSGEhP5sHii3%2FAE72UasuRJaIPsPLio8bbNrKzxI46coF1EJYoMTATukzc5TggVR0XUESVoeX1JZZq33nt8bj1Lh2HUDPLffg4nIj2hr4cUDnHcNyq0HD2uy365oPpTzUQ21Mkxc%2BwCH01a28jfxUtSzRusFSd4D7n0cg0u3SASHTjzDCIg0M1c7%2FdbT84ohJHm6rkf6d6zrtyHnrL3%2BhTVGgGNksC433m6WeKYLQdzJEoI%2FzMmPfMtNeG6l%2FJpVJ7fwxju8IhjLNvJcbg%2B1e18SYUicoAy%2B66LMCfJHULAYd%2F0wp02wEpMxkoifdRPgmvIsiTMDP0ZI2kWOeSPCgppkYTBjx0X8JwgFR9R5oSIoOL6GMAnAQ1KjDFmcZtbim%2FnG3tr688snWxKI7Mq%2BSElWitPqt8wXshYysg%2FLADzIeuMz9n55R3hU8f1yMCxqtkIJd%2FVq3bdLeIv6jBK%2BQIV98JZD%2F5GNyV9VVz1H8Yn656uM6oGWzX7pqMvwHodsVaFeOyPanun4HLCMI2sy1WDdQY3yA9Vmq5zagwW0eqJUR50%2BD0H0TOqVuk%2FIEnG3LPzenr%2FyoMOrezCiEljOGuswuKWqvQ9bZ2fNk7MLWvqMQGOpsB%2FTiNFqp3MrmiHF2B8osjf9kBercjLtC5ZqIgzUraOUntPt8u%2F3rcX%2BUB0Z5SWtbJSRocP6iv0vE6fn6%2BrO0vRarUfNpXIeOoAwzLXRYxGb88PuHAP5fORG%2F7NY82%2F02n1AXfdVwFozvG4LewhDTqE9mvXkocXBRJuFyX1MjfrDnUdSBAi%2Bl3htWZxoG2y9ZXd%2ByEgghu%2Bk0b4Pg%3D&X-Amz-Signature=b45d61c7540b89c3c7321a06de37c0a83c08f8cf5b3ada828f51b51a8168b6bd&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22Certificate_for_Panzarella_MRF.pdf%22&x-id=GetObject
https://vendor-proposal.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/332767/560e1dd0-4c79-4b18-a3aa-f5d018c312ff_Certificate_for_Panzarella_MRF.pdf?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4HANMRR6S%2F20250730%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20250730T133233Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEJX%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FwEaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJHMEUCIQCPI1WMBoJn0pjtyBsmbOse3ZHUthTk4Wi4J5Kq6ZdWWQIgZxZPUydiCPwBN0XKVV9ko4yttnWrtCgigsrfkTSjKT0qjAUIvv%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FARACGgw4OTIzNjQ2ODc2NzIiDKvIiKXT0RkXjW9CNyrgBJA0U44rs0qsfrdxaqTQj2N%2FtUfUKbnfXdEaNKGeKzB%2F55MStxBthB%2BOeJAFLdjT9mkQ4oFJuD2nS%2BubWG9FphvNoLXoHYicc0ZyTm%2Bl5UwVuTe52eePOxka2xK1LcjprdwWsaCKEfo%2BVrESmCrD%2BPiikEmKpVZYF2K3xY9myxJaXM0qgIJ5glXuOUHKDYhdJEZNhLVSGEhP5sHii3%2FAE72UasuRJaIPsPLio8bbNrKzxI46coF1EJYoMTATukzc5TggVR0XUESVoeX1JZZq33nt8bj1Lh2HUDPLffg4nIj2hr4cUDnHcNyq0HD2uy365oPpTzUQ21Mkxc%2BwCH01a28jfxUtSzRusFSd4D7n0cg0u3SASHTjzDCIg0M1c7%2FdbT84ohJHm6rkf6d6zrtyHnrL3%2BhTVGgGNksC433m6WeKYLQdzJEoI%2FzMmPfMtNeG6l%2FJpVJ7fwxju8IhjLNvJcbg%2B1e18SYUicoAy%2B66LMCfJHULAYd%2F0wp02wEpMxkoifdRPgmvIsiTMDP0ZI2kWOeSPCgppkYTBjx0X8JwgFR9R5oSIoOL6GMAnAQ1KjDFmcZtbim%2FnG3tr688snWxKI7Mq%2BSElWitPqt8wXshYysg%2FLADzIeuMz9n55R3hU8f1yMCxqtkIJd%2FVq3bdLeIv6jBK%2BQIV98JZD%2F5GNyV9VVz1H8Yn656uM6oGWzX7pqMvwHodsVaFeOyPanun4HLCMI2sy1WDdQY3yA9Vmq5zagwW0eqJUR50%2BD0H0TOqVuk%2FIEnG3LPzenr%2FyoMOrezCiEljOGuswuKWqvQ9bZ2fNk7MLWvqMQGOpsB%2FTiNFqp3MrmiHF2B8osjf9kBercjLtC5ZqIgzUraOUntPt8u%2F3rcX%2BUB0Z5SWtbJSRocP6iv0vE6fn6%2BrO0vRarUfNpXIeOoAwzLXRYxGb88PuHAP5fORG%2F7NY82%2F02n1AXfdVwFozvG4LewhDTqE9mvXkocXBRJuFyX1MjfrDnUdSBAi%2Bl3htWZxoG2y9ZXd%2ByEgghu%2Bk0b4Pg%3D&X-Amz-Signature=b45d61c7540b89c3c7321a06de37c0a83c08f8cf5b3ada828f51b51a8168b6bd&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22Certificate_for_Panzarella_MRF.pdf%22&x-id=GetObject
https://search.sunbiz.org/Inquiry/CorporationSearch/ByFeiNumber81-4216921


10.1. If Corporation - Date Incorporated/Organized:*
2017

10.2. State Incorporated/Organized:*
Florida

10.3. Remittance Address*
 

 

Panzarella MRF, 4600 Powerline Road Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309

10.4. Bidder/Proposer’s Authorized Representative’s Typed Full Name*
Albert Panzarella

10.5. IT IS HEREBY CERTIFIED AND AFFIRMED THAT THE BIDDER/PROPOSER CERTIFIES ACCEPTANCE OF THE TERMS, CONDITIONS,
SPECIFICATIONS, ATTACHMENTS AND ANY ADDENDA. THE BIDDER/PROPOSER SHALL ACCEPT ANY AWARDS MADE AS A RESULT OF THIS
SOLICITATION. BIDDER/PROPOSER FURTHER AGREES THAT PRICES QUOTED WILL REMAIN FIXED FOR THE PERIOD OF TIME STATED IN
THE SOLICITATION.*
 Confirmed

10.6. THE EXECUTION OF THIS FORM CONSTITUTES THE UNEQUIVOCAL OFFER OF BIDDER/PROPOSER TO BE BOUND BY THE TERMS OF
ITS PROPOSAL. FAILURE TO SIGN THIS SOLICITATION WHERE INDICATED BY AN AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE SHALL RENDER THE
BID/PROPOSAL NON-RESPONSIVE. THE CITY MAY, HOWEVER, IN ITS SOLE DISCRETION, ACCEPT ANY BID/PROPOSAL THAT INCLUDES AN
EXECUTED DOCUMENT WHICH UNEQUIVOCALLY BINDS THE BIDDER/PROPOSER TO THE TERMS OF ITS OFFER.*
 Confirmed

11. SWORN STATEMENT PURSUANT TO SECTION 287.133 (3) (a) FLORIDA STATUTES ON PUBLIC ENTITY CRIMES

11.1. This form statement is submitted to the City of Hollywood by:*
(Print individual’s name and title) (Print name of entity submitting sworn statement)

Albert Panzarella

11.2. Sworn Statement Continuation:*
Enter business address:

4600 Powerline Road, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309

11.3. Sworn Statement Continuation:*
Enter Federal Employer Identification Number (FEIN) is:

If the entity has no FEIN, include the Social Security Number of the individual signing this sworn statement.

81-4216921

11.4. Sworn Statement Continuation:*
I understand that “convicted” or “conviction” as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(b), Florida Statutes, means a finding of guilt or a conviction of a public 
entity crime, with or without an adjudication of guilt, in an federal or state trial court of record relating to charges brought by indictment or information after 
July 1, 1989, as a result of a jury verdict, nonjury trial, or entry of a plea of guilty or nolo contendere.

Have never been convicted nor are there any convictions

11.5. Sworn Statement Continuation:*
I understand that “Affiliate,” as defined in paragraph 287.133(1)(a), Florida Statutes, means:

 

1. A predecessor or successor of a person convicted of a public entity crime, or

2. An entity under the control of any natural person who is active in the management

of the entity and who has been convicted of a public entity crime. The term “affiliate”

includes those officers, directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees,

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail
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RECYCLE WASTE - Price Section A

members, and agents who are active in the management of an affiliate. The

ownership by one person of shares constituting a controlling interest in another

person, or a pooling of equipment or income among persons when not for fair

market value under an arm’s length agreement, shall be a prima facie case that

one person controls another person. A person who knowingly enters into a joint

venture with a person who has been convicted of a public entity crime in Florida

during the preceding 36 months shall be considered an affiliate.

 Confirmed

11.6. Sworn Statement Continuation:*
I understand that “person,” as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(e), Florida Statues, means any natural person or any entity organized under the laws of 
any state or of the United States with the legal power to enter into a binding contract and which bids or applies to bid on contracts let by a public entity, or 
which otherwise transacts or applies to transact business with a public entity.

 

The term “person” includes those officers, executives, partners, shareholders, employees, members, and agents who are active in management of an 
entity

 Confirmed

11.7. Sworn Statement Continuation:*
Based on information and belief, the statement which I have marked below is true in relation to the entity submitting this sworn statement. (Please indicate 
which statement applies.)

Division of Administrative Hearings, determined that it was not in the public interest to place the entity submitting this sworn statement on the convicted 
vendor list. (attach a copy of the Final Order).

Neither the entity submitting sworn statement, nor any of its officers, director, executives, partners, shareholders, employees, members, or agents who are 
active in the management of the entity, nor any affiliate of the entity has been charged with and convicted of a public entity crime subsequent to July 1, 
1989. 

11.8. Sworn Statement Confirmation*
I UNDERSTAND THAT THE SUBMISSION OF THIS FORM TO THE CONTRACTING OFFICER

FOR THE PUBLIC ENTITY IDENTIFIED IN PARAGRAPH 1 (ONE) ABOVE IS FOR THAT PUBLIC

ENTITY ONLY AND THAT THIS FORM IS VALID THROUGH DECEMBER 31 OF THE CALENDAR

YEAR IN WHICH IT IS FILED. I ALSO UNDERSTAND THAT I AM REQUIRED TO INFORM THAT

PUBLIC ENTITY PRIOR TO ENTERING INTO A CONTRACT IN EXCESS OF THE THRESHOLD

AMOUNT PROVIDED IN SECTION 287.017 FLORIDA STATUTES FOR A CATEGORY TWO OF

ANY CHANGE IN THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS FORM.

 Confirmed

PRICE TABLES

Bidders wishing to provide Recycle Waste processing and disposal services must complete this section. Estimated tonnage is for the purposes of this bid.
Payment will be based on actual tonnage delivered for processing by or on behalf of the City.

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Pass Fail

Line Item Description Estimat… Unit Bid Price Total No Bid

1 Recycle Waste Received at 
Designated Receiving 
Facilty

12000 Tons $150.50 $1,806,000.00
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YARD WASTE - Price Section B

BULK WASTE - Price Section C

COMMINGLED WASTE - Price Section D

Bidders wishing to provide Yard Waste processing and disposal services must complete this section. Estimated tonnage is for the purposes of this bid.
Payment will be based on actual tonnage delivered for processing by or on behalf of the City.

Bidders wishing to provide Bulk Waste processing and disposal services must complete this section. Estimated tonnage is for the purposes of this bid.
Payment will be based on actual tonnage delivered for processing by or on behalf of the City.

Bidders wishing to provide Commingled Waste processing and disposal services must complete this section. Estimated tonnage is for the purposes of this
bid. Payment will be based on actual tonnage delivered for processing by or on behalf of the City.

Total $1,806,000.00

Line Item Description Estimat… Units Bid Price Total No Bid

1 Yard Waste Received at 
Designated Receiving 
Facility

9000 Tons $48.00 $432,000.00

Total $432,000.00

Line Item Description Estimat… Units Bid Price Total No Bid

1 Bulk Waste Received at 
Designated Receiving 
Facility

8000 Tons $56.50 $452,000.00

Total $452,000.00

Line Item Description Estimat… Units Bid Price Total No Bid

1 Commingled Waste 
Received at Designated 
Receiving Facility

20000 Tons $52.25 $1,045,000.00

Total $1,045,000.00
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