



Invoice No. : 1000069562
 File No. : 010307.014600
 Bill Date : September 2, 2022

City of Hollywood, Florida
 2600 Hollywood Boulevard
 Hollywood, FL 33020

Attn: Douglas Gonzalez
 City Attorney

INVOICE

Re: Large User Agreement Litigation

Legal Services through August 31, 2022:

Total Fees: \$ 149,079.00

Expenses:

Business Meals	33.87
Conference Calls	3.45
Deposition/Court Reporters	1,181.75
Parking Charges	20.00
Professional & Legal	150.00
Transcript Charges	2,249.95
Information and Research	1,632.00

Total Expenses: \$ 5,271.02

Current Invoice: \$ 154,350.02

PCG:TJA

Tax ID: 59-1270754



Invoice No.: 1000069562
File No. : 010307.014600

Note: Payment is Due 30 Days from Date of Invoice

***FOR YOUR CONVENIENCE,
PAYMENT INSTRUCTIONS FOR GT FIRM ACCOUNT
FOR FEES & COSTS ARE AS FOLLOWS:***

For Wire Instructions:

Bank: WELLS FARGO BANK
ABA #: 121000248

For ACH Instructions:

Bank: WELLS FARGO BANK
ABA# 063107513

CREDIT TO: GREENBERG TRAURIG DEPOSITORY ACCOUNT
ACCOUNT #: 2000014648663

PLEASE

**REFERENCE: CLIENT NAME: CITY OF HOLLYWOOD, FLORIDA
FILE NUMBER: 010307.014600
INVOICE NUMBER: 1000069562*
BILLING
PROFESSIONAL: Phillip C. Gildan**

IF YOU WISH TO PAY BY CHECK PLEASE REMIT TO THE ADDRESS BELOW:

**Greenberg Traurig
PO Box 936769
ATLANTA GA 31193-6769**

Wire fees may be assessed by your bank.

*** If paying more than one invoice, please reference all invoice numbers in wiring instructions.**

PCG:TJA

Tax ID: 59-1270754

Greenberg Traurig, P.A. | Attorneys at Law | 777 South Flagler Drive | Suite 300 East | West Palm Beach, Florida 33401
Tel 561.650.7900 | Fax 561.655.6222 | www.gtlaw.com

Description of Professional Services Rendered:

<u>DATE</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
08/01/22	Samuel Bookhardt	Review and edit direct examination outline of P. Davis in advance of conference call, attend conference call with P. Davis and trial team regarding testimony preparation, prepare amended trial exhibit list for filing, prepare notice of filing, perform legal research on procedure for entering counter deposition designations into evidence.	2.70	1,012.50
08/01/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Comm's with experts re trial preparation.	0.20	75.00
08/01/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Work on Trial Preparation; prep for and attend conf. with H&S expert re testimony at trial.	1.30	487.50
08/01/22	Caran Rothchild	Trial preparation meeting with P. Davis.	0.50	187.50
08/01/22	Jennifer A. Walker	Check both Plaintiff's and Defendant's Trial Exhibits against binders and trial folders; review new Plaintiff's exhibits; work on trial logistics with BDS Couriers re delivery of trial documents to court.	4.30	1,526.50
08/02/22	Samuel Bookhardt	Review portion from deposition video footage of M. Raymond, edit amended witness list and exhibit list for filing, and work on response to Pembroke Pines' request for judicial notice.	3.90	1,462.50
08/02/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Work on pre-trial preparation.	0.70	262.50
08/04/22	Samuel Bookhardt	Call with P. Pines' counsel regarding joint exhibit 1 and exhibit marking.	0.20	75.00
08/04/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Work on trial evidence issues; prep for trial.	1.70	637.50
08/04/22	Caran Rothchild	Update and revise Cross Examination of C. Dodge.	4.40	1,650.00
08/05/22	Samuel Bookhardt	Trial prep - Mark Raymond video testimony excerpts, review deposition transcripts, work to update cross examination outlines.	8.10	3,037.50
08/05/22	Katherine M. Clemente	Trial support for bench trial and assistance with legal issues. Conduct legal research and analysis as to involuntary dismissal motion and waiver of affirmative defenses; review and evaluate answer and affirmative defenses for same.	4.90	1,837.50
08/05/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Comm. from P. Pines counsel; review motion for zoom appearance by Koski; work on witness preparation for trial; review pre-trial motions/filings.	2.90	1,087.50
08/05/22	Caran Rothchild	Review and revise Cross Examination of C. Dodge; Trial preparation of J. Dykstra; Research Re: Enforceability of Release; Research Re: Equitable tolling; Revise and update trial plan.	7.70	2,887.50
08/05/22	Jennifer A. Walker	Work on Trial Preparation.	0.60	213.00
08/05/22	Jennifer A. Walker	Continued work on Trial Preparation.	3.70	1,313.50
08/06/22	Samuel Bookhardt	Trial prep, respond to P. Pines' counsel regarding various items, continue work to revise examination outlines, opening statement.	11.40	4,275.00

Invoice No.: 1000069562
Re: Large User Agreement Litigation
Matter No.: 010307.014600

Page 2

08/06/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Work on trial preparation.	1.70	637.50
08/06/22	Caran Rothchild	Trial Preparation.	8.50	3,187.50
08/06/22	Jennifer A. Walker	Pretrial preparation work.	7.60	2,698.00
08/07/22	Samuel Bookhardt	Trial prep - prep for pre-trial motions, opening statement & corresponding powerpoint	11.80	4,425.00
08/07/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Work on Trial preparation.	1.80	675.00
08/07/22	Caran Rothchild	Trial Preparation.	8.80	3,300.00
08/07/22	Jennifer A. Walker	Pretrial preparation work.	6.20	2,201.00
08/08/22	Samuel Bookhardt	Attend trial (pre-trial motions, opening statements, testimony of D. Stambaugh), and prepare for next day of trial.	15.40	5,775.00
08/08/22	Katherine M. Clemente	Trial support for bench trial.	1.90	712.50
08/08/22	Jose A. Diaz	Upload video deposition of Mark E. Raymond, create deposition clips, and export as a video file with embeded text.	0.80	160.00
08/08/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Work on trial preparation.	1.80	675.00
08/08/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Attend trial; follow up on testimony issues.	6.90	2,587.50
08/08/22	Caran Rothchild	Trial (9:15 a.m. - 5:45 p.m.) (8.8); Trial preparation (1.0)	9.80	3,675.00
08/08/22	Jennifer A. Walker	Trial attendance and work.	14.00	4,970.00
08/09/22	Samuel Bookhardt	Attend trial (testimony of C. Dodge and S. Goren), and prepare for next day of trial.	14.00	5,250.00
08/09/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Work on follow up to PP testimony at Trial; prep for day two of trial.	2.20	825.00
08/09/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Prep for and attend Trail Day 2.	6.90	2,587.50
08/09/22	Caran Rothchild	Attend Trial; Trial preparation.	12.60	4,725.00
08/09/22	Jon L. Swergold	Work on closing argument strategy	0.70	262.50
08/09/22	Jennifer A. Walker	Trial attendance.	9.20	3,266.00
08/10/22	Samuel Bookhardt	Attend trial (continued testimony of S. Goren), and prepare for next day of trial.	16.70	6,262.50
08/10/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Prep for Trial day 3; attend Trial day 3; work on witness cross examination issues for PP experts.	8.20	3,075.00
08/10/22	Caran Rothchild	Attend Trial; Trial Preparation.	10.90	4,087.50
08/10/22	Jennifer A. Walker	Trial attendance.	12.80	4,544.00
08/11/22	Samuel Bookhardt	Attend trial (continued testimony of S. Goren, testimony of I. Weinsten and K. Kwan), and prepare for next day of trial.	14.50	5,437.50
08/11/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Prep for Day 4 of Trial; attend Day 4 of Trial.	7.70	2,887.50
08/11/22	Caran Rothchild	Attend Trial; Trial Preparation.	9.80	3,675.00
08/11/22	Linda Smith	Review and redact information from deposition transcript in connection with trial.	0.50	150.00
08/11/22	Jon L. Swergold	Work on evidentiary issues.	0.40	150.00
08/11/22	Jennifer A. Walker	Trial attendance.	10.00	3,550.00
08/12/22	Samuel Bookhardt	Finish redactions to E. Acosta deposition transcript as requested by the court, and attend trial (Continue Direct examination of K. Kwan - Plaintiff's financial damages).	9.90	3,712.50
08/12/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Prep for Day 5 of Trial; attend Day 5 of Trial.	9.20	3,450.00
08/12/22	Caran Rothchild	Attend Trial.	7.50	2,812.50
08/12/22	Jennifer A. Walker	Trial attendance.	9.70	3,443.50
08/13/22	Caran Rothchild	Review and analyze testimony of Plaintiff's witnesses on direct and update outlines for Defendant's case.	6.70	2,512.50
08/14/22	Samuel Bookhardt	Review book, financing and charges for wastewater systems, for potential cross-examination topics and questions for K. Kwan.	2.90	1,087.50

Invoice No.: 1000069562
Re: Large User Agreement Litigation
Matter No.: 010307.014600

Page 3

08/15/22	Samuel Bookhardt	Begin review of trial testimony.	3.30	1,237.50
08/15/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Work on trial prep and review of issues raised by Pembroke Pines witnesses testimony.	1.80	675.00
08/15/22	Jennifer A. Walker	Work with BDS to get trial boxes from Courthouse.	1.60	568.00
08/16/22	Samuel Bookhardt	Work on update of status of case/trial, and continue reviewing trial testimony.	7.70	2,887.50
08/16/22	Katherine M. Clemente	Work on upcoming trial support needs and appellate issues.	0.40	150.00
08/16/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Work on follow up re PP trial testimony and strategy for COH direct case.	1.90	712.50
08/16/22	Caran Rothchild	Strategize presentation of Defendant's case ; Research re: Admissibility of L. Chong deposition testimony as admission of party opponent; Review depositions for pertinent excerpts for admission.	3.70	1,387.50
08/17/22	Samuel Bookhardt	Continue reviewing trial testimony transcripts, draft outline for written closing argument.	3.80	1,425.00
08/17/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Continue reading Trial transcripts to prepare for closing argument brief.	2.90	1,087.50
08/17/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Call from D. Gonzales re Trial question.	0.10	37.50
08/18/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Work on Trial Closing outline draft; review Transcripts re same; review research for draft.	1.90	712.50
08/19/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Continue review of Trial Transcripts to prep for Closing Argument; work on Aff. Defenses and defenses to Aff. Defenses from Trial testimony.	1.90	712.50
08/19/22	Jennifer A. Walker	Update electronic exhibit folders with Final Admitted Exhibits with proper numbering.	0.60	213.00
08/22/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Review Trial transcripts for Day 4 and 5; work on closing statement draft issues; work on trial motion/witness exclusion issues.	4.70	1,762.50
08/23/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Continue review of Trial transcripts; work on draft of Motion for Involuntary Dismissal for close of PP direct case re Settlement Agreement actions.	5.80	2,175.00
08/24/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Work on draft Motion for Involuntary Dismissal of Settlement Agreement cases.	2.30	862.50
08/24/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Research re Motion for Involuntary Dismissal of True up rate case; research re cross-examination of Kwan re municipal utility rate challenge legal requirements and outside city statutory rate making requirements.	1.90	712.50
08/29/22	Samuel Bookhardt	Perform legal research on various issues for written closing argument, and add case law to outline.	3.90	1,462.50
08/29/22	Katherine M. Clemente	Work on legal issues for bench trial.	1.10	412.50
08/29/22	Phillip C. Gildan	Work on trial prep issues re COH witnesses; comm's with COA team re same.	0.50	187.50
08/30/22	Samuel Bookhardt	Perform legal research on how the statute of limitations applies to installment contracts.	1.20	450.00
08/30/22	Katherine M. Clemente	For trial support and legal issues assistance: evaluate bench trial transcripts; review draft closing argument outline; evaluate summary judgment briefing.	4.80	1,800.00
08/31/22	Samuel Bookhardt	Work on legal issues for written closing argument.	0.60	225.00

Invoice No.: 1000069562
Re: Large User Agreement Litigation
Matter No.: 010307.014600

08/31/22	Katherine M. Clemente	Work on legal issues and trial support needs; continue to review bench trial transcripts; evaluate legal research for written closing argument.	4.70	1,762.50
----------	-----------------------	--	------	----------

<u>Total Time:</u>	402.30
<u>Total Fees:</u>	\$ 149,079.00

Invoice No.: 1000069562
 Re: Large User Agreement Litigation
 Matter No.: 010307.014600

Description of Expenses Billed:

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
04/06/22	VENDOR: Esquire Deposition/Doc Retrieval - ACH INVOICE#: INV2166185 DATE: 4/6/2022 Job ID J8104308 - Transcripts (PEMBROKE PINES V. HOLLYWOOD)	\$ 1,581.65
05/22/22	VENDOR: American Teleconferencing Services - ACH INVOICE#: 3055790500-052222 DATE: 5/22/2022 Conferencing Services Invoice Date 220520 User CNR Client Code 010307 Matter Code 014600	\$ 3.45
05/24/22	Lexis Charges: 05/24/22 SEARCH Requested by BOOKHARDT, SAMUEL Ref: 010307.014600	\$ 19.80
05/30/22	Lexis Charges: 05/30/22 SEARCH Requested by BOOKHARDT, SAMUEL Ref: 010307.014600	\$ 316.80
05/30/22	WestlawNext Research by LENNER,JORDAN.	\$ 258.00
05/31/22	Lexis Charges: 05/31/22 SEARCH Requested by BOOKHARDT, SAMUEL Ref: 010307.014600	\$ 158.40
05/31/22	Lexis Charges: 05/31/22 SEARCH Requested by LENNER, JORDAN Ref: 010307.014600	\$ 158.40
06/01/22	Lexis Charges: 06/01/22 SEARCH Requested by Lenner, Jordan Ref: 010307.014600	\$ 19.80
06/02/22	Lexis Charges: 06/02/22 SEARCH Requested by Lenner, Jordan Ref: 010307.014600	\$ 237.60
06/02/22	WestlawNext Research by LENNER,JORDAN.	\$ 64.50
06/03/22	Lexis Charges: 06/03/22 SEARCH Requested by Bookhardt, Samuel Ref: 010307.014600	\$ 79.20
06/04/22	Lexis Charges: 06/04/22 SEARCH Requested by Bookhardt, Samuel Ref: 010307.014600	\$ 59.40
06/04/22	VENDOR: Esquire Deposition/Doc Retrieval - ACH INVOICE#: INV2164639 DATE: 6/4/2022 job ID J8099839; 3/31/2022 Deposition of Kevin Kwan	\$ 668.30
06/06/22	Lexis Charges: 06/06/22 SEARCH Requested by Bookhardt, Samuel Ref: 010307.014600	\$ 19.80
07/30/22	WestlawNext Research by BOOKHARDT,SAMUEL.	\$ 111.30
07/31/22	WestlawNext Research by BOOKHARDT,SAMUEL.	\$ 129.00
08/02/22	VENDOR: Class Action Court Reporters - ACH INVOICE#: 4239 DATE: 8/2/2022 VIDEO SERVICES: Pembroke Pines v. Hollywood - 7/28/22 video recorded deposition of Mark Raymond	\$ 485.00
08/02/22	VENDOR: Class Action Court Reporters - ACH INVOICE#: 4238 DATE: 8/2/2022 Pembroke Pines v. Hollywood - 7/28/22 video recorded deposition of Mark Raymond	\$ 696.75
08/03/22	VENDOR: TruVid LLC INVOICE#: 014139B DATE: 8/3/2022 Fee for deposition transcript of Mark Raymond	\$ 150.00
08/11/22	VENDOR: Walker, Jennifer A. INVOICE#: 5348781608241309 DATE: 8/24/2022 Parking; 08/11/22 - Parking on August 11, 2022 for J. Walker.	\$ 20.00

Invoice No.: 1000069562
Re: Large User Agreement Litigation
Matter No.: 010307.014600

08/15/22	VENDOR: Walker, Jennifer A. INVOICE#: 5348781608241309 DATE: 8/24/2022 Lunch; 08/15/22 - Lunch on August 12, 2022 for J. Walker and C. Rothchild.; Merchant: Atlantic Coast Cafe ; Attendees: Jennifer A. Walker	\$	16.47
08/15/22	VENDOR: Walker, Jennifer A. INVOICE#: 5348781608241309 DATE: 8/24/2022 Lunch; 08/15/22 - Lunch on August 10, 2022 for J. Walker and C. Rothchild.; Merchant: Atlantic Coast Cafe ; Attendees: Jennifer A. Walker	\$	17.40
		Total Expenses:	<hr/> \$ 5,271.02