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City of Hollywood

Procurement Services

Otis Thomas, Interim Director/Chief Procurement Officer
2600 Hollywood Boulevard, Hollywood, FL 33020

EVALUATION TABULATION
IFB No. IFB-290-25-SA

Vehicle Repair Services
RESPONSE DEADLINE: March 26, 2025 at 2:00 pm
Report Generated: Tuesday, August 5, 2025

SELECTED VENDOR TOTALS
Vendor Total ‘
[ELM LLC $900.00
GRIECO FORD FT $1,041.00
LAUDERDALE
sawgrass Ford Collision $1,200.00
Center
California Custom Sport $1,395.00
Trucks
3 BUDDIES PAINT & BODY $1,659.00
d.b.a HOLLYWOOD
COLLISION CENTER
Gary's auto body west inc $1,829.00
Mobile Techs LLC $2,023.00
NATIONAL COLLISION AND $2,024.00
TRUCK CENTER
Platinum Collision Inc $2,034.00

1. LIGHT DUTY VEHICLES (UP TO 10,000 LBS)



EVALUATION TABULATION
IFB No. IFB-290-25-SA
Vehicle Repair Services

1. LIGHT DUTY VEHICLES (UP TO 10,000 lbs) 3 BUDDIES California Gary's auto GRIECO IELMLLC  Mobile Techs  NATIONAL Platinum sawgrass
PAINT &  Custom Sport | body westinc ~ FORD FT LLC COLLISION  Collision Inc | Ford Collision
BODY d.b.a Trucks LAUDERDALE AND TRUCK
HOLLYWOOD CENTER
COLLISION
CENTER
Selected Line ltem Description Unit of Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Measure
X 1 Painting hour $60.00 No Bid $48.00 No Bid No Bid $55.00 $55.00 $60.00 No Bid
X 2 Painting hour $38.00 No Bid $38.00 No Bid No Bid $25.00 $52.00 $38.00 No Bid
Materials
X 3 Body hour $60.00 No Bid $48.00 No Bid No Bid $55.00 $65.00 $60.00 No Bid
X 4 Frame hour $65.00 No Bid $65.00 No Bid No Bid $55.00 $55.00 $70.00 No Bid
X 5 Mechanical hour $110.00 $155.00 $100.00 $109.00 $150.00 $95.00 $69.00 $150.00 $200.00
X 6 Electrical hour $110.00 $155.00 $100.00 $109.00 $150.00 $95.00 $55.00 $150.00 $200.00
X 7 Suspension hour $110.00 $155.00 $100.00 $109.00 $150.00 $95.00 $55.00 $150.00 $200.00
Total $553.00 $465.00 $499.00 $327.00 $450.00 $475.00 $406.00 $678.00 $600.00

2. MEDIUM DUTY VEHICLES (10,001 LBS TO 26,000 LBS)
2. MEDIUM DUTY VEHICLES (10,001 Ibs to 26,000 Ibs) 3 BUDDIES
PAINT &
BODY d.b.a
HOLLYWOOD
COLLISION
CENTER

GRIECO
FORD FT
LAUDERDALE

California Gary's auto
Custom Sport | body west inc
Trucks

Unit of
Measure

Selected Line Item Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

Description

Painting hour $60.00 No Bid $50.00 No Bid

IELM LLC

Unit Cost

No Bid

Mobile Techs  NATIONAL
LLC COLLISION
AND TRUCK

CENTER

Unit Cost Unit Cost

$85.00 $89.00

Platinum
Collision Inc

Unit Cost

$60.00

sawgrass
Ford Collision
Center

Unit Cost

No Bid
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EVALUATION TABULATION
IFB No. IFB-290-25-SA
Vehicle Repair Services

2. MEDIUM DUTY VEHICLES (10,001 Ibs to 26,000 Ibs) 3 BUDDIES California Gary's auto GRIECO IELMLLC  Mobile Techs  NATIONAL Platinum sawgrass
PAINT &  Custom Sport | body westinc ~ FORD FT LLC COLLISION  Collision Inc | Ford Collision
BODY d.b.a Trucks LAUDERDALE AND TRUCK
HOLLYWOOD CENTER
COLLISION
CENTER
Selected Line ltem Description Unit of Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Measure
X 2 Painting hour $38.00 No Bid $40.00 No Bid No Bid $25.00 $55.00 $38.00 No Bid
Materials
X 3 Body hour $60.00 No Bid $50.00 No Bid No Bid $83.00 $89.00 $60.00 No Bid
X 4 Frame hour $65.00 No Bid $75.00 No Bid No Bid $85.00 $109.00 $70.00 No Bid
X 5 Mechanical hour $110.00 $155.00 $125.00 $109.00 $150.00 $125.00 $149.00 $150.00 $200.00
X 6 Electrical hour $110.00 $155.00 $125.00 $109.00 $150.00 $125.00 $109.00 $150.00 $200.00
X 7 Suspension hour $110.00 $155.00 $125.00 $109.00 $150.00 $125.00 $109.00 $150.00 $200.00
Total $553.00 $465.00 $590.00 $327.00 $450.00 $653.00 $709.00 $678.00 $600.00

3. HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES (26,001 LBS AND OVER)

2. HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES (26,001 Ibs and over) 3 BUDDIES California Gary's auto GRIECO IELMLLC  Mobile Techs  NATIONAL Platinum sawgrass
PAINT &  Custom Sport | body westinc ~ FORD FT LLC COLLISION  Collision Inc | Ford Collision
BODY d.b.a Trucks LAUDERDALE AND TRUCK Center
HOLLYWQOOD CENTER
COLLISION
CENTER
Selected Line Item Description Unit of Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Measure
X 1 Painting hour $60.00 No Bid $70.00 No Bid No Bid $105.00 $129.00 $60.00 No Bid
X 2 Painting hour $38.00 No Bid $50.00 No Bid No Bid $25.00 $55.00 $38.00 No Bid
Materials
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EVALUATION TABULATION
IFB No. IFB-290-25-SA
Vehicle Repair Services

3. HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES (26,001 Ibs and over) 3 BUDDIES California Gary's auto GRIECO IELMLLC  Mobile Techs  NATIONAL Platinum sawgrass
PAINT &  Custom Sport | body westinc ~ FORD FT LLC COLLISION  Collision Inc | Ford Collision
BODY d.b.a Trucks LAUDERDALE AND TRUCK
HOLLYWOOD CENTER
COLLISION
CENTER
Selected Line ltem Description Unit of Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Measure
X 3 Body hour $60.00 No Bid $70.00 No Bid No Bid $105.00 $129.00 $60.00 No Bid
X 4 Frame hour $65.00 No Bid $100.00 No Bid No Bid $105.00 $149.00 $70.00 No Bid
X 5 Mechanical hour $110.00 $155.00 $150.00 $129.00 No Bid $185.00 $149.00 $150.00 No Bid
X 6 Electrical hour $110.00 $155.00 $150.00 $129.00 No Bid $185.00 $149.00 $150.00 No Bid
X 7 Suspension hour $110.00 $155.00 $150.00 $129.00 No Bid $185.00 $149.00 $150.00 No Bid
Total $553.00 $465.00 $740.00 $387.00 No Bid $895.00 $909.00 $678.00 No Bid
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