DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)

) ®
ACORD CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE SR

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER SOMIACT - Nikki Sciacca
Synergy Insurance Group, Inc PHONE ety (954) 742-7244 TAie. Noj. (954) 791-8019
1000 Sawgrass Corporate Parkway #450 ML <. nsciacca@synergyins.net
INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
Sunrise FL 33323 INSURER A : Heritage Property & Casualty Insurance Company
INSURED INSURER B : Infinity Auto Insurance Company
Cedenos Comfort Cooling LLC INSURER C :
2041 SW 70th Ave D14 INSURER D : Technology Insurance Company
INSURER E :
Davie FL 33317 INSURER F :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

INSR ADDL|SUBR POLICY EFF_| POLICY EXP
LTR TYPE OF INSURANCE INSD | WVD POLICY NUMBER (MM/DD/YYYY) | (MM/DDIYYYY) LIMITS
X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE ¢ 1,000,000
DAMAGE TO RENTED
CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR PREMISES (Ea occurrence) $ 300,000
L MED EXP (Any one person) $ 10,000
A Y HCR009914 07/03/2024 | 07/03/2025 | PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | $ 1,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $ 2,000,000
X | roLicy |:| FES: |:| Loc PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | $ 2,000,000
OTHER: $
COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY e $ 300,000
ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY (Per person) | $
B OWNED iy | X SCHEDuLED Y 509800035758001 09/16/2023 | 09/16/2024 | BODILY INJURY (Per accident) | $
X | HIRED - NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE $
AUTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY (Per accident)
$
UMBRELLA LIAB OCCUR EACH OCCURRENCE $
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $
DED ‘ ‘ RETENTION $ $
WORKERS COMPENSATION PER OTH-
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY YIN X ‘ STATUTE ‘ ER
ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE E.L. EACH ACCIDENT $ 500,000
C | OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? N/A TWC4312706 10/11/2023 | 10/11/2024
(Mandatory in NH) E.L. DISEASE - EAEMPLOYEE $ 500,000
If yes, describe under
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | $ 500,000

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)
Certificate Holder is listed as an additional insured for the general liability and auto liability policies.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN

. ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.
City of Hollywood

2600 Hollywood Blvd AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

Attn: Public Utilities ~ )
Hollywood FL 33020 _/’//f J
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Luis Montoya

From: Certificate of Insurance

Sent: Friday, June 21, 2024 12:19 PM

To: Luis Montoya; Certificate of Insurance

Subject: FW: [EXT]Cedenos Comfort Cooling COI - BPA PA600094
Attachments: City of Hollywood 6.19.24.pdf

Acceptable

For future reference:
1) City of Hollywood must be the certificate holder per the following format:
City of Hollywood (nothing else on this line)
Department Address & Room # (if applicable)
Department Address

From: Luis Montoya <LMONTOYA@hollywoodfl.org>

Sent: Thursday, June 20, 2024 3:31 PM

To: Certificate of Insurance <COl@hollywoodfl.org>

Cc: Jorge Marin <JOMARIN@hollywoodfl.org>; Shanene Wright <SRWRIGHT@hollywoodfl.org>; Homero Rodriguez
<HRODRIGUEZ@hollywoodfl.org>; Jean Joinville <JJOINVILLE@hollywoodfl.org>

Subject: RE: [EXT]Cedenos Comfort Cooling COI - BPA PA600094

The vendor provided an updated COI for the General Liability insurance line item due for renewal.

Please review.

Thank you,
Luis Montoya
Public Utilities Manager — Water Treatment Plant

Hllywood

PUBLIZ UTILITIES
City of Hollywood
Department of Public Utilities
3441 Hollywood Blvd.
Hollywood, Florida 33021
Phone: 954-967-4230 Ext. 5405
Cell: 954.383.0406
Imontoya@hollywoodfl.org
Notice: Florida has a broad public records law. All correspondence sent to the City of Hollywood via e-mail may be
subject to disclosure as a matter of public record

From: Certificate of Insurance <COl@hollywoodfl.org>

Sent: Thursday, June 20, 2024 2:04 PM

To: Luis Montoya <LMONTOYA®@hollywoodfl.org>; Certificate of Insurance <COl@hollywoodfl.org>

Cc: Jorge Marin <JOMARIN@hollywoodfl.org>; Shanene Wright <SRWRIGHT@hollywoodfl.org>; Homero Rodriguez

1




<HRODRIGUEZ@hollywoodfl.org>; Jean Joinville <JJIOINVILLE@hollywoodfl.org>
Subject: FW: [EXT]Cedenos Comfort Cooling COI - BPA PA600094

Acceptable

From: Luis Montoya <LMONTOYA@hollywoodfl.org>

Sent: Thursday, June 20, 2024 6:43 AM

To: Certificate of Insurance <COl@hollywoodfl.org>

Cc: Jorge Marin <JOMARIN@hollywoodfl.org>; Shanene Wright <SRWRIGHT@hollywoodfl.org>; Homero Rodriguez
<HRODRIGUEZ@hollywoodfl.org>; Jean Joinville <JJIOINVILLE@hollywoodfl.org>

Subject: FW: [EXT]Cedenos Comfort Cooling COI - BPA PA600094

For your review is the COIl for Cedenos Comfort & Cooling.
They provide HVAC services for all of the Public Utilities locations.

Thank you,
Luis Montoya
Public Utilities Manager — Water Treatment Plant

.1| CITY O
Hdlywa
w7 y PUBLIC UTILITIES
City of Hollywood

Department of Public Utilities

3441 Hollywood Blvd.

Hollywood, Florida 33021

Phone: 954-967-4230 Ext. 5405

Cell: 954.383.0406

Imontoya@hollywoodfl.org

Notice: Florida has a broad public records law. All correspondence sent to the City of Hollywood via e-mail may be
subject to disclosure as a matter of public record

From: Carlos De Gannes <carlos@cedenoscomfortcooling.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 19, 2024 5:28 PM

To: Kassandra Myers <KMYERS@hollywoodfl.org>

Cc: Luis Montoya <LMONTOYA@hollywoodfl.org>; Homero Rodriguez <HRODRIGUEZ@hollywoodfl.org>
Subject: [EXT]Cedenos Comfort Cooling COI - BPA PA600094

Kassandra,

As requested, attached is a copy of our updated COlI reflecting the updated General Liability Insurance for C-23-
378: BPA PA600094 (HVAC Equipment Preventative Maintenance and Repair Services
If you have any questions or need additional information, please feel free to communicate accordingly.

Respectfully

Carlos De Gannes

Oflice Manager

Cedenos Comfort Cooling

P: 954-473-2722

F: 954-473-2724

Email: Carlos@cedenoscomfortcooling.com






