| ®
ACORD DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)
— CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE 309

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must be endorsed. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the
certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER CONTACT Andrea Kim
’gﬁgEE 212.293-6203 FAX
EPIC Insurance Brokers & Consultants A o B (AIC. No): 212.488.0220
1140 Avenue of the Americas — 8" Floor ADUREsg,  ndreaim@epicbiokers.com
New York, NY 10036 INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
INSURER A: IRONSHORE SPECIALTY INSURANCE COMPANY 25445
INSURED INSURER B: HARTFORD FIRE INSURANCE COMPANY 19682
Polydyne Inc. INSURER C: HARTFORD ACCIDENT AND INDEMNITY COMPANY 22357
One Chemical Plant Road
PO Box 250 INSURER D:
Riceboro GA 31323 INSURER E:
INSURER F:
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

ADDL | SUBR
e TYPE OFINSURANCE INSD | W\D POLICY NUMBER MRS | i en LIMITS
A | X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY Y IEPICB5ZFB005 12/31/2024 | 12/31/2025 | gacH OCCURRENCE $1,000,000
DAMAGE TO RENTED
CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR PREMISES (Ea occurrence) $500*000
MED EXP (Any one person) $25,OOO
PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | $1,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $2,000,000
X | pouicy PRO: D Loc PRODUCTS - cOMP/OP AGG | $2,000,000
OTHER: $
B | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY Y 10ABR30602 12/31/2024 | 12/31/2025 | GOMBINED SINGLE LIMIT $1,000,000
X ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY (Per person) $
dere [ s soou o o
ON-O
X | HRED AUTOS | X QU"F‘OSWNED (Per accident) $
$
A UMBRELLA LIAB X | occur IEELCASB5ZFDO005 12/31/2024 | 12/31/2025 | cacH OCCURRENCE $5,000,000
X | EXCESSLIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $5,000,000
DED ‘ ‘ RETENTIONS $
C |WORKERS COMPENSATION 10WNR30600 12/31/2024 | 12/31/2025 | X | BER orH-
ANDEMPLOYERS' LIABILITY YIN
ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE I:I NA E.L. EACH ACCIDENT $1,000,000
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED?
(Mandatory in NH) E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE| $1,000,000
If yes, describe under $1,000,000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT ,000,

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS/LOCATIONS/VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

Thee City of Hollywood is included as an Additional Insured where required by written contract with respects to liability arising out of the Named Insured operations as
per terms and conditions of the policies.

RE: IFB-048-23-JJ Dry Polymer

30 DAY CANCELLATION CLAUSE INCLUDED

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION
SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
City of Hollywood THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
2600 Hollywood Blvd. ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

Hollywood, FL 33020

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE 1

© 1988-2014 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.
ACORD 25 (2014/01) The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD



mailto:andrea.kim@epicbrokers.com

From: Steven Urich

To: Daniela Behm
Cc: Kassandra Myers
Subject: FW: [EXT]City of Hollywood Updated COI
Date: Wednesday, January 8, 2025 2:59:59 PM
Attachments: image002.png

image003.png

City of Hollywood.pdf

Good afternoon,

| placed a copy of this approved COI in the Polydyne folder.

Steve

Steve Urich
Public Utilities Manager, Wastewater Treatment Plant
Phone: 954-921-3288 Ext: 5554

Hedlywood

From: Certificate of Insurance <COl@hollywoodfl.org>
Sent: Wednesday, January 8, 2025 1:43 PM

To: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>

Cc: Certificate of Insurance <COl@hollywoodfl.org>
Subject: FW: [EXT]City of Hollywood Updated COI

Acceptable.

From: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFl.org>
Sent: Tuesday, January 7, 2025 4:18 PM

To: Certificate of Insurance <COl@hollywoodfl.org>
Subject: FW: [EXT]City of Hollywood Updated COI

Steve Urich
Public Utilities Manager, Wastewater Treatment Plant
Phone: 954-921-3288 Ext: 5554

Hllywood


mailto:surich@HollywoodFL.org
mailto:DBEHM@hollywoodfl.org
mailto:KMYERS@hollywoodfl.org
mailto:surich@HollywoodFL.org
mailto:COI@hollywoodfl.org
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From: Peggy Locke <plocke@polydyneinc.com>

Sent: Tuesday, January 7, 2025 4:12 PM

To: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>; Christopher Cherp <ccher olydyneinc.com>
Cc: US-RIC-Polydyne Bid Dept. <bids@polydyneinc.com>

Subject: RE: [EXT]City of Hollywood Updated COI

You don't often get email from plocke@polydyneinc.com. Learn why this is important
Hi Steven,

Please find the updated COI attached.
Have a great afternoon!
Best Regards,

Peggy Locke
Sr. Administrative Specialist

SNF

WATER SCIENCE

Polydyne Inc.

1 Chemical Plant Road
Riceboro, GA 31323
Direct: 912.880.2401
Fax: 912.880.2078

plocke@polydyneinc.com

polydyneinc.com
Follow us on LinkedlIn

From: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFl.org>

Sent: Tuesday, January 7, 2025 1:00 PM

To: Christopher Cherp <ccher olydyneinc.com>

Cc: US-RIC-Polydyne Bid Dept. <bids@polydyneinc.com>
Subject: RE: [EXT]City of Hollywood Updated COI

Excellent, thank you

Steve Urich
Public Utilities Manager, Wastewater Treatment Plant
Phone: 954-921-3288 Ext: 5554


mailto:plocke@polydyneinc.com
https://aka.ms/LearnAboutSenderIdentification
mailto:plocke@polydyneinc.com
mailto:surich@HollywoodFL.org
mailto:ccherp@polydyneinc.com
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https://gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fus.snf.com%2Fmarkets%2Fmunicipal%2F%3Fnowprocket%3D1&data=05%7C02%7CDBEHM%40hollywoodfl.org%7C9a538793ffae4d3d4de808dd301f05ba%7Cf0ba70bfc34c416db2009c6f6a563c05%7C0%7C0%7C638719631990501917%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=4DQJkOTXTnKqGJ4NrhjXNxhNwOcoPDXqmPyNtKDYIXg%3D&reserved=0
https://gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.linkedin.com%2Fcompany%2Fpolydyne%2F&data=05%7C02%7CDBEHM%40hollywoodfl.org%7C9a538793ffae4d3d4de808dd301f05ba%7Cf0ba70bfc34c416db2009c6f6a563c05%7C0%7C0%7C638719631990526531%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=ELnu8vHq%2BSNp48lQS7ll0qVgMeuG8ikYYVS0AEjM19w%3D&reserved=0
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H&llywood

From: Christopher Cherp <ccher olydyneinc.com>
Sent: Tuesday, January 7, 2025 12:50 PM

To: Steven Urich <surich@HollywoodFL.org>

Cc: US-RIC-Polydyne Bid Dept. <bids@polydyneinc.com>
Subject: [EXT]City of Hollywood Updated COI

Hey Steven,
We'll get you that COI sent over soon.

Take care,
Chris Cherp
Sr. Technical Sales Representative

(2]

Polydyne Inc.
1 Chemical Plant Road

Riceboro, Georgia 31323
Mobile: 941.961.3998

CCherp@snf.com
CCher olydyneinc.com

polydyne.snf.com

On Jan 7, 2025, at 11:28 AM, Steven Urich <surich@hollywoodfl.org> wrote:

Good afternoon Chris,

Can you please send an updated COlI for our records. If you are no able to
provide this, can you please forward this request to the appropriate department
or provide the contact information if the request needs to be made directly.


mailto:ccherp@polydyneinc.com
mailto:surich@HollywoodFL.org
mailto:bids@polydyneinc.com
mailto:CCherp@snf.com
mailto:CCherp@polydyneinc.com
file:///var/tmp/com.apple.email.maild/EMContentRepresentation/com.apple.mobilemail/481E7E64-BF53-4CD3-9263-5C7C18EE3810/polydyne.snf.com
mailto:surich@hollywoodfl.org

Thank you very much,

Steve Urich

Steve Urich
Public Utilities Manager, Wastewater Treatment Plant
Phone: 954-921-3288 Ext: 5554

Steven Urich

Public Utilities Manager-Wastewater Treatment Plant
City of Hollywood

Public Utilities

P.O. Box 229045
Hollywood, FL 33022-9045
Office:

E-mail: surich@HollywoodFL.org

Notice: Florida has a broad public records law. All correspondence sent to the City of Hollywood via
e-mail may be subject to disclosure as a matter of public record.

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.
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